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Branford^s News 

English Paper 
Asks Soldiers 
To Visit Town 

Cbro'niolo And Echo Of England 
Sends Wdeowo And Friendly 
Qroetings, 

The! rollowlng letter was re­
ceived here a-few days ago Trom a 
Nprtliamptdn,;England, newspaper 

In your Issue of September 28 
last, copy of Which reached here 
some days ago, It wis particularly 
interesting to read the Editorial 
"Hands,Across the Sea." Your ana­
lysis of our own paper was fair and 
factual, and above all friendly. Wo 
have made so many American 
friends around here, during the last 
two and a half'years that we can't 
help putting' the emphasis on 
friendship. You can't have the boys 
around the place for all that time 
without getting very close to each 
other. . . >• , 

The point Is that jour friendli­
ness Is reciprocated all the way by 
myself and the staff of this news-
popM. Thursday of last weelc we 
had; a six-page Issue—that only 
cotoes, by newsprint rationing, once 
in tjyb or three weeks, for we arc 
still, on quarter of pre-war con­
sumption—and that gave the 
chanei, to repay your compliment. 
• No'ŝ t I hope • another Branford 

soldier will look in or join one of 
our 'trips, so as to give me the 
chance of writing you again. 

Wth sincere good wishes, 
, Yours faithfully, 
\ Wi Cowper Barrens, 

Managing Editor 

Fred'k O'Reilly 
Funeral Rites 
Held Yesterday 

After an illness of several weeks 
J^-edprlck J. O'Reilly of Clark Ave- j 
nue, Short ^coeh, passed away late 
Saturday night in New Haven Hos­
pital,, • J (J,.,. • 

He was the husband of Clara E. 
O'Reilly and father of Mrs. Wil­
liam Weber[ of Short Beach and 
of Frederick J. O'Reilly, Jr., of Cal­
ifornia. Three grandbhildren also 
survive. 

Funeral services were conducted 
yesterday morning ; with private 
service at ' the. Frank M. Belsler 
parlors andArequteih high niass at 
St. ylncerit de Paul's church, In­
terment was In St; Lawrence Cem­
etery, • • 'i ••• 

Mass was said by Kev. Joseph 
Buckley. Miss: Mary Devlin was or­
ganist and WUllam Riley of New 
Haven sang ','Jesus Come Home." 

Bearers were fellow-directors of 
the Branford: Federal Savings and 
Loiin' Association: Reginald S; 
Baldwin; Frederick Houdc, Charles 
Baldwin, Frank Kinney, Joseph 
DriscoU and Merrltt Huglns, 

Mr.iO'ReiUy had lived here 28 
years where he was a property 
owner and for some years opera­
ted & grocery-store at Main and 
Bristol' Street/ He was born in 
Providence, iv;; 

His association over a long period 
of years with the Southern Cot­
tonseed Oil Co.i took him and his 
family to all'parts'of the United 
States in the capacity of the coun­
try's general majiager of the Wes­
son Oil and sriowdrlft Corporatloij 
division. He Wtlred in 1935. • 

Harbor Pupils 
Give Program 

On Friday, December 22 the Min­
ute Man Flag was awarded to the 
boys and girls of Harbor Street 
School by Postmaster Joseph Dtls 
coll. The flag was accepted by 
Robert GlImartln.'The Minute Man 
Flag Isi awarded only to' those 
schools achieving 00 • perdent or 
more in the purchase of War 
Stamps. 

The children entertained a large 
audience of parents and friends 
with several skits and songs. The 
main skit presented was Mr. Jones 
Learns A Lesson. The characters 
taking part were: Mr. Jones, Wil­
liam General; Uncle Sam, Joseph 
Driscoll, Jr.; Bond Canvasser, Bar­
bara Jones; Store Keeper, Richard 
Stanton. 

A booth used In the skit was built 
by Jerome Hayward, assisted by 
Blake Lohr, John Dendas, and 
Frederick Knowlton. 

A patriotic cartoon, which acted 
OS a backcjrop was drawn on the 
board by Lewis Bracken. The chor­
us Included Frank Atwater, -Carol 
Smith, Clement Bodner, Russell 
Gordon, Margaret' Jones Nancy 
Armstrong, Jane Carlson,' Peggy 
Dcrtzo, Jack Arrlngton, Paul Anls-
kovich, Charles - Wright, Jerome 
Hayward, Joseph Brlggs, Robert 
Gill, Barbara Lcpak, John Dendas, 
Rosalie Washington Betty Gordon 
and Audrey Arrlngton. 

Grades 1 and 2 presented London 
Bridge. Those taking part were: 
Elizabeth Wright, Geraldlne Parley 
John Flnnegan, Edward Esborn, 
Sarah Moore, Betsey Lendroth, and 
Dorothy Nygardv 

The song Old dray Bonnet was 
sung and danced to with patriotic 
words by the following group: Ann 
Cudgma, Joan Hallden, Jacqueline 
Alblnger, Janet Eastwood, Dana 
Armstrong, Eugenia ZolTIno, Helen 
Bent, and Joyce Carlson. . Lewis 
Close announced the program. 

ELIZABETH GALLAUDET 
DIES IN CALIFORNIA 

Mrs, Elizabeth Young Gallaudet, 
widow of the late Rev. Herbert D. 
Gallaudet of Pine Orchard, died 
New Year's Day In Los Angeles, 
Cal., where she was visiting with 
her daughter, Mrs. Richard Fablon, 
over the holidays. 

She was the daughter of Alden 
M. and Ellen Shepardson Young. 
In addition to her daughter she is 
survived by two sisters, Mrs. Mil­
ton J. Warner and Mrs. George M. 
Smith, Mrs. Gallaudet was also the 
sister of the late Mrs, John Goss 
of Waterbu^y and Pine Orchard. 

FORniKR RESIDENT DIES 

News has been received froni 
Watcrtown, Conn., of the death, 
December 26 of Mrs. Edwin P. 
Mitchell. " '" 

Mi's., Mitchell I was bofh in Bris­
tol the daughter- of James and 
ffrancos Botsford, but spent a great 
many summers In „the Indian Neck 
vicinity. I ' • ' " ' •••• 

She Is survived by her husband, 
a.daughter. Miss Maud I. Mitchell, 
and two sisters. 

The Rev. B. ^Kepneth Anthony 
officiated at the funeral which was 
held Thursday. 

Youth's Friend 
Rotary Speaker 
Carl L. Millward Is Superintend 

of Schools In Milton, Pa., and an 
Instructor fti the Bucknell Univer­
sity School of Education, will be 
speaker here Monday at the \yeek-
ly meeting of the Branford Rotary 
Club. He was born In Mt. Pleasant, 
Pa., was graduated from Bucknell 
University, and attended Columbia 
University, 

Cirl L. Millw.iril 
Mr. Millward l,s Preaidcnt of the 

Su.squehanna Valley Area oC Boy 
Scouts or America, a Director of 
the Milton Y.M.C.A., a Trustee of 
Dovlt's Tuberculosis Sanitarium in 
Allenwood, Ja,, and a member of 
his local Selective Service Board, 
For his work with youtli, he has 
been given the Silver Beaver Award 
by the Boy Scouts of America. 

He is a, member and Post Presi­
dent or the Rotary Club of Milton, 
and has served Rotary Interna­
tional as District Governor and 
committee member. For 1944-45, he 
Is a member of the Youth Comlt-
tee of Rotary International. 

His subject win be "Every Rotar-
lan a Friend of Youth." 

Miss Leahy Dies 
After Illness 

JOHN KERE EITES HELD 

Funeral services for John Kerr, 
84, of Ivy Street, were held from 
the funeral home of Norman V. 
Lamb Tuesday afternoon, in ter­
ment was In the Center Cemetery. 
Masonic services were conducted 
by the Widow's Son Lodge on Mon­
day evening. 

Mr. Kerr, a life long resident of 
this town, died last Saturday In his 
home. Although retired for some 
years by the Malleable Iron Fitt­
ings ompany, Mr. Kerr Is remem­
bered for Ws long years of service 
at that firm. 

Eepresontatives At Opening ' 

WATOH-US GROW 

As of July 1, 1945 Branford's 
population Is estimated at 8511 by 
the Connecticut State Department 
of Health. 

Hep. Irving C. Jacocks and Rep. 
Roymond Barnes were present yes­
terday at the opening or the 1045 
General Assembly to hear Gov. 
Raymond E. Baldwin's inaugural 
address and attend a public recep­
tion for recently elected state offi­
cers. 

A simple reception, due to war 
tlnie considerations, replaced ela­
borate inaugural balls. 

OUEST PEEAOHER 

Rev. Jaroes F. English of Hart­
ford, secretary of the state mis­
sionary societies will preach Sun­
day morning at 11 o'clock at the 
Church of Christ, In the evening 
he win meet with Pilgrim Fellow­
ship. 

TOWN AUDIT COMPLETE 

Tlie T. M. Byxbee Co. have 
placed on record In the town hall 
the result df their audit for the 
fiscal year 1B43-44 which is avall-
ablp for public Inspection. 

Miss Julia jLeahy, daughter of the 
late John and Margaret 'Readon 
Leahy, died after a short Illness at 
her home at 7» Ivy Street, Sunday 
morning. 

She Is survived by her two sisters 
Mrs. Margaret Bohn and Miss Mary 
Leahy and one brother, Timothy 
Leahy, all of Brantord. Funeral 
services*were held from her late 
home, Wednesday morning at 8:30. 
A requiem higli^ mass for the re­
pose or her soul was celebrated at 
9 o'clock ,at St, Mary's Church. In­
terment was In St. Agnes Cemetery. 

Kev. P. Edward J. Demenske was 
the' celebrant of the mass. The 
Rev. P. Joseph Buckley and the 
Rev. Fr. William Meyers, both of 
St. Vincent dePaul's Church of East 
Haven, assisted as deacon and sub-
deacon. Rev. Fr. John, McCarthy, 
pastor of St, Augustine's church 
of North Branford, was In the sane 
tuary. 

James A. Cosgrove, soloist, sang 
"Mother of Christ", and Mrs. J. J. 
Collins was at the ; organ. Inter 
raent was in St. Agnes cemetery 
where Fr. Demenske read the com­
mittal services, ' -

Bearers were John • Alblnger or 
West Haven, John Sliney, WiUlaan 
Regan, Richard O'Brien, Thomas 
Matthews and Oscar Boldtmann, 

Sale Of Seals 
Draws To End 

Branford residents who have not 
as yet acknowledged receipt of the 
1944 Christmas Seals by sending 
In money to the Branlord Visiting 
Nurse As.sociatlon, are reminded 
that the nurses' work for tubercu­
lar patients depends largely upon 
the sale of these Seals. Mrs. 
Charles Oaylord, chairman of the 
Seal Sale committee, wishes to 
thank those who -have already re-
.s'pondcd, thus showing their Inter­
est In the control of tuberculosis In 
Branrord and In the nation. 

Available figures already show an 
expected rise In the number of new 
cases of the disease, due to the war 
conditions. All health agencies are 
Ijrcparing to meet the special needs 
created by wartime longer hours 
or work. Inadequate diet, crowded 
housing, relaxation of child labor 
law.s and protective laws for wom­
en in Industry, as well as mental 
•strain, worry and greater responsi­
bilities. . , 

The local health association 
plans to do Its share in caring for 
Branford residents known to have 
TB, and to help discover unknown 
cases which are estimated at twice 
those known in number. 

A large' portion or the Christ­
mas Seal fund will be used to make 
people realize that TB is preventa­
ble and curable If discovered 4n 
early stages. Tuberculin tests, chest 
X-rays and an added milk supply 
arc some of the' ammunition used 
In the light against the disease. 
The Christmas Seal fund pays the 
bills. 

Public Invifed 
To Red Cross 
Annual Meeting 

The public is cordially Invited to 
attend the annual meeting or the 
annual meeting of the Branford 
Branch of the fted Cross on Mon­
day afternoon next, January the 
8 at 3 o'clock. At that time an In­
teresting Red Gross film will be 
shown, short reports of all activi­
ties will be given, and the election 
or ofTloers will take place. Every 
activity should. be of marked In­
terest to those jwho donate to the 
annual War Fund, and also the re­
port of the use of those funds. 

There is an erroneous Idea that 
this meeting Is • for officers and 
chairmen of the Branch only, but 
all are welcome to come. 

Roll Your Own 
Machines Come 

Out Of Hiding 
Increased smoking among wo­

men, black market operations, and 
hoarding were given this week by 
local merchants as the reasons, in 
their opinions, for the cigarette 
shortage here. 

Many merchants have had inter­
esting experiences during the past 
week as men and women open the 
door, see the "No Cigarettes" sign 
'and leave the store on their way 
to the next merchant. In one store, 
persons were calling by telephone 
to save their shoe leather. 

Some shops add the word "hon­
est" after the sign, "No cigarettes". 

One dealer reported that women 
are greater otfenflers than men as 
rar as hoarding is concerned. Al­
though men do not have the time 
to travel from one store to another 
In quest of the cigarettes, the wo­
men make it part of their shop­
ping trips. 

Tobacco sales and calls for pipes 
have Increased especially , among 
women. Some women have been 
seen smoking pipes In public and 
more attraclve, feminine type pipes 
have appeared on the market. 

RoU-your-own machines have 
been dug up out of the depression 
era. 

Although the situation grew 
more critical here this week, mer­
chants were of the opinion that 
the outlook will be much brighter 
In the near future. 

Garden PictiU'es Published. 

Members or the Branford oord-
en Club will be pleased to know 
that two colored pictures of Mrs. 
Frederick C. H. Carder's garden 
appeared In the JanuarJ-, Issue of 
the House and Garden magazine. 
Mrs, Carter Is, known as an author­
ity on horticulture and Is an hon­
orary member bt the local organi­
zation. 

SPEAKS IN 'BOSTON 

Mrs. S. A. Griswold will speak on 
Mirrors" at a gathering In Bos­

ton next week. 

Apply For Piggery Permit 

SOHOOL STAMP PUEOHASES 

A Slim total of $652.80 was col­
lected by the Stamp Sale commit­
tee Tuesday morning. Harrison 
Avenue School by purchasing $153.-
40 placed first and Harbor Street 
with a purchase of $116,20 took 
second honors. The Junior-Senior 
High School was third with $100,30 
to Its credit: Other sschools follow: 
Laurel Street, $93,85; Canoe Brook, 
$90,20; Stony Creek, $52.30 and In­
dian Neck, . $37.55: Seven ctish 
bonds and eleven stamp albums 
were converted Into bonds. The 
next stamp sale/will be held in the 
schools next Monday morning. 

Virginia Danforth Allender 

Virginia Danforth, widow of Ed­
ward. Allender died suddenly 
Christmas day In Wetherslleld. 

She was born in the Danrorth 
homestead, Indian. Neck Avenue 
and lived here imtll a few years 
ago. one daughter. Miss Francis 
Danforth survives. 

Masonic Lodge 
Holds Ceremony 

Of installation 
The following officers were in­

stalled last evening at private 
ceremonies at Widows Sons Lodge 
No.' ,B6: Ralph Hurder, master; 
Howard Prann, senior warden; 
Burton B. Swanson, junior warden; 
Charles Baxter, secretary; Walter 
Woods, treasurer; C. Henry Close, 
senior deacon; Walter R. Nichols, 
junior deacon; Henry Georges, 
senior stewart; Carl Bloomquist, 
junior Stewart; Raymond Holsen-
beck, marshal; Edwin Maddern, 
chaplain; Ralph Nellson, tyler; 
Herbert Harrison, trustee; C. Hen­
ry Close, Sidney .Osborn, Incorpor­
ation trusteess. ' 

Year's News Events ̂  
Show Local Progress 

On The Home Front 
While Hundreds Fight Overseas Their Friends Hero Have Active 

Year In All Phases Of Community Activity —' Reviews Lists 
Highlights As Taken From Past Issues. 

Landlords May 
Make Petition 
For More Rent 

COLLECT PAPEE SUNDAY 

The Short Beach Hose, Hook and 
Ladder Co. will collect waste pa­
per Sunday morning in Short 
Beach, Granite Bay, Double Beach. 
Laflphler'i^ Cove; Johnsons and 
Brockett's Points. 

All paper should be securely tied 
and placed nearithe road early In 
the morning, twine is available at 
the flrehouse. 

White Funeral 
Held Tuesday 

John White, formerly of Bran­
rord, who resided at 265 Whalley 
Avenue, New Haven, died Saturday 
arter a long illness. 

Funeral services were held from 
the mortuary home of William S. 
Clancy and Son, Tuesday morning 
at 8*: 30 with a reguiem high mass 
at St. Mary's Church at 9. Burial 
was in St, Agnes Cemetery. 

He was the husband of the late 
Margaret McKeon White, formerly 
or Branford. A son, James White 
or Short Beach survives, 
or Short Beach survives, also' two 
sisters, Mrs, John botts and Mrs. 
May McCormlck. y 

Rev. Fi-. Edward J, Demenske 
celebrated the mass. James Cos-
grove, soloist, sang "Mother or 
Christ," accompanied by Mrs. J. J. 
Collins at the organ. 

Bearers were Peter Sullivan, 
Thomas Sudac, Dennis Collins and 
Arthur Friend. 

Branford landlords who feel they 
are suffering "a substantial hard­
ship" due to Increased operating 
costs. Including property taxes, 
may petition OPA lor rent In-
creases< Clarence C. Westerberg, 
Rent Director lor the New Haven 
Defense Rental Area, announced 
today. 

"In making sudi a petition," the 
rent director said, "the landlord 
must submit figures for his proper­
ty on a form supplied by the rent 
office. These figures must show his-
Income and expenses for the three-
year period before April 1, 1941 
the maximum rent date, and for a 
12-month period after rent control 
went into effect." 

OPA accountants analyze these 
figures and compare the two peri­
ods to determine whether the land­
lord Is entitled to reller. The ad­
justment permitted may In no case 
raise )he rent above comparable 
rents,' Mr. Westerberg explained. 

Relief was demonstrated In a 
Connecticut case where the land­
lord was the owner of a 6-apart-
ment house and sought increased 
rents because of Increased taxes, 
panltor expenses and heating costs. 
He proved .that his net yearly re­
turn now was more thany$600 less 
than before Rent Control. 

OPA agreed with the landlord to 
the extent of allowing him a rent 
Increase of $400 to be allocated to 
five of the six apartn\ents bringing 
the five, apartments up to compar­
able rents, the sixth apartment be­
ing already at a comparable level. 

To assist landlords In making 
their applications under the hard­
ship amendment, The Rent Office 
can arrange on notice to have an 
accountant available ror consulta­
tion, the rent director added. 

NEW STUDY GROUP 
WILL MEET AGAIN 

JANUARY NINTH 

In all phases or activity Bran-
lord had a busy 1044. During the 
last 12 months, however, sorrow 
has come to many of our homes. 
Boys tiave sacrificed their lives on 
the battlefronts of Europe and the 
Pacific. ' 

The year saw numbers of young 
men leaving town for the armed 
services. It saw 242 returned to ci­
vilian life. 

Rationing, Civilian Defense, Red • 
Crossand like organizations con­
tinued their good work through 
their progress may not be noted in ' 
the following chronology In which 
is noted the marshalling of re­
sources for victory, the communit-. 
ies efforts to keep up home front 
moral. In it are included events of 
an unexoected nature, some plea­
sant, some not so pleasant. 

.The weather was just about as 
tipsy as Connecticut weather can 
be. A hot summer was one of the 
causes for a brisk Season at the 
shore with all cottage, rooms and 
hotels filled to capacity. On the 
other hand weather was responsi­
ble for crop failures especially 
strawberries. ! 

Three serious fires took place, 
one in Park Place, one at Stony 
and the third on Branford Hills. 

A tendency to decrease home 
war defense Is noted in the dis­
banding dt observation post work, 
dismanteling casualty stJttions and 
lull In civilian defense activities. 

Tercentenary f plans were post­
poned and social affairs stood dor­
mant. 

Election was the biggest news of . 
the year and absentee voting arid 
rationing the biggest headaches. 

Elsewhere In this issue will be 
found the chronology or 1944. 

FIND LITTLE NEED 
THIS CHRISTMAS 

The study group organized here 
in December at the suggestion of 
the New Haven League or Women 
Voters win meet January 9 at the 
home of Mrs. Michael Carplnella 
to continue Its study of the Dum­
barton Oaks proposals. 

These proposals were recom­
mended for a general Internation­
al organization, agreed to by repre­
sentatives of the United States, 
Great Britain, the Soviet Union 
and China and published in Octo­
ber. The'purpose of the "United 
Nations" is to maintain peace and 
security and to facilitate Interna­
tional cooperation. 

MOTOE COEPS EEPOET 

SPONSOES MOVIE 

Mrs. Cy Byer and children of 
Florida have been visiting relatives There will be a hearing January 

8 at the town hall to act on the j here. 
application of Thomas Santa Bar- , 
bara and Anthony Santa Barbara | Social Workers will meet January 
of Rose Hill Road to operate a pig- 9 in Congregational Church par-
gory, ' jlors. 

Georgia Chapter, O.E.S., In co­
operation with the Branford Thea­
tre will present "Dough Girls" on 
January 11-12 in a double feature 
program. 

The Brantord Red Cross Motor 
Corps covered 338 miles in Decem­
ber on 23 trips, three of which were 
to the government base hospital, a 
service since ordered discontinued. 
Tteenty-slx men were transported 
to and from the air base on the 
service to armed forces schedule. 

GEORGE MAEQUAED DIES 

Tlie funeral of George Andrews 
Marquard of Linden Avenue, Indi­
an Neck, was held from the S. A. 
Griswold Colonial Home yesterday 
afternoon. Mr. Marquard died 
Sunday at his home in Indian Neck 
at the age of 86. 

INJUEED BY CAR 

The Branford Visiting Nurse As­
sociation supplied mittens, socks, 
sweaters and other useful articles 
to some few) children at'Christmas 
time, but the need this year was 
slight. As usual the Sunshine So­
ciety supplied what candy the 
niu'ses thought necessary to please 
the youngsters. 

FOEMER RESIDENT PASSES 

Mrs, Annie Lynch Istas of New 
Haven, widow of John Istas died 
on New Year's Day, Funeral ser­
vices were conducted this morning 
from the parlors of"M, F. Walker 
SI Sons with requiem high mass In 
St. John's Church, Interment was 
In Mowit St. Peter's Cemetery, 
Derby. 

Mr. and Mrs. Istas lived in Clark 
Avenue for many years. 

ARRANGE FOE PROGRAMS 

The program committee of the 
Branford Garden Club met yester­
day in Hotchklss Grove with Mrs. 
Arthur Bowman. Mrs. Alden J. Hill 
and her committee were present: . 
Mrs. Winchester Bennett, Mrs. M. 
D. Stanley, Mrs. S. A. Griswold, 
Mrs. W. A. Drlsler. 

Mrs. Raymond Ballou has re-
ttirned to her home In Alps Road 
following a visit In Portsmouth, 
N.H. with Mr. Ballou who is a hos­
pital patient there, being treated 
for serious Injuries received In an 
automobile accident. 

GAEL OSCAE WADSTEOM 

Carl Oscar Wadstrom died sud­
denly In New Haven Hospital Wed­
nesday mornlnl. Funeral services 
will be held Saturday at 2 o'clock 
from the Norman V. Lamb funeral 
home, with Rev. G. S, Oshlund of 
Guilford officiating. Burial will be 
in Tabor Lutheran Cemetery. 

He was 64 years of age. Besides 
his wife he leaves a daughter, Hel­
en; a brother, Al!red and relatives 
In Finland. 

January 5th at 

There will be no Musical Art So­
ciety meeting in January. 

Capt. John Coolac, Lieut. Mau-
Mrs. Samuel A. Griswold will be rice Smith and Lieut. Clarence I. 

hostess at a meeting of the Bran- Bradley, represented Company I, 
fnrrt nni-fion ninv. To„iiar.. KM, "•'c.S,G., and the Corcoran-Suud-

quist Post, American Legion, at the 
funeral services for Lieut.-Col. , 
Charles iLockhart. They also were 
members of the escort which took 
the body to Greenwich for burial. 

ford Garden Club 
2:30 

An Important meeting of Vasa 
Star Lodge will be held Friday 
night in Svea Han at 8 o'cloik. 
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McManus Wears 
5 Battle Stars TOWN TOPICS 

i: 

MAIN STREET STATE EOAD NO LONGER 

'I'liat genial grouch, Genenil Knox, wlio is a rogulur and vn'.uod 
contributor to our wecUl.v, lias lirouglu, up a timely subject this weel<. 
His perambuliitinjj; around town and his bt'ul; fur sticking his nose 
into situiitioris ot oni; kind or another, brought us the interesting in-
Xorniiifcioii Unit Main Street 1ms been rbiuovod from tlie stale higli-
way system and tlml for soine lime it has been a •mnintcniiiice cliai'ge 
of the town of Kust lluveii. We roali/.c that the stiito went In i|uite 
heavy expense in building the four-hme supcr-liigliway across Peiil 
Sleadow linking uji with the Post road near Ijiilte Saltonstnll, to re­
lieve Main street of tlie lu-iivy tniil'ie, unci state oll'iciiils pvoUiilily 
concluded that Easl Haven ought to be satisiied. 

But Main street is uii orisiiial iinrl of the old New York-Boston 
Post Road which dales buck to early eoloiiiiil tini'fe. The state has 
liighwuy funds provided from tlie automobile niul gnsoline taxes, as 
iVe uiiderstJind it, and these funds are tor the purpose of building 
a m f maintaining the main liiglnvays whicli link towns with other 
towns. 'Main street is still the chief link between IDast Haven center 

: and New Haven. We agree with General Ivnox that our Boi)reseiitii-
tives in the General Assembly conUl well look into the cii'cumslances 
of how Main street came to lie dropped as a part of the Stale High­
way system, and ascertain if sometliiiig can be done, even at this late 
day, toward relieving 13ast Haven lionie owners of wluil promises to 
become an increasing iinaneial burilen as the years go on. 

OLD STONE OHUECH BEOADOAST 
Volume I, No. 4, of the eight-paj^c mimeographed "Old Stone 

Church Broadcast" came to our desk this week and we must say 
that Mrs. Herbert Coe, its editor,'Marian Howley, who did the typ-i 
iiig, and Carol Clarke, who furnished the cartoons, have done a nice 
piece of worlc, and they, and the Servicemen's Comiuittee of the 
eluircli, publishers of the Broadcast, deserve a lot ot credit. This is 
the kind of newsy .lett6r that we are sure we would look forward to 
receiving'if we were liomesick and far off on a distant post of duty, 
AH cliurehes and other organizations having men and womeii in the 
serviee would dp well to emulate the example so well set by Mrs. 
Coe and her capable committee. 

We note that there is a word olNew Years Greeting in this .Jan­
uary Broadcast by Rev. West, and also best wislies from tlie pxceu-

j> -LT _ _.„,.,'„„(. „v„,.nli OTn-nnizatio] 

A very Interesting high school 
assembly was held Friday morning 
iwhen LT, EUGENE/'CHICK" DE-
ITLIPPO '42 and SIGNALMAN ED 
CAREY '42 ot the Navy were inter­
viewed by COL. PRANK M. DOOL-
EY, JR., before the student body. 
In the process of questioning both 
CHICK and ED recounted their 
varying and Interesting careers in 
the past nunvber of months. CHICK 
told of his experiences as a pilot 
ot n bomber In the European area 
and ED of his service In tlie Medi­
terranean Sea. At the close of the 
.interview there were questions 
l-from tile floor which both service 
men answered gladly. 

The school Glee Club under the 
direction of Mrs, Wllhclmina 
Strandberg led tlic assembly in 
group singing and the orchestra 
accompanied. 

This as,sembly was arranged In 
celebration of the purchase of a 
Grasshopper Plane for the Army. 
This purchase was made possible 
through the sale of stamps and' 
bonds by the East Haven High 
School Victory Corps, under the 
supervision of Miss Hortertse Giilln. 
I WILLIAM OILLIS, JR., '41 writes 
that he has left England and • is 
now in Prance, BILL tells of the 
great scarcity of food among the 
civilian population. As yet BILL 
says, none of his Christmas mall 

youtliful Anthony arrived in New 
Haven at night and the very next 
day his people saw to it that he 

has reached him so he Is looking 
torward to the receipt of American 
[ood and tobacco before too long 

SOT. WALTER S, HANLEY '42 
an aerial gunner In a veteran 15lh 
AAP' heavy" bombardment group 
stationed In Italy, lias been pio 
moted from, the grade ot corpoial 
WALTER .entered the AAP at Hnrt 
ford on January 9, 1043, 

LT. GEORGE DOHNA '43 hai 
.had a furlough over the Chrlstma.s 
|holldays andjtj seemed so very line 
to see him again.! His new unltorm 
ot an Army Air Force's Pilot lei 
tainly looked very special. GEORGE 
received the silver wings at Naplei 
Field in Alabajma and was at the 
san^e time sworn In as a Second 
Lieutenant., GEORGE left to take 
further training at Flying School 
before the bigger job ahead. 

JASQUALE CRISCI '44 entered 
the sei-vice <ln April 3, 1944 and re­
ceived his basic training with a 
cavalry unit'a tFort Riley, Kansas 
He then transferred to California 
after which .he was sent overseas. 
PASQUALE Is now located In Bur­
ma. . . , 

STANLEY • SHEPARD, Sp. 1 3-c 
'40 writes from Arlington, Va., that 
he' Is planning to attend a college 
under the Gl I, Bill of Rights alter 
the war for a,degree in Business 
Administration. Tills, I believe, will 
ibc In line 'with STANLEY'S clcrl-
Icalwork. • 

ADDITIONAL ARMED FORCES 
-ON PAGE 3 

FROM OUR REPORTERS- NOTEBOOKS J 
Gel liny 

Uiiitcs. 
rcnrti/ /or March o r Mr, and Mrs 

Your donnllona will help In the 
Important light being waged 
against Intantlle Paralysis. 

Jlfr.-;, .;. /'. D<ire/nj/ Wis us Chrhi-
mas Seal sale this ycnr uya.s liesi 
ever. Exceeded all expcclaUons. 

- _ Robert Merrill en­
joyed New Years supper with Mr. 
and Mrs. Ray Mead at their homO' 
In Cheshire. 

Gunners Mate 3-c 
Frederick R. MoMimua 

Frederick R. McMan\i,s, gunners 
mate 3rd class, son of Mr, and Mrs, 
Matthew Anaslaslo of 92 Memlng-
way avenue, proudly wears five 
battle stars tor service' rendered In 
the Paclllc area. 

After 10 months at sea the young 
man, a former student In the High 
school who graduated In the class 
ot 1943 after enlisting in February 
of that year In the Navy, Is now at­
tending Advanced Gunners' school. 

He received his preliminary 
training at the Great Lake's Naval 
[Training Station and went to sea 
August 1, 1943 serving in a Task 
.Force in the Paclllc. He engaged in 
I the battles ot Kiska, Makin, Kwa-
ialien, Enlwetok and Salpan and 

She urges that we remind those 
who have forgotten to make remit­
tances tiir Seals received to send 
Ihelr money as soon as possible so 
that on early report can be made. 

Harold DooltlllCtpiominentmem-
hcr of llarrji R. Barllett post, has 
been named to the DtstiiigutsheC 
guest commiltco of the National 
De]>artment o/ the American te-y 
crion ()!/ Uaiional Commander 
Saheihlen. 

NoHonn! PtihUo Health Nursing 
Day sel lar Jan. 2i reminds us fine 
work local association is doing as 
sho7im in anjuMnl report vrinted 
elsewhere. 

Card came Monday from Tom 
Joyce basking In Miami sunshine. 
Next day he was back home again, 
[Tells us housing shortage there too 
acute for comfort, 

CharJte Kuchtif tormcrly' o] 
Dorschl Lodge nnd Hotel Taft, New, 
Havon, now .itipervislng at 
Schmidt's laeslaumni' 'Iv.ere, • pla7i-

Oftlcers reelected by the Brad-
rord Manor auxiliary this week are' 

nvirs. Joseph O'Connor, president; 
Mrs. Robert Chadeaync, vice pres'l-
dentj^ Mrs, Frederick Ebarth, sec­
retary; Mrs. William Dion, trea­
surer. The ofClcers will bo Installed 
at a banquet February 3 and Mrs. 
Matthew Hogan Is chairman of the 
arrangemonts. 

The East Hfvctn Olner, toe are 
pleased to report, is noio opeii eue-
nings until midnig'Jit, the new^ 
closi7ig hour having gone intd'ef-
fect last Monday. 

We loairn that Pfo. Anthony 
ouiwinuto ,,v.,„.„,.„«.,. ..._,,,,...... .Richitelll, son or Mr. and Mifs.'Johri' 
|iitn0 a spedal ufin(|!̂ 6)i siijrper one Y, p;ighit(,ll( QJ ĝ  gjjoft jjeaoh 
of these days 
formed. 

We'll, keep .you in-

jaiion, liiuwviuK. ui.u ,j.».,,.M. 1 Congratulations to High Sciiool 
his tour ot duty has taken him Into coach Ray Smith anil Mrs. Smith, 
many parts ot the great Paclllc itig ^ boy, Daniel Craig, born in 
ocean Including the Aluctlon la- Qrace Hospital on Tuesday, 
lands, the Gilbert Islands, Pearl i , , • 
Harbor,, and Guam, and ho hasl We hear DemticrAtio'town torn 

I , , five ,4omrans''oi sjace. Then too there are' the engagcmdnit, mar-
' I'ia^BB,'litad'births-of interest to .the Stone church service family, a 

list of, birthdays from, January 1 lo February 27, and, to top it oil", 
a " t l ave a Laffi" column, and an insniratioiial poem by John W. 
Chadwiek, appropriate -to'the New Year season. Again we repent, 
these respohsible for the "Broiidcast'-' arc deserving of much credit. 

PICTl/EES OF BOYS AND GIELS IN SEEVIOE 

We arc happy to ainiounee that we have made arrangements for 
tlie.pulilisliing from time to time of photographs of Hast Havon and 
yic'iiuty boys and girls who are now in tlie serviee of our country. 
"We believe that not onlv will our friendlv circle of readers here in. 
Bast Haven and surrounding eominunitie.s''enjoy seeing the familiarP"-"^ *< "̂̂  ' " " ">e nanas ot re-
faces of those who are now far from home serving upon our far-l"'y'=''^- T^^ receivers, H..,Stewar 
flung battle lines, but tliat the boys mid girls tfiemselves will .i.,.;n |Hotchklss and Ex-Mayor__F. B 
at seeing themsolves in their home-town paper. 

Wc have observed what other home-town weeklies of limited 
circuhitioii liave been doing in this direction, and huve found that 
the most satisfactory arrangement lias been to provide tor the publi­
cation of these pictures at the cost of the making of the "cu t s" , as 
~\ve in tlie newspaper business term the pboto-eiigrnvings whieli are 
made direct from photographs and are used in the printing of tile lin-,,„ , 
ished paper We have theretore arranged witli a fellow Bast Haven-uhe war he remalned.,as custodian 
er, Mr. Eudy Schmidt of the Rundbaken fengrav.ng Co., to makeji^-, , ^j ^i^ ^ î 

" " "" •""- ""'"^' ""̂ "̂  °t 'ernmenf owned materials. 
Later the plant was sold to the 

American Steel & Wire company 
and Mr. Ferraiolo went to the Dec­
orative Stone company as foreman 

tabh'af-"BS«Tg~ Hfe-fiAly Ita11an"6oy 
Graduating from the 12th grade 
he took up work, as an' Iron core 
maker in what was known as Sar­
gent's North Foundry, In 1902 Mr. 
Sims, the superintendent, resigned 
and organized the National Steel 
Foundry .Co. Anthony' went along 
with the new organization, which 
had the first open hearth steel set­
up In New Haven, and was placed 
in charge of operations. He re-

.maincd until 1907 when the com-
jpany went into the hands ot re 

•t 
iirill |H°tehklss and Ex-Mayor F. B, 

Iparnsworth retained Mr. Ferralo 
lo as custodian of the plant until 
the first World War when it wa.'j 
sold to the Penn Seaboard Steel 
Corp. At that time Mr. Ferraiolo 
worked as night superintendent 
making steel Ingots lor 9.2 shells 
for the British government. Alter 

Funeral Services For Former Sex­
ton Of Stone Oliuroh Largely 
Attended. 

such " c u t s " for parents or friends Avho will pay tlie small cost of 
the work, and such pictures will be published from time to time in 
our columns, we •will be glad to receive j')hotogvapIis and give any 
further information concerning this arrangements for the better serv-
jug.voE our readers. 

HEAR YE! HEAE YE! 

Funeral SODVIBCS for O. Wesley 
Stepp were held at Lamb's Funeral 
Home In Main street Tuesday af­
ternoon and were largely attended, 
.Rev. William G. West officiating. 
On the previous evening Masonic 
.services Were conducted by Adel-
phl Lodge. No. G3 ot Pair Haven, of 
which Mr. Stepp nad long been a 
member. 

"Pop" Stepp, as he was affection-
[atcly known, was a native East 
Havener, born Sept, 18, 1855, in the 
Stepp homstead which stood al­
most across the street from the 
present Lamb Funeral Homo where 
the funeral was held. His ancestry 
went far back into East Haven, his 
mother having been Mary Farren, 
and one ot his grandmothers De-

oraiive sione compauy u= ."•w,......|Sli-e Thomp.son ot another well 
In the molding and casting depart- known East Haven family. As a boy 
ment. He remained with the com- he attended the old school house 

Harbor, and Guam, and no nasi- vn; ..»...• ^^...-; .^ ,—. --..... 
[had a share m six Important nav- '"-'"ec plam to iniroduce a mil in 
al amphibian operations. . lp7-csc7it:Ge«e/at Assemhtg in Hart-, 
• The young nmn^ will'bo,recallcdl/ord which••wmim.fir^ata-d ,s.]Jectai, 
as haying been puteUndihgiln'ixth-lfepbaf.cDistHii.^^^^^^ 
' lctlca*Whlle tlnjilHtgiis^^cJiRBlgifteift^ 
:He played center.: iiv:tli^,:Vi)Slty[;.^ : ̂ ^ 

his gal-ago' after "hard cold .which 
kept him indoors over week end, 

A T/oung married couples' class in 
ballroom dancing ' vieets every 
Thursday at 0 p.m. in Miss Peggy 
Whyles Studio. : . 

In a letter to his mother, Mrs. 
Shaller, Chief Potty Officer Her­
bert Dirton of the Seabees tells of 
arriving at TInlanna In the Marl-
ana Islands of the Pacific. Mr. 
Darton formerly had a garage 
business here. 

road has been awarded thePurplo 
Heart for merit in line of duty, 
pvt. RlchltelU is In an ' Englnoflr 
Battalion • somewhere in Praiioo. 
Another son of the RlchltclUs,' 
JohnV. Jr., Is a member ,ot the 
Itifantry, soincwhovc In the Pacific 
Area. 

ADDITIONAL 'TOWN TOPICS. 
-QNi'MaKa'., ' 

basketball, 'team; apd , ;was; pltohiif 
for the baseball nine. Before 'en­
tering Hlgii school he attended 
Grove J, Tuttle school. 

Anangcmcnts have been made 
for the pilblisMng of picUurca of 
our Service Men and Women at 
the nominal cost of "cuts" which 
must be furnished vs al least 
one week in advance of publica­
tion. 

MRS. GERRISH HEADS 
PARALYSIS CAMPAIGN 

Mrs. Robert H. Gerrlsh who has 
done such signal work In raising 
funds for the fight against Infan­
tile paralysis and who has served 
for some time on the New Haven 
County Committee, again . heads 
the drive In East Haven. One. of 
the first donations, eight dollars 
was made to the committee Tues­
day night by the Men's club ot the 
Old Stone church. 

ilf(ss Peggie Ogilpte has returned 
from a vacation, stay vMh her par­
ents here to her duties at' the Wa-
terbury Hospital. Miss Ogilvie loho 
.sang Smnday at the- Old Stone 
|c/iurc/i has been appointed soloist 
0] the Waterbury ..Hospital ..Ol'ce 
club. 

Mr. and Mrs. Ellwood cook, Mr... „ ,, ,._, , . . „ 
and Mrs. Kenneth Mansfield and'program In St. Andrews' church 

'JAN. 5 to 'JAN. 11, 1820 
At the annual?meeting of the 

Fire Department Harry Page was 
reelected chief. Other olflcers chos-

, on were Gilbert \Kelsey, assistant 
[chief; Martin icornglebel, foreman; 
Chester Newton, assistant foreman 
Guy Willis, secretary and George 
Chldsey, treasurer. 

Mrs. Adelaide B. Clark and Rob-i 
ert E, Hall were Installed as worthy 
matron and worthy patron of 
Princess Chapter, Order of the 
Eastern Star. • ;> . 

Arthur Page,was taking'the cen­
sus In East Haven for the goyerri-
ment, ' 

Mrs. Edcar Bapon was lU with La 
Grippe at her.'hpme 'In' Bradley 
ovonue. • ' > ;: ' ' » 

l*ho Old Stone church Old Polks 
concert group put on a successful 

ipany 15 years and resigned In 1930 
. , • J ,11 „«,,.. -iilontion to the service we are to take up a position with the 

' ? ' ' "^P ' '™^^ ' l^ i " . " ; r " i „ ' ^ ^ hfi^lul ing "Hear ye! Connecticut Coke Co., as patcher offering in our little inside column under the heading "Hear ye 
Hear y e ! " It is a column for the people of this community in which 
a t a very low cost, they may place their wants of one kind or anoth­
er, before the eyes of their neighbors. We want to see thai eolunin 
grow. We believe there are many whom TllE NEWS can serve, by 
finding rents for those who Avant them, by finding a market for 
merchandise or nrtielcs of furniture they want to dispose ol', liy 
finding lo,st valuaiiles, by securing help when needed, by obtaining 
KOine Avanted.piece of etiuipment, and in dozens of other ways. Good 
neighbors, too, sometinies desire to extend' their appreciation to 
others in the community for acts o£ thoughttulness and kindness, 
and what better opportunity than a brief "eard of Tlianks" pub­
lished in our columns? Yes this is a bid fflJ- business, but it is also a 
suggestion of the serviee we extend to our 'gro\yinK list ot readers. 

Personalties 

Anthony Ferraiolo, Father ot 12, 
Has Had Active Part In East 
Haven Life Since 1918. 

• Today we are glad to introduce 
as our personality of the Week the 
father of twelve children, a man 
who holds a place of honor in our 
community, and an o"*^;^"*"/. 
Itallan-Amerlcan.-Anthony Fer­
raiolo. Mr. Ferraiolo has been^ a 
resident of,East_Haven sin e l 18 

our town. 
As founder and. president, since 

Its Inception, of the well known 
Amerigo club, Anthpny Ferraiolo 
has developed this organization to 
its present position ot influence as 
a civic group. He has also been ac­
tive in other civic lnterests..among 
the Italian-Americans. Recently 
when he expressed a desire to re­
tire from the presidency In order 
that younger shoulders could take 
up the burden the membership 
answered with a very audible "No." 

Anthony came to this country In 
March, 1888, and, It we .know our 
history correctly, that was the 
month and year of the Great Bllz 
zard, when snow fell to a depth of 

Connecticut Coke Co., as patcher 
ot coke ovens. 

He retired last March to devote 
all of his time to the manufacture 
of Cast Stone Garden Ornaments 
which he had can-led on at his 
home as a side line for a number 
ot years. He has developed a large 
trade in this unusual venture. 

When Mr. Parralplo and his 
growing family moved to East Ha­
ven In 1918, Prospect place exten­
sion where he has since resided 
was in a largely undeveloped area. 
He has seen many changes. Dur­
ing his time here he has devoted 
much attention" to Italian-Ameri­
can civic groups, one of which, the 
Amerigo club, has become an Im­
portant clement in our civic lite. 
He has also been active In labor 
.movements being one ol the organ­
izers of, Connecticut Coke and Gas 
Workers Local 12,000. 

All of Mr. Ferralolo's 12 children 
are married with the exception ot 
S.-Sgt. Joseph Ferraiolo, who has 
been missing In action .since Sep­
tember, 1943, and pre. Louis Fer­
raiolo, who is with Co. B. 517 Para. 
Inf. Regt. somewhere In France. He 
Is the proud grandfather of 22 

1 grandchildren. * 
. Just to keep him busy he also 

; ; T h a s been guide hehierand^ln-^ ^ ^ ; ^ ^ , , , , „ , „, ,,,,, 

t C ' w h o ' S l e t m f a P ^ t oflor ^ they tell us. At any rate the'goats and cavles. 

which once stood, on the local 
Green and later he received more 
advanced Instruction at Eaton 
school In New Haven. When a young 
man he entered the employ of the 
long-forgotten Steven Bradley Wa­
gon Works which were situated In 
Main street on the side of the pre­
sent Hosley Block. In later times 
he became a tradesman doing 
hoase-palntlng and carpentering 
[in this vicinity. For 33 years he 
served faithfully as the sexton of 
the Old Stone church taut has been 
retired many years. 

The commmilty will miss Mr. 
jStepp for he has always been a fa­
miliar figure In the center, his 
home being situated the first north 
of Main and High streets. His wife, 
Harriet^MarytBurns, died July 4, 
1943 soon after their 67th wedding 
anniversary. Always In the best of 
health Mi'. Stepp cared tor his gar­
den and had many other activities 
up to the past year. At New Years 
time a cold developed and this 
turned to pneumonia. 

His daughter, Mrs. Edith L. 
Green, who devotedly cared tor her 
[parents In their declining years, 
survives as do two sons, Charles T. 
Stepp of West Haven and Ernest H, 
Stepp of New Haven. There are al-
.so six grandchildren and' eleven 
great grandchildren. The oldest 
grandson is Howard .Stepp, chief 
director of athletics at Princeton, 

Because You and Your Neighbors Gave 

Fight Infantile BUY WAR BONDS 
and glva thp change to the 

MARCH OF DIMES 
JANUARY 14-31 

I •iT'HTlflflllill illlll»fTir~*"^ 
Space Sponsored By 

Paralysis! 

^e^i Mfg. Co. A. C. Gilbert Co. 

..c. 
li 
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( ( In The Beginning 11 

lly Win. K Gillls, Siipprintcmlcnt of Soliools 

"I decided not to send Junior to 
kindergarten, It's Just a waste of 
time. AH they do Is play games", 
said Mrs. Blaiik when asked It her 
son had entered school this year. 

There are many Mr. and Mrs. 
Blanks who have an Incdrrcot Im­
pression of this branch of our 
school system, Tho work of this 
first year'Is extremely imporfant. 
A first grade teacher, being glveij 
a group of thirty-five youngsters 
entirely strange to her can tell 
within n tew days those who have 
not had the advantages of tho 
kindergarten training, 

Suppose that you were suddenly 
set down In a strange land, among 
people who knew what they were 
doing, where they were going and 
what was being discussed by thejr 
fellow men. The child without.kln-
dergarten training, 1.9 placed 
In a. first grade made up of chil­
dren who have had that training is 
in a strange • world. He is sur­
rounded not by hl.s equals but by 
those 'who have advanced beyond 
him. He starts tho work of tho 
school program under a handicap. 

A large part of the kindergarten 
program, is based on games and so­
cial life but there is a purpose be­
hind eaoh of tho activities, Usually 
the "Child has been king or queen 
of the realm In the first Ave' years 
of lite at home. Each Individual, 
however, oahnot go on living unto 
himself alone. Ho inusl learn to 
get along with others. He' must 

work and play with others. He must 
share the responsibilities as well 
as the privileges of society. 

The direct change from the 
home to the life of the school re­
quires many adjustments and the 
kindergarten Is the device used to 
bridge the gap between the shel­
tered life of the home and the 
wordly life of the, regular school 
grades. 

In our school system we arc not 
In a position to have a kindergar­
ten in every school, Tho number of 
eligible pupils in a district and the 
avallnble school space are tho two 
Important factors which control 
this situation. To bo eligible for 
kindergarten a pupil must bo four 
years, eight and one half months, 
of age on the opening day of school 
As a rule younger pupils 'ai-e not 
mature enough to boneflt from the 
work. Because of this, It is neces­
sary to have a definite age limit, 

Allowing exceptions to this would 
result In eiidless confusion. To es­
tablish a kindergarten there must 
be available a suitable classroom 
and a constant supply of candi­
dates to insure the continued 
maintenance of the program. 

The kindergarten alms to: 
• 1. Train tho child to adapt him­

self to Viis environment. 
2. Teach tho child that he Is no 

longer just an individual _but a 
member of a group with. Its rights 
and responsibilities. 

3. Teach tho child to associate 

Town Topics 
Misses Betty Shamp and June 

Dube were week end guests New 
Years of Mr. and Mrs. Theron Ken-
nls In Garden City, L.I. 

Mr. and Mrs. Minoli Bradley of 
Thompson aventio leave this week 
for their annual winter stay, at In-
terlashen in t'cnlral Florida. Un­
til Ms retirement a year ago Mr. 
Bradley was ttte manayer /or the 
First Nationt^t Stores in this dis­
trict. 

Pfe. James Whelan has arrived 
In Washington on the West Coa.sl 
after a long tour of duty in the 
Aleutian Islands. Ho left homo tho 
day before Christmas in 11)42 and 
went to the Aleutians tho follow­
ing July. Ho Wis expected homo 
this week, for a furlough. 

Harry Falkoff raviinds «« thai 
January 15. may be the deadline 
for many of-us to file our l-ncomc 
tax reports,, tf the estimated tax on 
the dectaraUon is twenty percent 
or more under the aotual tax, he 
informs us, the report must be' filed 
by that date. 

Mrs, Edwoi'd J; Simpson of 34 
Footo road has boon. In the Now 
Haven Hospital; for treatment. 
Mrs. Slm'pson Is bookkeeper at the 
offlco of: East Haven Homos inc. in 
Main street. 

^ 

Rellabili+y FIrsf 

One_ reason wliy this pharmacy is Buceossfnl is because He-
liabiiitjr with ufi is a iirst eonsidnnitiou. Pliysieians know 
tliat wo can he clopcriclod upon for careful cniniioundinK 
of prescri])l,ionK luid for jirompt iMid relhihlo service. 

HOLCOMBE DRUG CO. 

J ' ' 

Schmidt's Restaurant 
i (Formerly Clioinp'a , 

Tfnder iiiiumgcnionl of Ohiirliii Kiielinr 
formerly wilh Dorseht Ijodt'e iuul Motel Tatt 

Special Every Saturday and Sunday 
Turkey Dinner 85G 

Hot Turkey Sandwich 50c 
ALL KINDS OF SANDWICHES 

\ 19.'') Main Street Ensl llaven 

Busy With 
War Work? 

Do your shopping Iici-e in 

' comfort and provide your 

family with our delicious 

quality foods. 

Wo have n. oorapleto line 

of rolls, breads, cakes, 

pies, oooldos and other 

mouth-watering; items for 

the table. 

Wolfes Quality Food Shop 

A nice improvement in the East 
Haven S and 10 Cent store at 2B3 
Main street is the installation by 
the Fairchitd %lectriaal Co., of six 
handsome f oar-foot fluorescent 
cellino licihts. 

It looks like a rummage sale at 
the Hagaman Memorial Library, 
but It's only the clearing out of 
found'' ortloles. which have been 

left In the library during the past 
few months. In looking over the 
assortmopt on tho table we counted 
five pair ot mittens and one-half 
of a pair of pigskin gloves, some 
miscellaneous notes and letters 
which had been left In returned 
books, a boy's winter cap, a church 
school button, a pocket mirror, an 
empty purse, and three or four as­
sorted handkerchiefs. . 

Cold •weather of early January 
made morning starting of automo­
biles unite difficult and kept gar­
age and servicemen btisy;; 

One of the nicest calendars we 
have reoeiyed th|(i year came from. 
Qoorge si^son,' in8urat)ce;agefit,' of 
ChidMy iiVenup. it ' lS, a'-man.-size; 
calejiddr wltji all the. special days 
designated, arid yet iit the sam,e 
time decorative enough for any 
wall. 

The Movtfiugnin Group of the 
Old Ston^ church will sponsor a 
card party Friday cvenlnff in the 
George street Fire House. 

Momauguin Christ church Guild 
will hold a card party at 8 tonight 
at 101 Dewey avenue. 

We learned of the death last 
week in NorwicJi of the mother of 
Frank Golkpmske luTio iisod to live 
in Pardee place and loas well 
knomi here. Mrs. Golkoioske also 
leaves a daughter, Mrs. Alan Mc­
Coy of Bayslde, L.I. 

Cnpt. Don Strait has become 
commanding officer of the 361st 
Plghtor Squadron which trained at 
the Airport here according to In-

l, FRANK 
7- RIGNEY 

IT^ESPITE DEPTH BOMBS, 
STRONG CURRENTS AND 
SHALLOW WATERS. A 

RECORD CRUISE WAS MADE 
BYLT.COMDR.WARDER'S 
SUBMARINE "SEAWOLFL' 
EIGHT JAP SHIPS, SIX 
OF THEM WARSHIPS.WERE 
DESTROYED OFF THE 
COAST OF JAVA 

VIEWING THROUGH THE 
PERISCOPE HE BROADCASTED 
THE FIGHTS TO HIS CREW. 

HIS YOUTH 
HE WAS A BOY SCOUT 
AT GRAFTON,W.VA. 

formation received by Harris AJI-
stey who has ke])t in touch with 
the outfit since it wont overseas. 

co-chairmen is scheduled for 
Thursday, January IS at 8 p.m. in 
the parish house. 

A nice New Year card this week 
from Mr. and Mrs. Howard Allen's 
Apiartes\ in "The Land of Milk and 
Honey," Ouhuquc, Iowa, and a 
check for a year's subscription to 
the NEWS. "It's just like a weekly 
letter from Jiomq" they wrote. 

Paul Billings who Is training at 
Newport .spent the week end with 
his mother. 

Mrs. J. Fisher of East Orange, N.. 
J., anct Mrs. H. MacDonald of Wee-
haioken, N.J. visited their mother, 
Mrs. Agnes Stewart last week. 

Mrs. Henrietta Clare of Garri­
son, N.Y., spen a week with lier 
sister Miss Gene Stow who has 
been III. 

We appreciate the thoughtful-
neas of the reader who sent us this 
weefc the Christmas and Neio Years 
issues of their hoThe-town paper, 
The Altamont, k. Y. Enterprise. 
This is a\wM, edited,,.^clghtTpage 
'newsy, 'folksy: paper. Mmo: in its 61st 
yean There mmt be many of our 
adopted East Haveners getting pa­
pers from heir hovie towns. We en­
joy and profit by seeing a copy now 
and then. 

Earl Thomas of Elm Court re­
turned last week from New York 
city where he received surgical 
treatment. 

Mrs. Ada DcMars. entertained 
friends and her family over the 
holiday season. 

Miss Ruth Sperry of New, Haven 
called on her friend Gene Stow 
Friday. 

291 Main Street East Haven 

with those outside of his family 
circle. 

4. To develop the power ot self-
control. 

5. To offer greater opportunities 
tor learning. 

Many parents feel that specific 
subjects, such as reodlng, writing 
and arithmetic should be given 
when a pupil begins school. Before 
this can be done a period ot prep­
aration Is provided so that the 
change will not be too sudden and 
so that It will be. more helpful. 

In the schools which liave too 
tew pupils to warrant the estab­
lishment and maintenance of a 
kindergarten the begjlnning school 
work must be handled on a differ­
ent basis so as to have thq child 
adapt himself to his changed con­
dition of living. 

Relatives find neighbors paid a 
surprise visit to Mr. and Mrs. Wil­
liam McNeil at their home in Es-
telle road Thursday night to help 
the7n celebrate their 31st wedding 
anniversary. A very enjoyable eve­
ning ioas spent anct. refreshments 
were served by Mrs. iV. S. McNeil, 
Jr., and Miss Alice McNeil. Among 
those present were • Mr, and Mrs. 
Fred Sauerbrunn, Mr. and Mrs. 
Harold Doollttle, Mr. and Mrs. Paul 
H. Sevens, Mr. and Mrs. Burton 
Reed, Mr. and Mrs. Joseph Sapper, 
Mr. and Mrs. George 'McNeil, Mrs. 
Tina McNeil, Miss Lois Brown and 
Mr. and Mrs. W. S. McNeil 

Tho Men's club of the Old Stone 
church started its bowling league 
last night in the Community Al­
leys in charge of Alvlu Sanford 
and Parker Atwood. 

Inventory il7ne in the East Hav­
en stores and .'proprietors busy as 
all get-out. 

New names on Old Stone church 
Honor Roll: Robert Brockett, John 
Beardsley, Raymond Carlson, and 
"Buddy" .Tphns. 

READING CLUB MEETING 
IS MUCH ENJOYED 

Seventeen members ot the Half-
Hour Reading Club enjoyed a plea-
ant afternoon last Thursday 

.iround the open flre in the Club 
Room of the Hagaman Memorial 
library. Mrs, William We.st read a 
paper on "Living Creatively". She 
ijolnted out that we should live 
creatively every day. The hou.se-
wlfe who cooks new dishes and 
.serves them on an attractively ar­
ranged table Is living creatively. 
Bpoks, Including poetry, plays and 
music all contribute to creative 
living. She gave us some very In-
.splrlng thoughts with which to 
itarl the New Year. 

Mrs. H. A. Doraln's suggestions 
or reading followed Mrs. West's 

paper in a most appropriate man­
ner as she suggested a book by Les­
lie Wetherhead, one of Blngland's 
foremost church leaders. For one's 
enjoyment while listening to radio 
I)rograms she suggested' three 
books by Paul Orabbe: "Minute 
Stories ot the Opera." "Story ot 
One Hundred Symphonic Favor­

ites", ana •oiuiy ui o . ~—o.^ai 
Music." 

Mrs. E. L. Cook assisted by Mrs. 
R. E. Hotchkiss served tea and de­
licious, attractive sandwiches and 
cookies. 

Mrs. E. J. Boyer of 12 Bradley 
avenue was lnt»oduced and wel­
comed as a now member of the 
club. 

Since the business meeting was 
short and the program brief, mem­
bers enjoyed the last "half-hour" 
in a leisurely way, most ot them 
leaving at about 4:15. 

ARTHUR TROTTA HOME 
FROM PACIFIC AREA 

First 6la.ss Torpedo Man Arthur 
Trotta, who has been in the Sub­
marine .servlce.ot the U. S. Navy for 
six years arrived at the home ot 
his parents, Mr. and Mrs. Orlando 
Trotta on New Years Day for a 
furlough until January 20. He has 
seen action throughout the Pacllic 
area. Ho was in the Navy from 193G 
to ISIO and returned to service in 
May, 1941. His father is tho popu­
lar High street barber. 

S.Sgt. Warren Cawley honorably 
discharged from Air Corps after 
spending six months in army hos­
pitals as.result of injuries in plane 
crash. \ 

Frank Andrews Is in a hospital In 
France as result of burns. 

Paul H. Stevens, NEWS editor, 
was speaker Thursday at luncheon 
meMng of New flaven Quota club. 

SWIMMERS PREPARE 
TO . MEET CROSBY 

Coach Frank Koeto of the High 
School varsity swim team expressed 
atlsfactlon in the' showing of his 

swimmers against the experienced 
HlUhousc tankmen at the Y.M.C.A. 
on Friday, With the expected addi­
tion of several new athletes the lo­
cal team will prepare for a meet' 
with the Crosby High School In 
Waterbury Friday night. Local ath­
letes winning places against HiU-
house were Allan Legge, George 
Chamberlain, Alex Proto, John 
Sanford and Frank Dooley. 

CASES DISPOSED OF 
BY JUDGE REYNOLDS 

Cases Monday In the Town Court 
with Judge Edward L. Reynolds 
presiding and Attorney Vincent 
Fasano prosecuting were: George 
E. Prichard, 2887 Whitney Ave., 
Hamden, rules of road, $24; Milton 
R. Johnson, 05 George street, rules 
of road, nolle; Roy Blake, North 
Ilgh street, breach of peace, nisi 
continuance to July 1; George Aloi, 
341 Concord street, Morris Cove, 
driving without a license, $3. 

No Shortage of Whiskey Here 

Dan Parilla's 

Economy Package Store 
The Largest—Most Modern—Moat Oompleto-Stocltcd Liquor Store Between 

New York and Boston 

OPEN 8 A.M. . 8 P.M. — Friday, Saturday 8 A.M. - 9 P.M. 

269 Main Street Phono 4-0061 Sast Kaven 

All members of the Old Stone 
ehuich are Invited to attend the 
covered dish supper Friday night 
at 0:45 In the parish house. The 
Woman's Aid which supervises the 
supper requests that the ladles 
bring covered dishes and tho men 
place a cover charge of 50 cents on 
tho table. The annual church 
meeting with election of olllcers, 
ijnd committee reports will follow. 
Invitations say; "Conie bring your 
ears, ideas and appetites!" 

A public card party lolth Mrs 
Joseph Holt and Mr.^ Itlchards as 

Fred Tomci, Prop. 

Specializing in 

ITALIAN AND 

AMERICAN DISHES 

SPAGHETTI - RAVIOLA 

• Tel, 4-0247 

27i Main St,, East Haven 

AVOITLI) YOl,̂  

• THAW OUT iiKii incAirn 

PHONE NEW HAVEN 4 0 8 0 1 
lis4 [>p,DOE AVE.rEAST MAVEN 

P L U M B I N G 
No Job too Large 

No Jo]} too Small 

Peter A. 
Limoncelli 

PLUMBING & HEATING 
CONTRACTOR 

Phone 4-1357 
199 Hemingway Ave. 

Bast Haven 

Ralph Amato's 
New Restaurant 

IS STILL OPEN 
1,'JO C'pscy Beaoli Avenue Momauguin 

SEA FOOD. STEAK. AND CHICKEN DINNERS 

. CHOICE LIQUORS 

Tel. 4-0175 

•B" •B 

When your Radio Needs 
Attention Call Us for Prompt 
Reliable Service 

EAST HAVEN RADIO CO. 
E. G. CURRY Phone 4-3084 

J a n u a r y 
C L E A R A N C E 

S a l e 
Says ROY SPENCER o-f East Haven 

Men's 
Topcoats and Overcoats 

These coats are wortli more—it cnii be seen in their 
.smart tailoring. . .in that imlcfniable "quality feel" 
of the fabric: . . and in their distinelive styling. 

$2975 $3475 
Beg:, to $35.00 Eegr. to $42.60 

L O N G ' S 
'THE STOKE OP FEJENDLY 

SERVICE" 

61 Ohuroh Street New Haven 

ELM CITY CLOTHES 
Tailored fo Your Measure 

and Ready,Made Suits 
TOPCOATS - OVERCOATS - PANTS 

Cleaning — Pressing — Repairing 
Bill Paugno of East Haven, Proprietor 

Store Open 8 A.M. to 8 P.M. 

449 State Street Phone 6-6655 Nevir Haven 
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Folk); .say lliat Main street i.s In 
pretty,bad condition with big boles 
in the concrete pavement and ruts 
and ridges In the part of the lilgli-
way around the trolley .tracks. I 
tooli a walk out along West Main 
street toward the New Haven line 
the other day and from llie looks 
of the way thepapcmcnt Is shot to 
pieces the folks who have been 
talking about a bad condition . of 
the ro&d are being quite temperate 
In thcli'. description of it. Il'.s been 
patched plenty by tlic looks of 
tilings out there beyond Charter 
Oak avenue but the patches have 
come ,locr:j and ain't doing much 

, good new. People that drive along 
Main street must cuss the pave­
ment plenty tlie way it raLscs iiob 

POST OFFICE SCHEDULE 

East Haven Branch 
John Murphy, Superintendent 

MAILS 
Received Dispatched 
6:60A.M. 7:10 A.M. 
11:30 A. M. > V 11:30 A. M. 
1:30 P.M. 1:40 P. M. 
0:15 P. M. 0:30 P. M. 

WINDOW SERVICE 
Money Orders 8'A.M. to 5:45 P.M. 
Registry 7:30 A.M. to G:30 P.M. 
Stamps, Gcrieral Delivery and 

Parcel post • 7:30', A.M. to 7 P.M; 
Saturday olllce closes 3 P.M. 

Art's Deluxe 
Cleaners 

CLEANING . PRESSING 
REPAIRING 

ALTERATIONS 
Von will nntic'c (lio ilifforenco] 

ill iiur modern eUniniii 
iiu'lliodn 

2 to 3 Days Service 

IDur Desire is Satisfied Patrons' 

MG JMain St. East Haven' 

with tiros and tires don't grow on 
bushes these days. Of course folks 
don't have to drive out Main street 
to go to New Haven. The new cut-
oir is easier on the tires. .But still 
there are lots of folks who have 'to 
use Main street and 4hey will con­
tinue to do so tor a long time to 
come being as that is ' tho main 
approach to our center. I asked 
somebody how come tho state let's 
tho road get in such bad condition 
and then I learn all of a sudden 
that Main street ain't a state road 
anymore. Gosh now that's news,to 
mo and it looks like it's going to be 
a headache to the town oflieials to 
have this road on their hands. I 
always thought Main street was a 
part of Route 1 of the national 
highway system but it seems now 
that when the cut-olT was built or 
a couple of years later the Hart­
ford folk decided they didn't want 
Main street anymore and turned it 
ever to the town. Now I don't know 
hov/ that happened. Certainly no­
body .shouted about it at the time 
and 1 wonder it it's too late now 
for our Representatives who are 
taking care ot our problems up in 
Hartford to do sonicthlng about it. 

General Knox 

WEDDING BELLS 

ASTON-ATWOOD 
Miss Ruth Elizabeth Atwood, 

,spcclallst 3-cW, stationed at Ot-
tuma, Iowa, daughter of Mr, and 
Xvlrs. Parker AtwOod of Bradley ave­
nue, and MMM, 1-c Jolm F. Aston 
of Guilfoicl were united In mar-

.rlagc Wednesday afternoon at 4 
I P.M. in the Old Stone church with 
the pastor, Rev. William G. West 
performing the ceremony. A re­
ception followed in tlie parish 
house. 

The couple lias a large circle of 
friends who wish them happiness 
for the future. 

Armed Forces 

^iWtMMWM rttifWffliWTff'W""^*'^ 

VOSS-McGUIRE 
The wedding ot Miss Cecelia Ger­

trude McGulro, daughter ot Mr. 
and Mrs. Thomas J. McGuire ot 
Dodge avenue, look place Saturday 
morning at 11 o'clock In St, Vin­
cent de Paul's church. Miss Mc­
Guire wa.'j married to Stall Sgt. 

CONSERVE FUEL 
lilvory user at coal or culio. .should strive to keep 
witliiii 87'/j percent oC Uieir normal r(H|nire-
monts."Beyond' that a, govcnnneiit roguhition says 
thati.dpjilcvs nnist-dcliYeria substitutcri'u.el, wlii^li, 
i.s rciiliiiiiu'd RoUe or sol't coiil. 

• COAL 
287 Main St. 

KOPPERS COKE ~ FUEL OILS 

Plione 4-2359 East Haven' 

Household Needs 
of all kinds 

Come in and see our surprisingly 
larg'e assortment of everyday 

necessities. 

East Haven 
5 Si 10 Cent Store 

263 Main St. (Next to Holoomlse's) East Haven 

ome Here for a 
Satisfying Meal 

. WE'RE FAMOUS POE FOOD 
•well served ajid prepared. Foods 
moderately 'priced but of«the best 
qunlity compose our menus. There 
is something to please the •whole 
family. 

Open 'til JUdni^lit 

East Haven Diner 
Miilii .St. at ICirklium Avenue 

Eiist Ifiiven • 

A most interesting letter and ac­
companying service newspaper, 
'The Scotlan" reached mo from 
WILLIAM F. BUTLER '40, Yeoman 
2-c this past 'ivcck, BILL as sta­
tioned at the Naval'Supply Depot 
in Scotia, New York and is able to 
have his wife and baby alqng with 
him. He says he works eight ho.iu'S 
a day and has the rest of tho time 
at home. BILL is working In tho 
Personal Eflects Distribution Center 
It is his duty to sort the holonglngs 
of men lost at sea. and to rcturli 
them to the neareiit of kin with an 
accompanying letter. BILL says if 
we people at home could know the 
heartbreaks parents go through 
when news reaches them from this 
ceiiter, there would be no need of 
extra pushing to put War Loan 
Drives,- Red Cross drives, etc., over 
the top. • 

RAOUL MOLLEUR S 1-c '44 has 
seen much service. He trained at 
Sampson, N.Y., and from boot 
camp went to Hart's Island from 
whore he shipped to Scoltand and 
then to England on an L.S.T. car­
rying materiel. RAOUL has inade 
47 lrlp.s from England to France 
and is now home after nine months 
foreign service. Ho Is on a twenty-
three'day leave after which he will 
report to Norfolk, Va., 'When 
RAOUL visited the school he had 
with him hisfflend S 1-c FRANCIS 
MASCOLA of Derby, Conn, who 
went through training and experi­
ences with him. 

ANDREW SALVO '42 visited the 
school recently. ANDREW took his 
basic training at Shepard Picld, 
Texas from which point he went to 
Chaniite Field, III., for Weather 
School. He received nloro training 
at Geigcr Field, Wash., and at 
Buckley Field, Colo., he took train­
ing fr Artie Regions. At tho prci 
ont time he is studying in the Held 
ot Photography at Shepard's Field, 
Texas. 
, CHARLES HOLBROOK 'h. is at 
tlie present time in England; He 
entered the service of the Army In 
1043 having finished part of his col­
lege course at the University , of 
Alabama. CHARL'ES took basic 
training at Camp bevcns and from 
there wont to Fort McClellan in 
Alabama where he was trained tor 
tile infantry. During his training 
he broke a record in shooting and 
was rated an expert rifleman. Fin­
ishing his training at Fort McClel­
lan, CHARLES went, to the Uni­
versity ot Illinois under/the ASTP 
to study Mechanical Engineering 
and was there untll'thls course 'vvas 
abolished. 
, JOHN LIEDKE "'39 took ba.slc 
training at Fort Riley, Kansas, 
From there he went to South'Caro­
lina in the Infantry and then on to 
Mississippi for further training. He 
was sent from there to an embark­
ation point in New York and Is now 
in France where he has been stay­
ing in a building once occupied by 
the Germans. 

CPL. JUSTIN FAIRCHILD '40 
took basic training at Shepard 
Field, Texas and then went to the 
Norlli American Aviation Factory 
School in Englewood, Calif., where 
they produce B-25 Bombers. He 
was graduated from this school as 
a Hydraulic Specialist and accin-
panled a B-25 Bomber to difteront 
fields until it was prepared for its 
destination. After a short furlough 
at:home JUSTIN went to various 
camps in the country until he was 
sent overseas; first to New Guinea 
and more recently to. Leyte where 
he is servicing bombers. 

SGT-. KENNETH FLYNN '39 took 
basic training at Keesler Field, 
Miss., and then went to Pawling, 
N.Y. tor further training. After 
further work at Jelferson Barracks. 
Mo., he was sent across to North 
Africa. KENNETH has seen duty in 
Corsica, Italy and Sicily. At the 
present time he Is In Italy con­
nected with the Air Corps. 

The following servicemen have 
visited the school during the past 
week: Andrew Salvo, Thomas Fris-
coe, Raoul Molleur, Edv/ard Carey, 
Eugene "Cliick" DeFillppo and 
FrancLs Mascola, Derby. 

Qiff Of Books 
In Memory Of 
Mrs. L. Fowler 

Relatives and friends ot the late 
Mrs. Mary Lavinla Fowler, wife of 
Mr. Leon Fowler .of Park place, 
have presented to the Hagaman 
Library money tor books as a me­
morial to Mrs. Fowler, 

Several titles 'and types of books 
were considered; |)ut when the don­
ors learned llTat -our cdllecllon ot 
Shakespeare's iplnys, were In poor 
condition, theyj qgrced with our 
suggestion th!\t the gift be used to 
purchase a feojvot the plays In an 
attractive cdijjloiv It was thought 
there might be others who would 
wish to conlclbuCe, or. that with 
this as a beginning, some future 
time Iherc'woiild bo other memor­
ial gifts and more titles could bo 
added. 

For many years Mrs, Fowler 
worked In the library or at her 
homo mending books that were 
soiled or torn and so helped to 
keep our books in circulation and 
our shelves neat. She liked to read, 
herself, and wasfalso Interested In 
the young pepplb- growing up 
around her. ,i'hls gracious and 
thoughtful gitl 1̂  a particularly 
nttlng memorial'to Mrs. Fowler. 

At present tho donors wish to 
remain anonymous but the Board 
of Directors arc most grateful for 
this very useful addition to our 
book collection. 

Beth Taylor, Librarian 

FUNERAL HOME HERE 
HAS A NEVy NAME 

Announcement Is made In anoth­
er column this week of " the East 
Haven Memorial Funeral Home 
which was formerly Longobardl S: 
Son, situated at 425 Main Street. 
Salvatore Longobardl will be In sole 
charge of the local Funeral Home 
and is prepared to provide helpful, 
capable and etticiont service. 

DO YOUR SHOPPING 
at 

Wel-Worih 
5&10 

Vehtlliitor Covers 
Enamel ,-'WftrOi5T-7 Oil Olotli 

jSfo'w i n 
Large Assortment of 

VALENTINES 
Bornnrd Sacks, I'roi). 

'a\. Slain .Street 

Annual Report 
Shows Progress 
Of Health Ass'n. 

The work ot the Public Health 
Nursing Association of East Haven 
has progressed satlstaotorlly dur­
ing the pi\st year. Our two nurses. 
Miss Eleanor Knight, .Senior Nurse 
and Miss Lois Wilson, Junior Nurse, 
have performed their duties ade­
quately and with lnt?;'cst. 

Tho collections ot. nursing fees 
have shown a marked Increase and 
we feel Ihat this Is duo to the good 
siilrll and business ability ot pur 
force. 

During the past year a nurse has 
been cmi)lQycd by tho school sys­
tem ot East Haven so that , our 
nurses have been relieved ot duties 
in connection with the schools al­
though they still cooijcrate with 
Miss Florence Leeds Parker, the 
School Nurse', whenever their serv­
ices arc needed, Tho beds received 
by the Nursing Association ' from 
the local Rotary Club have boon 
used frequently mid fill a need in 
the conimunity.. 

The ambulance has been used 
more frequently during- this past 
year and our nurses have super­
vised the changing ot tho linen 
and general conditioning ot the 
interior of the vehicle. It was sug­
gested tha t the by-laws.of the as­
sociation be revised and depart­
ment chairmeii are still working on 
the revision. 

During the year wo have been 
Informed by the John Hancock Co. 
and the Metropolitan Company 
that the fee for baby visits was to 
be raised from twenty five to fifty 
cents. 

Members of tho association have 
taken an active and interested 
part In the work and during lire 
past year hove shownby an atten­
dance ot 85 percent that they fool 
the responsibility of their position 
as board members, 

Elizabeth M. Pagerstroiii, 
. Secretary 

(hitlcs at tho Town Hall,' This is 
where U.S. and British journalism 
parts company, for 'such a' parn-
gi'aph If It appeared In the Chron­
icle and Echo at all would assured­
ly read 'on holiday'. News of a ilre, 
tucked away lii 'Town Topics' Is 
inlrlgulngly snappy. It roads; 'That 
lire alarm blast which woke aa 
many folk at midnight Siuninoncd 
the flre laddies to where a mat­
tress caught flro In Fred Williams' 
house'. That^s nlli' "• , 

Tho British editor concludes his 
comments with the sentiment that 
tho'dally'round, though dlrtcrcnt-
ly expressed. Is much the same on 
both sides of the Atlantic, "ra­
tioning and dim-out excepted." 

Hear ye! Hear ye! 
Under this heading n weekly 

market place Is alTordcd nil who 
have wants ot one kind or another. 
The cost Is 10 cents a line, ~ three 
lines 25 cents. Minimum charge 25 
cents. Advertisements must be re­
ceived before 0 P.M, Wednesday, 
Phono 4-2607, 
liOR RENT-amall hall In East 
•Haven for wedding parties and 
. socials, call 4-2922. 

•WOMAN will take care of children 
•during day In her own home. 
Phone 4-1947, 12 George street, 

WANTED 3 or 4 rooms near center, 
ImprovementSj Reasonable rent. 
Phono 7-0803. 

Phono 4-3410 

Raymond Fowler 
PainHng — Paper Hanging 

Decora'fmg 

•WE ARE AVAILABLE NOW, 

OUR PRICES ARE REASONABLE 

•It) li'ari'on Avenue ' New Haven ' 

WE ARE CLOSING OUT 

OUR STOCK OF VERY 

PRETTY 1945 CALENDARS 

NOW AT HALF PRICE 

The Gift Shop 
4-1730 

240 Main .St. East Haven 

immmmmmmm^m^m 
Francis Calvin 'Voss, son of Mr, 
and Mrs. Stephen Voss of McAdoo, 
Pa., with .Rev. Father Joseph 
Buckley officiating, and Father 
John Wigh and Father Edward 
Curtin of St. Peters Church assist­
ing. 

Central Cleaners 
CLEANING • REPAIRING 

ALTERING 

2 - 3 DAY SERVICE 

PRESSING WHILE 

YOU WAIT 

;!32 Jiaiu St. Knsl Haven 

The Old Reliable 

C. A. J. Poirot 
& Sons 

PROMPT BEnVIOE 

Plumbing', Heating and Tinning 
035 Oliarol 81., Now Ilavou 0-2821! 
400 Bradloy St., East Haven 4-ir,;)7 

Popular New 
.IN[o\?;els, On List 

iVf The Library 
A list oir now books recently 

added to the Hagaman Memorial 
Library Is announced by Miss Beth 
Taylor, Librarian as follow,";.' ' 

Fiction—Anna and the King of 
Slam, Landon; Building of Jalna, 
De la Roche; By 'Valour and Arms, 
Street; Clurty Brown, Sharp; Coun­
try Neighborhood, Coatsworth; 
Earth and High Heaven, Graham; 
E.scape from Konlgsteln, Anony­
mous; Forever Amber, 'WIn.sbr; 
Freedom Road, Fast; Orecn Dol­
phin street, Goudge; Green year,s, 
Cronln; ImmortalWIfe, Stene;, Le­
banon, Miller; Rldln' the Rainbow, 
Tayldr; Some of my Best Friends 
are Soldiers, Halsey; Young 'Un, 
Best; Being Met Together, Wllklns. 

Non-fiction—Air Gunner, Hut-
ton; America Jfrillmlted, Johnston; 
Curtain Rl.seS; Reynolds; Damned 
to Glory, Scott; Flying Leather­
necks, Hubier; Invasion Diary, Tre-
gaskls; McGraw of the Giants, 
Graham; None-.but a Mule, Wooll-
iotl; One Damned Thing After An­
other, Trcanor; Primer of Ameri­
can Antiques, Dreppard; Rise to 
Follow, Spalding; Smarter and 
"Smoother, Daly; Timeless Mexico, 
Strode; Traveler from Tokyo, Mor^ 
rls; Under, a Lucky Star, Andrews; 
U. S, War Aims, LIppmann; We 
Live in Alaska, Helmerlcks; World 
of Waiihlngton Irving, Brooks; 
Yankees Were Like This, Holton. 

The, above does irot Includc'many 
mysteries, v/csterns, light romance.') 
and children's books recently addr 
ed. 

East Haven 
Cleaners 

12 Years On Main Street 

[Tailoring - Repairing] 
Dyeing 

Shoe Repairing 
Phone 4-1109 

I Main St. Bast Haven] 

British Editor 
Enjoyed'Reading 
East Haven News 
Mr. W. Cowper Barrens, editor ot 

the Chronicle and Eoljo of North­
ampton, England, got quite a "kick" 
out of reading the EAST HAVEN 
NEWS, a copy of which reached his 
desk recently. In his publication 
for Dec. 7 he notes "Quite.a lot of 
space Is given over to 'Town Topr 
Ics' and evidently the good people 
o£ East Haven have a 'Monday 
night at 8' all to themselves for the 
first paragraph announces crypti­
cally: 'Annual Town Meeting Mon­
day at 8 P.M. at Town Hall." One 
delightful 'potted par'. Informa the 
public that 'MLss Emma Tucker is 
enjoying autumn vacation from 

P ^ 

Plen+y of Gandy 

Oyor one thousand pounds 

of Oliooolate.'i on Sale 

lioro no'W, 

From $1.10 
•one-pound box 

METCALF'S DRUG STORE 

j Keep your 

J -^/Car Happy 
ilavo it ..serv­
iced liiu'C and 
it will Hint! 
thriiugli tlie ice 
and snow. 

Open initil 9 p.m. 
I'or vmir coiivpnience 

Bill's Sunoco Service Station 
388 Main St., cor. Gerrish Ave. East Haven 

, ANNOUNCING THE 

EAST HAVEN MEMORIAL 
FUNERAL HOME 

(Formerly Longohardi & Son) 

425 MAIN STREET 

Salvatoro Longohardi Tel.'4-1708 

Put Your . 

Best Face Forward! 

January seems to bo the month of 
a general "let-down." Don't let 
your hair look drab aJid uninter­
esting. Now that Christmas is over 
come in and let us advise you on 
that new permanent. 

Priced at 

$7.50 to $15.00 

MARCELLE'S 
BEAUTY SALON -; 

OPHKA'rEI) Uy DELL TREMBLAY 

242 MflJn Street. Tel. 4-3248 East Haven 

After the liolidnys we can 
turn our ultention to tho iu-
cidenliils we need i'or our-
Hĉ .vcK. Come In and see our 
complete lino ol; lingerie, 
awentovs, hobby socits, etc 

FLORA SHERMAN 
"<- idZ^-^ 

'*^1'4'fM.-VJ.-4&>J3ft3-*piS^-*-''' 
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NON-SECRET WEAPON! .'. By COLLIER 

nap^hvU 
^ JAMES PRESTOH 

Many slgn.s portend a series of 
ilashcs bewleen New Dealers and 
;he new Congie.ss 

I I is appraised as bu.slnc.ss-mlnd-
.d. ConsorvaUvcs will hold key 
posts. New Deal schemes for more 
Jbclal and economic "reforms" will 
liid tough g6lnB,... 

New Dealers In the administra­
tion nevertheless con.slder the No­
vember election results anothci 
mandate for ,carrying out Presi­
dent Roosevelt's domestic as well a.s 
his foreign policy. Since the nation 
Is "job-mlndcd'*, adherents of the 
various brands of; New Deal philo­
sophies ai'e concentrating on the. 
President's, program for 00,000,000 
Jobs '. 

Planners will tie their reform 
proposals to .schemes for "aiding" 
private Industry to furnish these 
Jobs. A sort of peacetime War Pro­
duction Board Is being discussed. 
Some say the Office of Price Ad­
ministration might be made a per­
manent agency 

Congressional leaders, on the 
other hand, are more Interested In 
reducing taxes than In setting up 
new bureaucracies. Chairman 
George of the Spnato Finance Com­
mittee says t ax rates on both cor­
porate and Individual Incomes can 
be cut If the end of the war In 
Europe appears In sight this year.... 

.Manufapturers of farm machin­
ery hope to turn out equipment 
sized aiid priced to a t t rac t small 
farm operators. A House sub-com­
mittee was told t h a t such machines 

would inci-ease farm earnings.; 
Checking up on what skilled air­

plane workers, shipbuilders, etc., 
have been doing since Induction 
Into the armed Services, the Mead 
Senate War Investigating Commit­
tee; found tha t ; of all things, some 
are buglers, others typists, military 
police,, or ct^rpenters! 

OPINIONS 

Comment and Criticism 
Local Interest from 

Various Publications 

ol 

W I L L F R E E D O M S U R V I V E 

VIOTORY 

Aunll ier year of! wni' Juis d r a w n 

to n oloSe. Vohimcs of . rhalor io 

will lie wri t ten iihout tlie 'awful 

clcstruetion ot t l ie past twelve' 

months . Puny efforts will be 
made to dosoribo llm Hunioriitg ol 
tlie men of tlio a rmed forces, who 
face dea th diiy af ter day,, yea r 
after year, fur from ,lipnip. and 
loved ones. Aetiinlly, (lioro a re no 
words that . flan-.adequately' sum 
up 19fl4, the moat-critiejil y e a r in 

.. Amer ican history. , 
Tlie astoundiiig,;. tiling aliout 

the home front is the fact t l ia t ox-
oopt for the famiifios of service 
men, i t lives imrmnl ly and lias no 
conception- of t h e ' h o r r o r s of war . 
Cgmmuniques f r pm , A'Vashingtqn 
on. tl\e pr ice o f ' t o i l e t ' pape r or 
some, other trivijil ' i tem fill coutit-
less cqUimiiR, in , l l ie pveSH. Social 

, secur i ty p lanni i ig , . ,i"i;u"il!'',,. em-
pioyrnent a n d - d i M y talk; of a oon-

, tontqtj poijtwnr world, - \vith all 
the worr ies aRauiiipfl by n hciievo 
len t eqvernineiit,^'UriHO f rom, the 
Americai i scene Ijlco a haze from 
n ' : swamp. Clenr, -tinqualitfed 
t h o u g h t on, tho'^pubjeet of person-
a( freedom, is a lmost tolHlly.lacIt-' 

• i n g : ; :, • .-

;As the . w a r i n o y c s on, coun t ry 
aftci' country sees . t i le .spectre ot 
oppresfiiqn aiid griveriiinont tiy 
smal l , cliquesiiooin^ larger and 
d a r k e r over the,world, The United 
S la tes is no except ion to this 
t r end . Much of oui ' .pos twar pjun-
n lug is a. crazy mijcture of -indi­
vidual , i h i t i a t i vo i ind bureaucrat ic 
patcrnaliRm.-The conflict between 

' thone who believe in state social­
ism And would lihvo the govcrri-

j a tpnt t ake oyer ^as io industr ies , 
a j jd t J iosc who believe in t h e su-
pf i ior i ty of pr iva te ly owned en­
terprise, has led to rush promisps. 
Many on both sides apparent ly 
hflieve that the crux (it the issue 
is a full stomach, with the resu l t 
tlipt a material va),iifi has been p u t 
on freedom. Eacli-sidK has s t r iven 
to outpromise the other until it 
}iiis become r a n k - h e r e s y to' sug 
gelst ' that there m a y at t imes be 

, ,lctiii going in the future. 
'Mjllions : expect government to 

fuyi)isli tlioin job.s, to guaran tee 
penectime prices, to protect them 
f r ,p^ itlie insecur i ty of competi­
tion. They should, remember that 
the more they a s k of governnieiil , 
t he less freedom they will liave. 
^f government ends by owning 
mos t of industry, anc^ employing 
mos t of the people ns .well as reg­
u la t ing the lives of the roniuinder 
freodoni. will become a mockery. 
As Rober t -S: Henry, eminent 
wr i t e r and historinn( observes : 

. f 'The r ight -of nonconformity is |eonl 'ormiiig forces of the coUee-
uUi ina to ly ' the m o s t ' i m p o r t a n t of . t i i ' i s t s t a l e . " 
liiimau rights, b u t ' I doubt if it | Our people could lose pvery-
can long exist i independent ly of^thing of material value as , the 
tlie r i g h t of pvivnte, p roper ty . Af- price of victory in this w a r ' a n d 
'tor a l l , . t l ie mitn Wlin owns nolh- stiil have a br ight fu ture . How-
jng, and has h o , h o p e of owning 'ever, let too . much government 
(liiytliihg for liimself, ;is u n d e r i| destroy tho I'roodom and hope of 
ter|riblo hand icap ' i i i express ing the individual to build aga in and 
ui i t rammeled indi.vidiiality. l i e ' iR | thp ' r e is no future ."The r ight of 
•Cvjthout a p l ace ' fo r " J i i s . foot to o w n e j ^ ^ s .more importa-nt 'Uian 
sliiiid upon, in opposition to the owj iu j s^^y ' t i e i r . '̂  • "" " ' ' ' 

' '• • • ' I- , / 

WHY NOT CHANGE? 

By Ruth Taylor 
The other day a m a n I've known 

for a long t ime was urging me to 
cut my hair . I said, "Oh, no. X 
wouldn't , look like me." He repUed 
with some h e a t : "Nonsense, Ruth , 
the trouble with you is you've 
looked "at yoiir own face the way 
it Is too long!" 

•ifou know, there's a-lot of horse 
sense In t h a t remark. We're afraid 
to change even our expression for 
fear we \won ' t be recognizable to 
ourselves. W h a t If we aren ' t? 
There 's always room for Improve­
m e n t . ; I 

We are the same way about our 
Ideas. Just because an Idea was 
right once, doesn't mean It Is a l ­
ways going to be r ight . Circum­
stances alter, and our Ideas must 
keep pace with them. If we keep to 
the r ight Ideals, we can. afford to 
change our- Ideas—our methods for 
bringing Into being our,.ldeals. 

oven wear our faces the .same way 
again. 

Don't be afraid of what Is new. 
You've scne your own face the way 
it is too long. There 's adventure in 
the untried—you may like the new 
better , t han the old. Why always 
assume change Is for the.worst . I t 
never has been for long. 

Our fears for the future can bo 
dispelled if we meet these fears 
foldly, with high hearts , with u n ­
faltering faith in the principles of 
freedom, and. with the courage tha t 
Is given to tho.se wh0( are true fol­
lowers of the democratic Ideal. 

What applies to the Individual 
also applied to the nat ion. Rcdvers 
Opic, Counsellor of the British Em­
bassy phrased i t in a homely meta ­
phor, when he said: ,','Each country 
mtist not only keep-r I ts house In 
order, but niust be vvllllng to 
change the furniture." I t may take 
a little while to get:used to the 
new arrangement , biit there Is no 

CHURCH SCHOOL ITEMS 

T,OKEN TRICKERY 
' (East Hartford Gazette) •• 
Not many days ago t'̂ "! American 

housbvvlvoswero handed a new de­
cree by the Office' ot Price Admln-
IStratlpii. 11110)? were .told t h a t all 
a t once most of their carefully 
savbd token^ had been cancelled. 

The announcement also named 
certain speoifled • tokens as being 
valid Indefinitely. Tlic mat ter 
come down to the point whether 
some ot tlie OPA bigwigs know the 
moaiilng of the wotd Indfeflnltely. 

The cancelled tokens were ot tho 
kind which had previously been 
declared " y a l l d Indefinitely." I t Is 
therefore entirely possible t h a t we 
may hear next, week or next month 
tha t again the good tokens have 
become bad tokens. In other words 
the pronfil'se of indeflnlto validity 
cannot be taken as binding. 

This ruling has done more to 
shake confidence of the average 
Citizen In the polltlclanis who have 
been appointed to adnilnister this 
branch of government t h a n any­
thing ,wo have experienced yet. 

Distrust has Increased about the 
whole ruling. There will be no sav­
ing of points any more as the feel­
ing has been created t h a t these 
points may be declared valueless 
overnight. 

The ones who are favored are 
the black market profiteers. Wlieve 
up to now the thrifty housewives 
had . wisely saved their points for 
possible Increases of point values 
of certain scarce articles, they are 
now being steered directly into the 
black market . The legal tender 
they had saved has been taken 
away from them. 

The token as such represented a 
legal ' share In - the food supply 
stores of the latlon. Hoarding un ­
der the ration system was Impossi­
ble as the point value of articles 
of food remained flexible. The fact 
t ha t so many - housewives were 
caught with m a n y unused tokens 
Is adequate proof of the patriotic 
a t t i tude of the average citizen by 
not hoarding food while he had the 
tokens to do so. 
' The whole ruling smells ot In­

competency and a lack of sense of 
fairness! If those of our ecbnomic 
stabilization program were unable 
to foresee sudden shortages of 
available produce they should be 
replaced by more competent ad­
ministrators. Tho edict ot cancel-
l a t l o n ' h a s rightfully shaken the 
faith of millions ot good Ameri­
cans, 

w e are coming to a t ime w h i c h . f ^'f" why- i t can ' t be more com-
wlll. require initiative a n ^ adapta-1 f" ' ' ' ' 'b <= the new way. We surely 
blllty.from all of us; The end of thep^»Ye learned wha t , tq avoid, 
w a r w l l l call upon all t h e grit we O"' ' o u m o d e d . Isolationism: our 
have. WO,wlir have to p r b v e ' ' t h a t , = f ^ ' ^ f indifference,., to . bonfires 
Wo.pah keep _up jv l t l i ' tlip,' t imes. 
Nothing will ever "be qultfi^the'same 
as It was. 'We must agal j i 'be pion­
eers—-as wq have ' had t 8 ' bo after 
every'war. We will h a v e ' t b develop 
new work and pew skllii- ' ivo can ' t 

abroad until t hey th rea ten our own 
house; the prejudices,,and hatreds, 
towards those who differ from Us In 
class, creed ,or color-4whlch preju­
dices are a heri tage ot the days 
when a s t ranger was an enemy be ­
fore the annihilat ion, of time and 
space drew the woyld togetherf 
our ,wlthdrawal from, our neigh­
bor's problems, our selt-absorptlon 

all a re the th ings we mus t leave 
behind us. We must., revamp our 
thoughts as readily, a^ we must r e ­
vamp ourselves. ... 

Dqp't wear your, face the same 
way too long, 

JOIN THE 

MARCH 

of DIMES 

JANUARY 14-31 

Last.summer America experi­
enced the second worst epi­
demic of infantile paralysis In 
its history. 

• '• •' 

The disease attacked weak and 
strong alike, invading the rich­
er! and poorest homes in the' 
nation. 

• ;• '• 

Your dimes and dollars, sup­
porting The National Foun-
cfaflon for Infantile Paral­
ysis/made It possible to render 
expert care and treatment to 
all polio victims, regardless of 
age, race, creed or color. 

Many of these thousands of 
new victims will need care for 
months, years, some perhaps 
for a lifetime. 

Nejct summer America must be 
prepared to meet whatever 
epidemic emergencies may 
arise. 

Here And There 
At E. H. High 

By "M.G." 

The members of the Senior Oc­
cupation classes will have as their 
guest speaker on Thursday morn­
ing, Jesse C. Neff, Associate P ro ­
fessor ot Psychology of t h e S ta te 
Teachers College of -New Haven. 
The Juniors- will" bo? the special 
guests of the Senlors^and will hea r 
Mr. Neff explain the) requirements 
and advantages of a ' S ta te Teach­
ers College training, r-

A special course in Heal th will be 
Included for all Freshmen mem­
bers of the. General Science classes 
a t the High School. Miss Florence 
Leeds Parker, R.N., School Nurse, 
will frm time to time hold discus­
sions about Health with these 
classes. , 

The High School Varsity basket­
ball team will play agains t Hop­
kins Grammar School on Wednes­
day evening a n d ' Shel tbn High 
School on Friday evenlngi 

As a result ot the swimming 
meet a t the Y.W.C.A; Pool on Dec. 
22, Marilyn Swanson, Maryanne 
Dooley and Betty Hogan have been 
asked to participate- h-i the water 
show a t Yale University on Sa tur ­
day, J anua ry 13th. : 

Miss Barbara Klein has merited 
the position ot Captain of the new­
ly organized Girls basketball team. 
Miss Rita Fiondella Is manager. 

Of Interest is the exhibition case 
in the school library containing 
Bead Work from Lcyte and brace­
lets from New Guinea. I t Is Inter-

The boys of the Old Stone church 
who are known at the Y as the 
East Haven Congos, were awarded 
the game on Sa turday night by a 
forfeit, from Plymouth Congrega­
tional Church. They will play St. 
Lukes' P. E. this Saturday night. 

The Silver Class In Public Speak­
ing, which is a feature of the Sen­
ior Depar tment of the Old Stone 
Church, win again compete for the 
Silver Medal in Oratory, a t tho 
Church, next Sunday evening a t 
5:00 o'clock. The contestants a re 
Alice Ayr, Jessie Hewitt, Carol Lec-
per, and William Kennerson of 
Stone Church; Barbara Oskins of 
s a i n t James, and Ruth Benham of 
Shor t Beach Chapel. MLss Eleanor 
Poulton of Shor t Beach Road will 
deliver a short address. Wm. G a l ­
ling the a.ssoclalc pastor will con­
duct the exercLses, the soloists for 
the musical p a r t of the program 
will be. Miss Evelyn Lewis, soprano, 
Eleanor Poulton, contralto, and 
Frank Tarbell, baritone. 

The service will open with a 
Hymn Sing conducted by Miss 
Lewis and the contestants , with 
Mr. Brlnley a t the Piano. 

Lovers of Gospel Singing a re 
looking forward to a special t rea t , 
Sunday evening, January 28, when 
the Swedish Salvatlgn: Army, with 
their String Orchestra, will visit a t 
Ave o'clock, and furnish the mus i ­
cal par t of tho service, thl.s Gos­
pel Sing will be held in connection 
with the Gold Medal Contest in 
Oratory which our Young folks a re 
put t ing on. The contestants sched­
uled t o compete on t h a t occasion, 
arc Eunice Sherman, Eleanor 
Poulton, Carlene Potter, Muriel 
Andrews, Clifford DeWolf, Jr., and 
Robert Florlan. H.W.B. 

Masons Attend 
Supper Session 
Of Men's Group 

Rev. Philip Kierstead ot North 
Haven and David North both m e m ­
bers of Corinthian, Masonic Lodge 
were thespoakers a t the J a n u a r y 
supper meeting of. the Men's club 
of t h e Stone Church Tuesday a t a 
"Masonic Night" program to which 
members of Momauguin Lodge had 
been invited. More t h a n 90 men 
sat down to the delicious meal 
served by the Ever Ready Group 
under the direction ot Mrs. Joseph 
Holt and afterward heard the fine 
talks by the guest speakers who 
told ot the impor tant pa r t mason­
ry plays In the lives,of so many i n ­
dividuals. President, Bernard K e n ­
nerson Introduced,Mr. North and 
Rev. William G. • West; presented 
Rev. Mr. Kierstead. William Hasse 
sang two solos accompanied a t the 
piano by Mrs. Hasse. 

A meeting of the executive and 
en te r ta inment committee will be 

BONDS OVm AMERICA 

Dedicated on April 13, 
1943, on tho 200lh anni­
versary of the birlh of 
Thomas Jcflcrson, this 
stalely memorial stands 
In Washington, D. C , 
directly south of tho 
White House, mirrored 
In the Tidal I3asln. 

Jefferson Memorial 

For a Free America — 
Buy War Bonds 

American men are giv-
ing their lives today 
that the dignity of dem­
ocratic freedom shall 
not be lost to any other 
nation. 

PAOS ITVa 

FAIRMOUNT 
Mrs. Mary Brown suffered a chapel Thursday, J anua ry 18. 

shock last Wednesday night and The mothers ' Club met, Tuesday 
was removed to St. Raphael 's Hos- night in the home of Mrs. c h a p -
pltal where she died Friday with- man and enjoyed a covered dish 
out having regained conscloushess. luncheon at noon, 
Tlie funeral services were ' held 
Monday a t 3 a t Beccher & Ben­
net t ' s . She was one of the older 
members ot St . Andrew's church. 

William Bremner is in St. R a ­
phael 's Hospital following an oper­
at ion. 

Mrs. Ralph Rockwell h a s been 
111 the past week 

The Well Child Conference of 
the Health Depar tment and 'Visit­
ing Nurse association will be held 
Friday a t 1:30 In tho chapel. 

General sanitary inspections in 
the Fairmont section, effective this 
week, are under the dlreclton ot 
Inspector Paul H. Stevens of the 

Miss Etta Powell Is able to be "<=" '* Department, 
.about the house and to go out for At St. Andrew's church Sunday 
I brief walks. ' the pastor, Rev. Dr. John L. Greg-

A beef pie supper will be served ory, will preach a t 11 on the ser-
by the Sunshine Assembly in the mon topic, "Trouble Shooters." 

held Tuesday a t 8 P.M. to plan tor 
the annual "Ladles Night" p ro ­
gram to be held February ..3. 

ROCKWELL BROTHEilS 
MEET IN FRANCE 

REPRESENTATIVES GET 
GOOD ASSIGNMENTS 

Roland and John Rockwell, sons 
ot Mrs. Grace Rockwell ot Laurel Hartford. M^s. - Miller goes to 
street. Anally me t 

Representatives Charlotte Miller 
and Robert H. Gerrish have r e ­
ceived impor tant committee a s ­
signments in the Legislature in 

the 
Cities and Boroughs committee of 

somewhere in ^^j^j^j^ ^ j , ^ ^^^ ^ valued member in 
Francs . Roland, oldest ot the boys t^e last session as one ,of her 
has been overseas for 16 mon ths |signments. 
and John tor twenty months . John ' 
was awarded the Purple Heart , be­
ing Wounded In action In I taly last 
Decernber." -He has ' also' been 
awarded the Combat Medal and 
the Presidential Citation for com­
bat service, in the European Area. 
Roland expressed to his mother , In 
one ot his let ters, t h a t his greatest 
desire next to coming home was to 
meet his brother. John h a s been in 
combat service in Africa, Sicily, 
Italy, France and is now in Ger­
many. Roland Is connected with 
Communication Headquarters and 
has seen service in Africa, I ta ly 
and F r a n c e . Another brother esting to note t h a t women do not . 

wear bead work but the men wear George is also In the Army and is 
„n (1-.= !»,•,»!.... 's tat ioned at Camp Edwards, all the jewelry. 

a s -
'Bob" Gerrish has been 

named to the highly impor tan t 
Roads, Rivers and Bridges 'commit­
tee and the committee on Labor. 

REV. WEST PLANS 

SERIES OF SERMONS 

"Your Personality and your R e ­
ligion" is the subject of a series of 
sermons begun Sunday a t the Old 
Stone church by the minister. Rev. 
William G. West. "What Makes us 
What,.We Are" was t h e topic J a n ­
uary 7. "Bringing Up Our Respon­
sibilities" will be t h o subject S u n ­
day J anua ry 14. The series o n . t h e 
relationship of personality and r e ­
ligion will continue for five weeks. 

DANCING FRIDAY and 

SATURDAY NIGHTS 
at 

pv /icere r CASTH*v£n.coftv. 

THE 4-PILLARS 
East Haven s Newest Pleasure Spot 

(Moniber of New Haven Ito.stuiiraiit Association) 

Featuring Earl Strpng and his Orchestra 

Turkey — Lobster — Steak Dinners 

— Entertainment — . 
No Miniipum — No Cover 

Sunday Dinners 
Tor The 
F a m i l y 

We promise t ha t only tlie very best of foods will be 
served here, j i repared in the mode t h a t wil l 'p lease tho 
most I'astidcous. You real ly owe it to yourseli ' to t r y 

one of o u r special d inners . 

Open E v e r y Day — Courteous Service — Pleasan t Sur round ings 

ON T H E CUT-OFF P H O N E 4-0169 

B a n q u e t s F o r 
All Special 
Occasions 

Qual i ty Liquors 

E A S T H A V E N 

East Haven 
Comnnunity Bowling 

Alleys 
204 M A I N S T R E E T 

F o r Eeservat ions Call 
4-0215 — 4-1441 

CHURCH 

CHURCH OF CHRIST 
Stony Creek 

Rev. Joseph White 
9:45 Church School recruiting a t 

the pastor 's class. 
11:00 Topic of sermon a t morning 

worship "Supporter, Member or 
Otherwise?" 

3:00 Board of Trustees. 
7:00 Pilgrim Fellowship 
Monday—7:30—Jill-a-Teens 
Tuesday evening—Board of Doa-, 

cons. 
Tuesday evening—Young Womdn'a 

Group meets with Mrs. Charlea 
Seastrand. 

T K i N i r r 
Rev. Frederic R. Murray, rector 

Montowese Street 
2nd StJNDAY AFTER EPIPHANY 
8:45 Holy Communion 
10:45 Morning Prayer, service and 

Church School. 
0:30 Young Peoples Fellowship 

A covered dish supper at 0:30 in 
the Parish House will precede the 
annual , meeting ot the Parish a t 
8 o'clock Friday night. 

Trlfolium meets January 17 with 
Mrs. Carl Montelius, hostess at the 
home ot her mother, Mrs. Irwin 
Morton. 

CONGREGA'riONAL 
Rev. Matthew Maddei\ 
The Manse, Rogers St. 

William H. Kirkland, s tudent as­
sistant win preach Sunday, using 
for his subject, "You Cannot Turn 
Back." 
9:30 Church School. 
10:45 Morning Worship 
7:15 Chrlstion Fellowship 
Tuesdays, 3:30, Girl Scouts, 27 
Wednesdays, 11:00 Comfortable 

Society Red Cross Sewing. 
Wednesday evenings. Boy Scouts, 2 
Thursdays, 3:15, Brownies; 7:00 

Girl Scouts 18. 
Fridays 3:30, Junior Choir; 0:30 In­

termediate Choir; 7:45 Senior 
Choir. 

ST. STEPHENS A.M.E. ZION 
' Rev. L. S. Sykes, Pastor 

10:45 Morning Worship 
12:45 Sunday School 
8:00 Evening Worship, 

ST MARY'S 
Masses on Sunday will be a t 7:30 

9 and 10:30 o'clock. 

CHRISTIAN SCIENCE SERVICES 
"Sacrament" will be the subject 

of the Lesson-Sermon for Sunday, 
January 14th. 

The Golden Text Is from John 
4:23. "The hour confeth, and now 
is, when the true worshippers shall 
worship the Father in spirit and in 
t ru th : for the Fatl ier seeketh such 
to worship him." 

Selections from the Bible include 
the following: "Let the words of 
my mouth, and t h e medi ta t ion of 

TABOR LUTHERAN CHURCH 
9:30 Cliurch School. 
10:30 Morning Service 

On the last Sunday ot the month 
the services are held In Swedish. 

Rev. 

FIKST BAPl'IST. 
A.,W. Jones. Pastor 
Roger.s Street 

10:00 Church School 
11:00 Moi-ning Service, Junior 

Church, Nursery Hour. 
7:30 Young Peoples Society 
7:45 Tuesdays, Fellowship 
All Day Thursdays, Red Cross 

Red Cross . 
Continued /roHi page one 

Financial Assistance—giving bas ­
ic maintenance to families when 
allowances are delayed, and to vet­
erans when applications for gov­
ernment benefits Is pending. We 
also make loans occasionally for 
special needs, and we are now the 
sole agency through^whlch families 
of active servicemen may apply tor 
loans and grants from Army Emer­
gency Relief. 

It Is impossible to say Just which 
of these above services has been 
most used "in the past year, since 
most families have requlied a t 
least two. However the need for fi­
nancial assistance would certainly 
come a t the bottom ot the list. 

Last May we began having office 
hours every Tuesday afternoon up­
stairs in the Town Hall. 

We chose this location because it 
is central and easy tor most peo­
ple to get to. Anyone wanting any 
information which we might bo 
able to give Is welcome to come 
there then, or to call us a t anytime 
on the telephone listed under Red 
Cross Home Service, 1577. 

Our relations with the Home 
Service Division of the New Haven 
Chapter have become much closer 
during 1944. Since Home Service 
work continues to Increase In vol­
ume and complexity. New Haven 
now has a special Branch Consul­
tant , a trained Red Cross Social 
Worker, who Is always on hand to 
holj) us with any problem. 

Our own Branch Committee, con­
sisting of six members, has put In 
885 hours of work In 1044. Mrs. 

my heart be acceptable in »^-3' ^^^ j ^ , . ^ j ^n^ red Lan 
Eight, O Lord, my strength, a n d | ^ „ / j „ . ^ .civiU, .vnnnionr (,«i,n i 
my redeemer." (Psalms 19:14). 

Correlative passages from the 
Christian Science textbook, "Sci­
ence and Health with Key to the 
Scriptures" by Mary Baker Eddy, 
incUide tlie following / p . 241) : "We 
should strive to reach the I-Ioreb 
height where God is revealed; and 
tho corner-stone of all spiritual 
building is purity. The baptism of 
Spirit, washing the body ot all the 
impurities of flesh,' signifies tha t 
the pure in hear t see God and are 
approaching spiritual Life and Its 
demonstration." 

des, Mrs. Shirley VanCleef (who Is 
back with us after more than a 
year's absence) and myself do gen­
eral case work. Mrs. Ruth Young 
is still our specialist on furlough 
matters, and.Mrs. Dorothy Stev­
ens has complete charge ot pro­
blems concerning Prisoners ot War 
and Foreign Correspondence. Mrs. 
Landes also does a formidable 
amount ot clerical and statistical 
work, the demand for which seems 
to be increasing by leaps and 
bounds. 

I am sure tha t every one who 
knows Mrs. Hammer and of the 

Evans, will be(happy to receive the 
names of more donors. 

Safety Programs 
Mrs. Harold Barker, chairman of 

First Aid and Water Safety states 
tha t there has been only i First 
AijJ class for adults but t ha t the 
outlook In the schools Is very 
bright. Almost immediately First 
Aid will be taiight to all seventh 
and eighth grade pupils, to about 
90 sophomores and as a n emer­
gency measure, to,all boys and girls 
in the Junior and senior classes. 

The Water Safety program was 
even more successful t han usual 
under the Insti'uqtlon of Miss Eve­
lyn Shoeniakei'. Classes for begin­
ners, swimmers and life savers 
were large and well at tended In 
spite of dllTlcultles In t ranspor ta­
tion and the fact? tha t ninny young 
people were eijipjoyed during the 
summer. •\ ' ., 

TlircB Nitr j ing Classes 
Three olnsses in Home Nursing 

were held in Branford in 1044. Mrs. 
Alfred Arden taught a class and 
Mrs. John McClees one. Miss Kam-
orsel ot the Visiting Nurse Assbcla-
tion started a class in the High 
School, but left to become an Army 
nurse before the end of the course. 
Mrs. Dana Blanchard continued 
thS teaching, tp^ the end ot the 
course. "The total-iniinber of certl-
cates Issued for the year 1044 Is 38. 
Mrs. V. J. McNeil, Chairman. 

Canteen Aler t 
The Canteen Corps served 630 

meals to the Red Cross Sewing Unit 
a t the Congregational Church from 
January to June, a t a time expen­
diture ot 394 hours. 

Siiice J u n e the only regular ser­
vice of the Canteen has been help­
ing a t the Blood Bank In New Ha­
ven once a montli where 5 volun­
teers worked 04 hours. During the 
Red Cross War Fund Drive last 
March, Canteen Corps members 
gave iS ' i hours of service furnish­
ing coffee and doughnuts a t the 
opening of tho Drive. On tha t same 
day coIIco and doughnuts were 
served to the Firemen a t the dis­
astrous lire 111 the center of the 
town. The time In this Instance 
amounted to 14 hours for the sev­
en workers. Seven members also 
helped in the'fcblfecllon of funds 
a t the theater, 14 hours were added 

j A-lunch was served to the Home 
Guard a t the ' East Haven Rifle 

WHAT NOTS 
• Y GITA ROUN» 

Mrs. Brent Barker leaves for 
Charlotte, N. C... Breezy Whor-
ttleberry says It was a popular 
song until he heard sing it 
t h a n It ceased to be popular. 

Dr. JoseiJh Evans reappoint*ett by 
Governor Baldwin as a member of 
Connecticut Homeopathic Medical 
Board . .January 9, 1044 American 
VroCps captured Sari-Gulsta, Italy... 

A newspaper Is the history : of 
the world for one Say 

New Canaan Advertiser reminds 
us tha t popular readings these 
mornings Is . the thermometer 
Among this week's m a l l l s a book­
let "The Avery Formula" which 1 
hoiic to find lime to take a peek at, 
It Is published by The Montgomery 
Ward Workers of Chicago, through 
their Union..i 

WEDDINGS 
ENGAOEMENT MADE KNOWN 
Mr. and Mrs. c larence I. Brad­

ley have announced the engage­
ment of their daughter, Dorraln? 
Ivins to pfc. Jan\es Ross Leake, son 
of Mr. and Mrs. Lowell L. Leake of 
j 'ackson Heights, ,N. Y. 

Ptc. Leake has completed p rc -
medicul t ra in ing ; a t Tl\pads Oen-
eral Halpltal, Ullca, N. Y. Miss 
Bradley Is a senior a t the Univer­
sity of Connecticut. 

HER T R C r a ANNOUNCED 
Mr. and Mrs. Palmer Llnsley, 

Paved Street have announced the 
betrothal of their daughter, Shir­
ley to John Holman, seaman first 
class, soil of Mr. and Mrs. Herbert 
Holman, AverlU Place. 

With The A V^p^ 

BOYS IN 4 ^ 1 
SERVICE ^ "^ 

tine work t h a t she h a s done for the „ , ,. . , ,,, , 
jjj Range last au tumn, and without 

tho proper equipment, hot soup, 
sandwiches, coffee and doughnuts 
were supplied Ihfe men who appar-

It . ' The total 

An Air Service Command StatioB 
in England—Cpl. Edward F. Mart in 
son of Mrs. EKvood Olson of Chest­
n u t Street, recently completed an 
orientation course resigned to 
bridge the gap bewteen training in 
t h e Sta tes and ccmbat soldiering 
against the enemy in Germany. 

At this Air Service Command 
Station Cpl. Martin at tended a 
series of' lectures given by veterans 
of this command which included 
instructions on chemical warfare 
defense and pert inent tips on s tay­
ing heal thy in a combat zone. 

His next station will be one from 
which America's fighting planes 
cover our advance Into Germany 

Before entering the Army Air 
Forces, he was employed as an In 
specter by the High Standard Mfg. 
Co., New Haven. 

Mr. and Mrs, .Tohn Ahern ot East 
Main Street, has reported for re­
classification a t the AAF redistr i­
bution center a t Atlantic City, Sgt. 
Ahern has been home on a 30-day 
furlough after completing his tour 
of duty as gunner on a Flying 
Fortress. 

past 14 years as cha i rman of 
Home Service Committee is sorry 
to hear tha t she has had to resign 
tha t chairmanship. However, I am ., , „ , . . 
delighted to say t h a t she is still !"iy:. '!.P!?i'?!,™'* 
working with us and will become 
acting chai rman again on Janua ry 
10, during my leave of absence. 

With such a very able and co­
operative stall ot assistants my 

WED IN SURF ROOM 
Atlantic City, N.J.—Wac Pfc. 

Rose Lar.sen of 828 No. Trumblc 
Ave., Chicago, III., married Staff 
Sgt. Alfred Anderson of Branford, 
in tire Surf Room ot tho Ambassa­
dor Hotel, a t the AAF Redistribu­
tion Stat ion ' in Atlant ic City.' 

The marriage occurred a t 7:00 
P.M. on Saturday, January 0. 
Chaplain Wm. R. McKlnney per­
formed the eferemony. 

The bride's sister, Frances Larson 
was maid of honor a t tho 

READING & WRITING 
BY cdwin Seav&i AND Rs^rt ?^'^/^iVfi 

a you rcmcnilicr the hero of Molicrc's comedy, "TliC Bour-
C»ois Gcntlenun," wlin uuldciily had it called to his attention th.it he 
had spoken prose all his lifr without knowing it?'* It brought a kin- -

dreil start of surprise to us to discover that 
many of the stories, anecdotes' and songs 
with which wc had hccn brought up arc now 
IcKiiiniatcly considered as part of our Coun-
iry'i folklore. > 

You will find many of these familiar talcD 
in B. A. llotkin's Impressive volume, "A 
Treasury of American Folklore/' which the 
llook-of-die-Month Club is sending to 
members as a book-dividend for-J.lnuary'and 
Pebriiai-y, It contains mow than ,100 stories 
and over 100 songs'inid ballads—^ t̂hose fa­
vorite stotics Americans loved to tell around 
campfircs and crackcrbarrcls, thosp old songs 
they loved to sing i;qgcthcr at picniciand 

vide assortment of legendary herpes, and .of actiial ones 
who have had legends built up about tlicmi 'Jesse J.imes who gave a 
widow money for the mortgage on h'er lidaie aiid then' stole tlic money 
back from the mortgage owncri Paul Bunyan,y/hosc fantastic exploits, 
were famous among the lumberjacksiJeUnhyAppleieedj Billy the 
Kid) Buffalo Billj John Henryi Casey Jones; and a host of others. 

Jingles and rhymes of childhood make up one''section of this anthol­
ogy, such as "Lazy folks work bolt, when 
the sun is in the west," and "Jodi'Joe; broke 
his toe. Hiding on a bulfalo." Here is an 
example of how these chance jingles tlut 
appeal'to children's ears come into l>ehig. 
A schoolboy, who is said to h.H;c lived in 
Gnficld, Connecticut, one morning in class 
wrote something on a slip of paper and 
passed it around among his fallows. The 
teacher £ot hold of it, It read: 

• Three little mice ran up the stairs 
To hear Miss Blod^ett say her prayers. 

She told him, "John, 1 give you five minutes to make another two 
lines. If you fail, I shall punish you." The boy scratched his head and 

in theallottcd time produced: 

When Miss Blodgett said "Amen," . 
The three little mice ran down again. 

Innumerable stories'about famous col­
lections a'htl advcntu'rcs'of' collectors are 
to be-found-in a-comprehensive- book by 
Douglis and Elii.ibcth Rigby, "Lotki Stock 
and Barrel;" Tlie rlngci of objects which 

I meet ithecollccfQr.'s'fi'ncy'is wide, but one 
of the most - curious bl\ clie hobbies they 
describe fs t h u ofjthc'rEnglishinan who de­

voted himself to gathering spider webs—^̂ and preserving-each one care-, 
fully between two slabs of glass. ,. •' . ' •, ', ' „, , -

Pvt, Walter Whipple, recently re­
turned from overseas, and who has 
been receiving t r ea tmen t in Veter­
ans Hospital, Newington is again 
a t his home. 

Lt. Joseph Ayer has been t r ans ­
ferred from Si. New York Hospital 
to Port Dix, N. J . 

New Years greeting card arrives 
from Lieut, Frank R. Hayes, some­
where in Belgium. 

Carl Gullans 

Her father; ' Mr. Jorgen Larson, 
number ot hours for the year were save her away. Bes t ' t nan , a t . t h e 
528 Ji;a.,i. ^' 1 nuptials was-Ken Bldlach who In-

Nutrltlon hds"hot fared so well produced,.tji? two fn Atlanljlc'City 
In the community as there Is a idck .some months, ago. Ptc. .Larson la a 

apy and other .special forms of,| cat t le liv Mlhriesota,'^ was ' th rown 
treatm|ent. ',' '• ' " | bUt o t ' a lumber Wagon-In a sud - ' 

"Although ,a serloufj ' personnel -. den; blinding. bli?,zard.. which l iad 
affair. I shortage still confronts the hospl- swep,t up • across-' t he •Minnesota 

tal," Dr. Y<;Vbitry ,comrrt(3nted', ' ' t h ^ g r a l h e i ' p p k n ^ w l n ^ l y ; l e n ' ; b ^ ^ 
h o s p l t a l ' d o e s n o t l n t o j i d to exploit """ 

ot Interest on the par t ot women 
However Miss McGaw of the High 

own Job for the past eight months "" / "" ' . " i ""77 "7 "', 7 ' j " V . -
u „ . ,; j „ „„„.. „„S „ „„„„f School faculty has completed two 

<PDofiriais. now vou 
' MIX -

THE S YMBOL ^ ON TOO A vi pnescR-

IPTIONS, ISDERIVeB FflOM THE 
ANCIENT CHALDEAN SIGN FOR JUP­
ITER, SiONIFYING TUB BLESSING 
OF THE GODS., 

THE EARLY GREEKS CONSIDERED 
CHIRON, A MYTHOLOGICAL CENT­
AUR, AMONG PHARMACY'S DIV/NE 
FOOMDEPS. MOMER CALLS HIM^ " 

'THE SIRE OFPNARMACYT" 

HNIBie, THE RESEAJiOM 
PHARMAC/Sr THEN Am 

GAYE TO rue WORLD TJ/F 
FAMOUS GFRMICIDE, 
HYDP06EN PEROX/ffE. 

IN 776, BAGDAD NAD A RETAIL 
PMRli/lACY. EVFUTHEN, TWS 
ms A COMMUNITY HE^ITN^ 
CENTER. 33X 

VIdri 

has been made easy and a great 
pleasure. I t Is not without regrets 
tha t I pa r t with It, even for three 
months. 

Louise T. McAi-dle, 
Home Service Chairman 

Motor Corps Repor t s 
The Red Cross Motor Corps re­

port is In 2 parts , first Lt. Rodney's 
report: 2 parades. Decoration Day 
and Armistice Day. Answered 2 Ci­
vilian Delense alerts; 1 Cadet's 
wife transported to hospital and 2 
nurses transported to Port Devens 
for induction into the Army. The 
present s ta tus ot the Corps Is: 5 
full t ime members, 12 part time 
members, 4 inactive members and 
3 in training. Number of days giv 
en In service to the armed forces 
125 and miles 0186. The number 
transported 601. For Red Cross du 
ties the number ot miles, amounted 
to 1584 making a total of 7770.--IB 
members served 13819 hours. 

Lt. Plnkham's report as follows: 
64 miles cirlvfn for the Flanagan 
Ambulance Service; 872 miles t rans 
porting Red Cross production, 387 
miles to and from the Blood Donor 
Center plus 0 trips in private cars. 
9 tr ips were made tor Welfare 
work covering 167 miles; 5 trips 
for Home Service, 138 miles. 30 
miles tor Red Cross War Fund 
Drive. Numerous miscellaneous 
trips. 

Need Is Grea t 
The average number of blood 

Donors each month has been 25. 
Usually there have been 30 to 35 
reservations made but there are al­
ways several cancellations due to 
Illness and other reasons. However 
the quota has been met each 
month. The need is still very-great, 
and the Chairman Mrs. George 

classes in tho High School.—Mrs. 
Winchester Bennett , Chairman. 

Receipts Highes t 
The receipts its reported by the 

treasurer were ' the highest the 
Branch has evfer ftlid, due ot course 
to the most .successful drive ever 
conducted. To Mrs. Myers and her 
workers great credit is due. I n , a d ­
dition other funds amounted to 
$807.60, making a total of $4,892.85 
ot the amount collected in the 
Dri-ve Win went to the National 
Red Cross. The amount paid out 
was $2551.83 for the following: 
Home Service, Disaster ReUef, 
Home Nursing, Water Safely, Pi-o-
ductlon. Motor Corps Camp and 
Hospital Service and a few minor 
expenses connected with the War 
Fund Campaign, also postage and 
telei)hone service. 

SPEAKS ON' JANE AUSTEN 

The li terature and drama de­
par tment ot the New Haven Wo­
man's Club met yesterday morning 
to hear Mrs. Frederick T. ca t l ln ot 
Pine Orchard speak on "Speaking 
ot Jiane Austen." Mrs. Catlln r e ­
cently gave the same talk here be­
fore the Half Hour Reading Club. 

INCOME TAX NOTE 

TODA y'S PHARMACY IS STILL A 
COMMUNITY NEAL7N CENTEP-AN 
imiSPENSABLF A/DIAI77/E 
PREVENTION Alio TREATMENT 
OF DISEASE. 

COflrfitSffTlit* J. VClARKi J 

spent a 72 hour 'pass this week wflth 
his parents in East Main Street. 
Gullans passed Christmas Day In 
the English Channel. 

Earl R. Oppel, Paved Street, left 
Monday as an enrollee In the Marl 
time Service. 

There will be a representative of 
the Treasury Department a t the 
local Post Office Janua ry 11 and 
12 from 0:00 A.M. to 5:00 P.M. to 
advise relative;.to the preparation 
of Income tax j re tu rns . , 

NUESE COMPLETES COURSE 

Miss Ann Colby, daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Clyde Colby, Hotchkiss 
Grove Road has completed her 
nurse's t raining course a t the 
Hartford Hospital. She Is now 
spending a few days in Grand 
Rapids, Mich., wi th her sister. 

Mary Petela, WAVE'is on fur­
lough a t her home, 329 Main Street 

Miss Petela has completed basic 
training a t Hunter College and a t ­
tended the school of nursing a t the 
National Naval Medical Center, 
Bethesda, Md., graduat ing with the 
rat ing ol hospital apprentice first 
cla.ss. She leaves January 16 to re­
port to St. Albans Hospital. 

The regular meeting of the I n ­
dian Neck PTA was held a t the 
school on Wednesday, Hostesses 
were Mrs. Charles Callahan, Mrs. 
Daniel Mulvey, Mrs. R. L. Jones, 
and Mrs. Arnold W. Hart . The exe­
cutive board met Monday night a t 
the home of Mrs. Callahan In 
Hotchklss Grove. 

Mrs. Irving 6'. Jacocks, Jr., South 
Main Street, was a visitor In New 
York City yesterday. , 

co-worker of Bidlach's wife, 'Wac 
Ptc. Ennettn%a G. Bldlach. BCth 
girls report tor duty to the Orderly 
Room of the Ambassador Hotel, 
headquarters a t the . AAF Redlstrl-; 
butlon Station for AAP men who 
are 'awai t ing .assignment after con­
siderable service overseas. 

Tile bride is the daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Jorge Larson of 828 No. 
Trumble Ave., Chicago. The groom 
Is the son ot. Pclice Captain and 
Mrs. P. Alfred Anderson of Bran­
ford. 

Immediately after the nuptials 
tho two left to spuiiu a' three-day 
leave at a destination which they 
refu.sed to divulge. 

Nursing School 
In Psychiatry 
Contemplated 

"Plans are underway to reestab­
lish a school tor • affiliate nursing 
In psychiatry a t , the Connecticut 
State Hospital, MIddletown, by 
April 1st of this year." Dr. Edgar 
C. Yerbury, superintendent , a n ­
nounced th i s afternoon. 

"To carry out this project, Mrs. 
J ane t Nuslnoft, R.N., of Rockfall, 
has been appointed to, the position 
of Assistant Director ot Nursing," 
Dr. Yerbury stated. Mrs. Nuslnoff, 
who for the past three years has 
been serving as Inspector of Wel­
fare Inst i tut ions for the Connecti­
cut Public Welfare Council will a s ­
sume her new duties a t the S ta te 
Hospital on January 15th. 

Although charged with the r e ­
sponsibility for the supervision of 
all nursing education a t the Hospi­
tal, Mrs. Nuslnofl's first assignment 
will be to plan and organize a 
curriculum for the aftlHate school 
which will meet with t h e approval 
of tho S ta te Board of Examiners 
for Nurses. Thus, when the school 
Is reopened, it Is expected t h a t It 
will be fully accredited 

The school will offer a two 
months course consisting of lec­
tures m menta l hygiene and care 
of the mental ly HI. In addition to 
classroom work,, s tudents will r e ­
ceive practical t r a in ing ,under the 
the supervision of registered nu r ­
ses In working with pat ients on 
acute, Infirmary and continued 
care wards. The curriculum will a l ­
so Include training In occupational 
therapy, hydrotlierany, shoijK thpr-

the alllUatlngi. students.,ijs -a spurce 
of laboiv i n spttihg up this ' pfb-
gram,; i t . l s ioiir hpiJe to, .stimtilatq 
Interest, among, genera l , hospital 
nurses In p u r e u l n g m p n t a i nursing 
us a career. In so doing , wo Will 
provide assurance, . that ' . there„j;ll.! 
be available a t all times, an ade ­
quate supply of nurses, with psychi­
atric training w i t h o u t . whom* it 
would be difficult to .successfully 
care tor and t r ea t the mentally ill." 

Dr. Yerbury stated tha t ' Mrs.' 
Nuslnoff, the newly appointed As­
sistant Director- ot. Nursing comes 
well qualified for her Important 
assignment.. . '. .,,.., ,.:„. 

In her position a s . Inspector of 
Welfare ' Inst i tut ions, .Mrs. ,Nusiri-
oll's duties brouglit her'lbitp direct 
contact with general 'hospitals, 
homes tor aged, almshouses, coun­
ty homes tor children, stale vvclfaVo 
Inst l tul lohs ' arid mental hospitals 
throughout the stated 

Winning Design 
Must Be Ready 
By April First 

by the ,wag;dh,' hci,'':*^e'atliier'ed the 
stbrrit In'.'a. straw pllG,jflghtlhg con-
staptly=agalnst'S)cep;'•;:*-'• ' - '•" ' ' 
' 1' 'IVlieh'' t he stoi'ifl;' • Was; 'oVer • he 
made | ' ls vv!ty unsteadily oh frozen 

\ylth hands , stiff, antl white, t o 
a' farinhoUse. Both legs had to bo 
amputated below the knee, his left 
iifm Heloyftlie" olbbw 'ah'd the ' fin-
gel's tirid part ' bj ; . the thtimb from 
the'rlgh' t ' hand.: ' -1 ' • '< 

Out pf his dblerinlnatlon n o t to 
become'-.a .'lifelong;- invalid,' tho 
youth poi'stiaded the county com-
mhssloners to'.glve' 'hirn two terms 
at Carleton CPlJcge, promising ho 
Weuld nover'b'c.ia'blirdeii'ttgalh. He 
Jejiriifd..tp,. tige,.his:artlflc!al t lmbs 
easll^'^ arid af i;er , ,;ieavlng cpljego 
taught schoclan3, ' ,did odd Jobs In 
summer. But he did-hot s top-there. 
' Before his dectlli in'1924 'he had 
served a s ' a- super intendent of 
schools .in a Minnesota .city , and 
had ' become d piremlnent banker, 
speaker of the JWflnnespta Hpuse of 
ueproschtat lvcs dh'd pi:esideht of a 
riuhtber of, Slvlo Iniprovement and 
welfare associations. After the last 
war ' ho was Inv i t ed ' to England t o 
speak 16 disabletl sTommles a n d . h e 
devoted much pf,̂ j h i s time and 
energy to cheering and helping 
thousands of disabled men. 

The Connecticut ' Society for 
Crippled Children Is sponsoring in 
this state the Michael j . Dowllng 
Memorial, Award contest for the 
beat design by a high school stud­
ent for the annual Ea.ster Seal sold 
by the Society. 

The state contest cariles an 
award of $25 and closes April 1, 
1045..'The winning design may be 
entered by the Connecticut Society 
in the nat ional contest for $100, 
the v/inner of which will be an 
nounced June 1. The selection ot 
the national winner will be made 
by a committee appointed Ijy the 
National Society for. Crippled Chil­
dren. 

All students of secondary .schools 
public or private. In thp s ta te a re 
eligible for the Connecticut, con­
test, and designs should be turned 
In the competitor's school. Infor­
mation concerning the contest can 
be obtained from the schools or 
from the Society's headquarters a t 
65 Wethersfleld Avenue, Hartford. 

The cpntest Is sppnsored annua l ­
ly by the Natlpnal Spclety to m e ­
morialize prie Pi America's men, 
whP'desblte severe physical himdl-
c^ps, rose,'tp a h igh place I n ' h i s 
cpmpiunlty and s ta te and to Inter-^ 
est all young people In the problem 
bf ' the crltJpled'and disabled. 

Organize S t u d e n t Classes 

The January Issue of Chapter 
New^ published (jy Tho American 
Red Cross carries the following 
story: ' '' 

Boys and gUls In the seventh and 
eighth grades and in high school 
win all take the ; i ed Cross First 
Aid course by, J u n e . , Through the 
cooperatin of the . Branford Board 
of Education,-Raymond E. Pink-
ham, Superintendent of Schools 
and Mrs.-Harold Barker; Firs t Aid 
Chairman In Branford, the teach­
ing of Red Cross | ' l r s t Aid will bc-
coipe par t of t h e ' permanent pro­
gram of the Heal th Course given 
to all s e v e n t h ' a n d eighth grade 
students. 

Six Branford teacheis have fin­
ished their t ra ining course In First 
Aid instruction a n d have s tar ted 
to organize ,the s tudent classes. 

Miss ^velyn Knapp was the din­
n e r guest this week of Miss Ru th 
Hooghklrk, , ; i . 

Mr. ati^, Mrs. Howard Resnlck of 
Stony Creek have returned to New 
'X'ork' City for the remainder p i 
the. winter. 

• ' l i r s : ' J o h n Peterson has returnecl 
,,, . , , -to ,'her home, 33, Terhune Avenue, 

At tho age of 14, Michael- .Dow-jfrom,the.hospital where she wa3 

. i; 

llhgi lifter a summer of heVdlUgltr'eated'ifor pneumonia. 

''ttf'̂ r^^tt'̂ *'*"'̂ '''''̂ ^ '̂'̂  •• % ^-»-«• <•* ^ M . . ^ A A,ft..V. J' 
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' "WINGED VICTORY"— • , , ;. 
A CHALLENGE TO HOLLYWOOD FOR I945's "OSCAR" 

A picture embodying love, drama, pat l io i , ' Wingod 
Victory" angle! for t l io 1945 " O i c a r " wHli « cait of 
icroon nowcomert. In a londor scono from tlio pic> 
turo, Jo Carrol Donnl ion and Sgt. tvlark DanioU 
labovo) onflct the roloi of Dorothy and Al lan Ron, 
an avorago Amorlcan coupla f rom an avorago 
American town 

Services in the local churches pn 
Sunday will be : 

Masa a t 9:15 o'clock in St. Augus­
tine's Catholic Church, Rev. John 
J. McCarthy, pastor, Mrs. Gene­
vieve Bernard, organis t and choir 
director. u y-

In a hnart-broakmg loquonco from W m g o d Vl 
tory," (hoto Army wivni fight a baftio agarnit lono-
linDtt><ind fear wh>lo Ihoir husbandi prcparo for a 
f l ight across (ho Pacific fo lomo war theatre. These 
young wives face the fuluro v/Hh courage and 
fortitude oqual to that of thoir hu iband i . 

A l lghtar momont In •he coloisal 50th Cortury 'Fox 
Epic, " W i n g o d Vic tory , " Is this graduation eve 
scene. Reali:lnq tha t the r igor i of basic f raming 
and the myriad fasts are over, these cadets go wild 
with happ lna i i In tho Itnowlodgo that tomorrow 
brings them thoIr wingi and battle action. 

A paper cup toast Is tho brghllght of tho gradua­
t ion ovo colobratlon by the cadets. Amid occasional 
choruios of tho Air Corps anthem, paper cupfuls of 
beverages aro distr ibuted. Paper cup), Incidentally, 
are exclusively used at all A i r Corps training centers 
in lino with current Govornmont stress on national 
health and sanitat ion. 

• HOLLYWOOD, CALIF.—If, iis ia now Bencrnlly (lis-
fussed. "Winged Vi^iory" elioiild rcccivo llic 1915 covclcd 
"OBcnr/*tIio Academy Awnrd for tlic fnicH cincmii pro­
duced in Aniericn, il will he the first (iniu in Iiifilory lliat 
n hranrli of llic Armed Services will Imvc been re-
sjionBiblo fer sucli a victory. 

Presented by 20th-Century-Fox in nssoeialion with the 
U.S. Army Air Forces, "WiuRcd Victory," under the 
expert production ofliorryl F. Znnuck imd direction 
nf Gcorgo Gulcor, is a symbol of our times, n cincmntle 
purtrnyal of aii era lliat todny afTccIs every Anicricnn 
every wlicrc. 

"Winged 'Victory** id tlio ECi'ccn adnptation of tlic sen* 
sntionnl ploy by Moss Hart, wlio wrote It In May, I'JIS, 
ut the nMiueeiof General llunry H. Arnold, commnnd-
intt Rcnernl of the AAF. Tlio\i\nnI product, a living, 
liutirt-riMidluK panorama of tho avcrngc Air Force cadci, 
is lioscd on MoES Hart̂ a Bcnsationul IJrondway vlinw. Mr. 
Ilarl was attUt'd to write tliu bcrcen pluyt accepted Imme­
diately, refusing to talco.anylhinK Tor his effort. In the 
pnnio spirit, 20lh Ccntury*Fox Insisted thtil nil profits 
from the motion picture prodncllon nnd dl&tribullon o( 
**Winged Victory" go to Army CharitlcH. 

Mui>t rcmiirkiibio thing about the iiiclurc—like i\u' 

piny—Is Jhe fact that oil tuiiformcd actors in the film— 
juid there is a veritnble army of tlicin!—arc members 
of llie Armed Forccti, Many of thcni were neophytes in 
show business until "WhiRcd Victory." Needless to say, 
Hollywood bus, as n result, discovered n Kcallh of posi* 
war inlcnl among the lads who arc daily leveling Ger-
many diid Japnn. 
, This picture brings to the screen tlic lntimal<>i tmniiui 
dctiiils uMife among thc'uicn in camp—their loves, the 
rigid tests ihcy underf^o, llio Anny precaulionsspmployed 
to safeguard their health. Even the high stnndnrd of 
Air Corps'sanitation in feeding is brought into the pic-
turc, depicting vividly the modern methods observed 
In fcudini; mir nghlcrs, tihowins tlie excIusiyouBe of 
henlth-gtiurdint: smglc'servicc paper rnpa during such 
servings, and rleanlhless generally in all training canips, 
and oven in the actual war theatres. . .".iv/ 

Undopliledly;, "Winged Victory" is in tbevan of d945*s 
"Oacur" 'contenders, but Amerii*a must never forgel that 
the true credit for ihls'screcnepic linist go to tlic Army 
Air Force who nuide this possible; to Moss-lTtiHand to 
20lli (lentury-Fnx, all of whom, by their iinseirtsli efTurls 
pive to llic world u living tciitinionial to the .finest Air 
Furcu in nil history. '. ^' 

i i -

NORTH BRAN FORD 

Holy Euchar is t will bo celebrated 
at 0:30 o'clock a t i . ZIon Episcopal 
Church, Rev. Francis J. Smith, 
Rector, Mrs. Paul R r Hawkins, or­
ganist. 

MornlnB wor.ship will bo observed 
a t i l o'clock a t the North Brantord 
Conijregatlonal Church, Hov. Roger 
Cummlngs, pastor, IVjrs. r^ouglas B, 
Holabird,' organist and choir d i ­
rector. 

The Ladles Aid of tho Congrega­
tional Church mot on Wednesday 
In the chapel for their annual bus­
iness mooting. 

The North Branford Volunteer 
Fire Depar tmen t hold a business 
meeting a t tile Atwatcr Memorial 
Library on Wednesday evening. 

Mi.ss Gladys Gedhey of Great Hill 
St reet is now able to bo out of 
doors for a shor t period In tlio 
middle of the day,' following a four 
week illness. 

Pfc. J o h n Linsley spent the holi­
day season wi th his parents , Mr. 
and Mrs. Ernes t C. Linsley of Twin 
Lake Road. Pfc. Linsley is now s ta ­

tioned a t a convalescent camp, 
having been re turned from mili­
ta ry duties in Italy. 

Cpl. Forest R. Hill has left for 
North Carolina following a fur­
lough spent with h is mother , left's. 
Alden J. Hill of Tbtokot Road. 

Mrs. n l i i has received a ' le t te r 
tolling of a Chris tmas d inner spent 
togellier .somewhere in the- south­
west Pacific by her other two sons 
serving with the armed foijces, Al 
don S. and Paul Hill. 

IT'S T i m € V O U K n e U J - - b y LAWRENCE 

The committee for the sixth war 
loan drive extends groat t hanks to 
ail who helped to pu t thfe drive so 
well over tho top. The to ta l sale.s 
tor tho town was $51,250. This fine 
shov/ing was made po.sslbie only by 
the united efforts of canvassers 
and individual residents. 

Worthy Master and Mrs. Burton 
S. Colter are a t t end ing the three 
day meet ing of the S ta te Grange 
being held in Har t ford this weelc. 

Mrs. Herman Sclielle of Moodus 
is visiting with Mr. and Mrs. Les­
lie Brindley of Foxon Road. 

Mr. and Mrs. Burton S. Colter of 
Foxon Road have announced the 
engagement qt the i r daughter, 
Eunice Maude , to John M. Haggar­
ty, son of Mr. and Mrs. Edward 
Haggar ty of North 'Guilford. 

Community House 
Notes 

THIS BUSIl^ESS 

* ^ . S U S A N THAYER 

Traveli-.ig between towns on 
buses, as .t quite often do these 
doys, I 'm continually being Im­
pressed by the numbers of young 
women start ing cheerfully to work 
In factories when most folks a re 
climbing Into bod. 

I t ' s pretty tough going. Not much 
fun, s tar t ing out on a bit ter night 
jus t a t •bodtimo, Leaving the kids 
warm and snug, with grandma to 
hear If they call, ph 'yes i these gals 
have slept during the day,' But 
chances are they've cleaned house 
too, or done the washing, or got in 
tho week's groceries. They're doing 

a double job | I n fact they're do­
ing all i t ' s humanly possible for 
anyone to do to help Win the war . 

Pre t ty stupidly, I asked a friend 
why she didn ' t give up for a while. 
She was tired, she said. No hol i ­
days for . two :years, except .Ciirlst-
•mas. ,.J ' : ' ;,, 

"Well, because," she '. roplled, 
"when I t o o k on this job I said Ijd 
sta^ for •'the,-xiura,|lon, J I ^ don't lifto 
quitters. It"'seemsf^tiort; op impor­
tan t to ine ,to keqp turning ou t tiho 
s t u i L ; • • . ' • • • . ' ' •• •. '•' 

"And," she added, " i t keeps me 
from thinking too much about 

J im." ; • 
For most of these girls there ' s a 

J im. Or a Joe or a John . Fight ing 
it out grimly far frdni home, n e v ­
er quit t ing or th inking of quit t ing. 

We all admire a n d ' r e s p e c t these 
women, I know, more t h a n we ever 
can say. But, It se'enis to me, those 
of US-still living our fairly com­
fortable lives should feel the prick 
of envy, too. Envy a t their cour­
age, moral s t rength and endur ­
ance. Envy t h a t . t h e y are living this 
war Instead of watching from tlie 
sidelines. For victory will belong to 
them, as it does to tlie boys out 
there . 

They'll go down in history—this 
valiant, turbaned, slack-clad, 
lunch-carrying, rnldnlghtTtraveling 
battal ion 1 

SCHEDULE 
Janua ry 11—5th grade. Stony 

Creek vs Shor t Beach; 7th grade, 
room 108 vs room 110; 8th grade, 
room 204 vs room 202. 

J a n u a r y 12—5th grade ; Laurel 
vs Harbor; Gth gf^ajCJe:.Laurel I vs 
Harbor. 

Ja i iuary 10—5th , grade, Hai'bor 
vs. Canoe Brook; Gth grade. Stony 
Creek vs. Harbor; 7 lh grade, room 
100 vs room 210; 8th grade, room 
200 vs room 202. 

COMMUNITY- aOUNCIL LEAGUE 
Janua ry 15 Atlantic; Wire Mill vs 

Cherry Valley-Five. ••• . 
J anua ry 17—MIF vs Massey's 

Bombers. •-"-"^* .,L..-"--,., ; 

Room 204 upset p'reviously imde-
feated room 200 by • a score of 20-
19 In an eight grade league game. 

Doebrlck and Sobdleskl paced 
room 204 to thei r first league win 
with 10 and G points. Dick Uolan 
a n d Bob Vishno scored 8 a n d 0 
points for the losers. ' 

Richard Coleman and Edward 
Marcloskl tallied all tlieir t eams 
points as room 108 defeated room 
210 by a score of 19-16. Buster 
Joiinson was high scorer for the 
game with 13 points. 

MODERN U.S. 
DESTROYERS 
ARE ONLY Sfa 
I:EET W I D E .' 
HOW LONG 
ARE THEY ? 

^ ^ " ^ 

RMY AND NAVY 
PHOTOGRAPHERS AWAYS 
PREFER GETTING PICTURES 
OF ENEMY WAR PLANTS 
WHEN SMOKE 15 ISSUING 
FROM THE CHIMNEYS/ 
WHAT DO OUR EXPERT 
PHOTO INTERPRETERS 
DEDUCE FROM THE COLOR 
OF THE SMOKE ? 

BULOVA WATCH '^'' 
TICKS I8.000 TIMES EVERY 
HOUR. IF IT TICKS ONLY 
17,909 TIMES PER HOUR, 
WHAT WOULD THE DEGREE , 
OF'INACCURACY BE |N ONE 
MONTH ? 

. . ^ H E ^ T A I L O F A PLAtviE 
ALWAYS LEAVES THE GI^OUND 
BEFORE THE FORE PART.' IN A PERFECT 
LANDING HOW SHOULD THE PLANE ALIGHT ? 

, Room 210 with Buster Johnson 
again topping tiie scorers wi th 16 
points defeated a wlnless room 212 
by a score of 29-20 in a 7th grade 
league game a t : the Community 
House. Bob Swift and Holmes 
played well for tho losers. 

I n an eight grade league g a m e 
room 203 defeated room 202 >by a 
score of 24-10. Bob Boutellieri was 
liigh scorer for tlio losers witih 8 
points while Chandler , Casey ixnd 
Burbon each tallied 6 points . /or 
tlie winners. 

A W a c T a p s O u t M e s s a g e s f o r V i > - i o v y 

Local Poultry 
Raiser Enters 
Boston Show 

er-grand champion of the shov^ to 
the best' food flock entered by 
householders producing their own 
eggs and meat . Other features ;in 
the record-breaking exhibition jln-
cliide a n egg show, contests l o r 
4-H members, large pigeon show, 
turkey exhibit, na t iona l waterfowl 
contest, and regular classes of 
s tandard-bred poultry and baji-
tams, , 

At ll'o F'=W Artillery Sdioo!, Fori Sill, Okl.-ilioma, Pvl. Dorolhy E. 
.JSrov/n, .23, (if Helena, Montana, lends and receives important niciiases 
affectint*. fi^Itting men and materiel of war. Private Brown wni civilian 

' »ecretal-y to.tlie post commander'of Fort William Henry Harrison beford 
<bo enlisted in tho Women's Array Corps November 8, 1943. 

Entries of poultry raisers from 
N e w ' H a v e n County will compete 
for more t h a n $15,00 In' premium's 
at the 96th annua l Boston Poultry 
Show in Boston, Mass., Garden 
January 17 to 21. Tho. sliow, oldest 
and largest in the world, h a s In ex­
cess of 5,000 entries from more 
Uian 30 states and Canada. 

Entries from Now Haven County 
includes tlios'e of A. E. Brlggs and 
C. L. Sibley, Wallingford; William 
IT. Bunnell, Branford; Eltqji Shee-
han, F rank A. Grown, Goi-rett M. 
Stack, all of Guilford; Joseph Hirst 
Meriden; . William H. Reynolds, 
l^ew Haven; and Stoneacros Farm, 
North Haven, 

The five-day program will om-
plinsize tho Importance of Improv­
ing both breeding and production 
poultry to meet the high wart ime 
goals set by the government, Thom 
as Leavltt of Assinippl, president 
of the show, announced. 

One of the features' this year Is 
tile $1,000 National Cockerel Clas-
sl i with entr ies consisting of six 
birds from ah exhibitor. Because of 
the exacting judging s t andards the 
class has .been l lmUed. to ' 42 en­
tries. Among the awards arfi prizes 
o t w a r bonds and s tamps totaling 
$300 gtveii by';the A & P F o o d S t o r e s 
to wlniiei's ranging from the sup-

Room 206 lost it^ second s t ra ight 
basketball game by a score of 17-
15 to room 203. Casey with 15 
points was high' scorer for the win­
ners while Burbon and Chandler 
played a good defensive game. 
Vlslino, Dolan : and ^Payettl • did 
well in a losing cause. 

•Paced by Lubeskl and Kobak, the 
Big Five defeated tlie Atlantic 
Wire Mill 58-28 in a Community 
Council league game. Harry Gal-
denze scored 13 po in t s for tho Wire 
Mill. 

With Coach Warren Sampson 
sett ing a new scor.ing record, tho 
Trojans crushed a game Cherry 
Valley Five 66-34. Coach Sampson 
tallied 41 points to lead his team 
to victory. Dick ' Jackson scored 15 
points to lead his team in scoring. 

Answers to " /T '5 T/AIE YOV K N E i r " by i awteace 

Modern U. S. Destroyers are almost iOO feet long. 

Expert Photographers prefer getting pictures of enemy war 
plants when smoke is issuing from tlie chimneys, because expert 
photo interpreters can often tell what a plant is manufactiirmg 
from the color of the smoke. 
Tlie watch would be almost 21 J.min-jrcr; slow in a month. . , -

111 a perfectjanding tho plani: ...iioald.alisUt on all three wheels 
at the same'^time. 

The Wire Mill won their first 
league game from Massey's Bomb­
ers, 29-4. 

The Trojans gained second place 
by defeating the Big Five 43-32 
Sampson with 19 points paced the 
winners." Kobalc tallied 13 points 
for the Big Five. 

All entries for the boys plrig 
pong tournament mus t be in by 
Saturday, J a n u a r y 13. At t h e pres­
ent time there aro 24 contestants 
signed. -

Friday, J anua ry 12 the Branford 
Big Five will play the strong J. 
Johhson Yanks of New Haven ' a t 
the Community House a t 8 P.M. 
The Johnson Yanks will have hi 
their l ine-up several outs tanding 
young players in New Haven. 

In a batt le for first place, in the 
Community dounci l Basketball 
League, the MIF defeated a strong 
Branford Big Five, combine 31-21. 
"Mink" Swirsky toQk.time out from 
his a rmy duties to lead the MIF 
with 9 points .\y4]ile "Pooch" Pa -
iumbo was higi r ' for the Big Five. 
Fri tz Petela, Gino Pannaroni , Jack 
^alvin and S tan Lubeskl played a 
good floor game. . 

• .% 

FOUNDED 1832 

witli lionve.s—Scuts 8 people 

ORANGE ST. AT CROWN 

Mr. and Mrs. Charles B. Stanton 
37 Maple Street, are receiving con­
gratulat ions on the birth of a 
daughter , Mary Margaret , on De 
comber 28. 

BIRTHDAYS 
Adeibert Basset t—January 14 
Jud i th Hallden—January 11 
Virginia Brockett—January 18 
Susan BensonT-January 18 
Elsa Will iams—January 16 
Thomas Piontek—January 18 

Carmine Cavallaro who has been 
in New Haven Hospital for several 
months returned to his home yes­
terday. 

\ 

THE HULL BREWING CO. 
. NEW HAVEN, CONN. 

* Complete 
Home Furnishers 

Furniture Draperies 
Bedding Bugs 
Eangea Radios 

Electrical. Appliances 

BULLARD'S 
Elm St ree t New Haven Corner Orange 

; CliKI?rri.W. SflKSCE M C O T ^ 

^^ftui•*^•IiA^Il>, 

JS«y» liTsfi —m 
You will find yourself one of the b«t informed 

persons in your comniuniiy when you read The Christian 
Iclcnce Monitor regularly. You will find fresh, new viewpoints, . 

, fuller, richer understanding of world afTairs . . . truthful, accurate, 
unbiased news. Write for sample copies today, or send for one-
month trial subscription. J^^S^ 

* The ChtUtUti Science fubllihlnc Socleir XL^DWf I 
Otte, Norwftr Street. Hoitan 15, Itliu. "•••^^ • 

Pleau iend tree auaple coplM of I'ht r~i Pleaso send » one-month trial sulucrip- I 
ChnsUan Bclenco Monitor ineludlnB it l—J lion lo The ChrlstUn , 
. : . i.,.-^l.i- r. .1 Q._M^» jQf ^ijilch I enclose.. . . 

: 

! • PleaM iend free iimple cople* of I'he f - i _ _ . _ . 

ChnsUan Bclenco Uonllor Includlni n I—J tlon U> The christian Bclenco Monitor, 
ciipy-ot your We'ekly Uacaalao'Section. 

nltor. I 
• • • " ' 
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Thursday , J a n u a r y 11. 1045 
T H E B R A N F O R D R E V I E W . E A S T H A V E N N E W S P A C E S E V E N 

Bank Statement 

REPORT OP CONDITION OP THE 
BRANFORD TRUST COMPANY 
of. BRANFORD, CONN., a S ta te 
Banising Inst i tut ion organized 
and operating under the banlting 
laws of this State, at the close of 
business on December 30, 1944. 
Published In accordance with a 
call Issued by the Banic Commis­
sioner. 

ASSETS 
Loans and discounts (in­

cluding overdrafts 
U. S. Government obliga­

tions, direct and fully 
guaranteed 

Bonds and obligations of 
States, municipalities, 
etc : 

Other bonds, notes and 
debentures 

Banking Itouse and fur­
ni ture and equipment 

Real estate taken for 
debt and other real es­
tate owned 

Cash on hand and bal­
ances with other banks 

Cash items, and ex­
changes for clearing .... 

Other assets 
Funds set aside 

for savings 
depositors: 

Loans on col­
lateral and 
personal security 1,215.00 

Real estate taken 
for debt, sold on 
contract or o th­
erwise acquired 2,169.82 

- 93,091.01 

095,801.80 

0,114.04 

59,843.97 

900.00 

57,060.63 

470,411.57 

202.50 
10,320.60 

Bank' Statement 
STATEMENT OP CONDITION OP 

THE BRANFORD FEDERAL 
SAVINGS & LOAN ASSOCIATION 
at the close of Business Decem­
ber 31, 1944. 

ASSETS 
First Mortgage Loans ....$1028791.12 
Loans on Pass Books 1338.21 
Real Estate Owned none 
Investments & Securities 508000.00 
Cash on Hand and in 

Banks 85401.53 

Total Funds set aside for 
sav ings depositqrs 3,384.82 

Total Assets $1,404,391.54 

LIABILITIES 
Demand deposits of in­

dividuals, pa r tner ­
ships and corpora­
tions 

Time deposits of Indi­
viduals, par tnerships 
and corporations (ex­
cept sayings deposits 
In savings depar tment 

Savings depar tment de­
posits 

Deposits of U. S. Gov­
e r n m e n t (Including 
postal- savings) 

Deposits of State, m u n ­
icipalities, etc. 

Deposits of other banks 
Other deposits.- (certi­

fied and 0 f f 10 e r s' 
checks, etc.) 

$1,117,488.67 

1,720.00 

1,220.60 

25,500.53 

38,852.85 
14,471.79 

49,525.45 

Total deposits $1,248,788.89 
Bills payable, redis­

counts and other bor­
rowed money (sav­
ings dept.) _.... 

Amounts set aside for 
interest , taxes and 
other expenses 

Other liabilities^ (com­
mercial dept.) , 

cap i t a l accounts: 
Common stock 
Surplus 

2,155.22 

304.76 

801.70 

25,000.00 
127,340.91 

Total capital accounts 152,340.91 

Total liabilities and 
capital accounts $1,404,391.54 

MEMORANDA 
Pledged assets (book va lues) : 

U. S. Government obli­
gations, direct a n d f u l -
guaranteed (commer­
cial department) ..'.;....$ 50,000.00 

$1023530.86 
LIABILITIES 

Savings and Investment 
Shares $1574402.06 

Loans in Process 785.49 
Other LiablUties 4686.91 
Specillc Reserves 583.00 
General Reserves 18627.34 
Undivided Profits 24445.46 

$1623530.86 
Personally appeared Reginald S. 

Baldwin, t reasurer of the Branford 
Federal Savings & Loan Association 
wilo took oath to the foregolnB 
s ta tement before mo this 10th day 
of January , 1945. 

FRANK -J. KINNEY, 
Notary Public, 

SHORT BEACH 
ST. ELIZABETH R. C. CHURCH 

Pastor, Rev. Willlara O'Brien 
Curates; Rev. Joseph Buckley 

Rev. William Myers 
Sunday Mass a t 10 o'clock. 

ONION COAPEL 
Rev. J . Edward Newton of WestvlUe 

Pastor 

Vnttenominatlonal 
9:45 Sunday School, "The Chal­

lenge of Christian Life" 
11:00 Communion, Sermon by tho 

pastor. Anthem, "The , Ear th is 
the Lord's"—J. W. Lerman. 

4-5 Song service. 

Mrs. John McClqes is recuperat­
ing a t her homo following lier re ­
cent operation. 

NOTICE OF ANNUAL MEETING 
OF. MEMBERS OF BRANFORD 

FEDERAL SAVINGS & LOAN 
ASSOCIATION 

The annua l meeting of the m e m ­
bers of tli,e Brantord Federal Sav­
ings and Loan Associatioij for tho 
election of three directors and the 
transaction of sucli o ther business 
as may regularly come before the 
meeting, will be held a t the oHice 
of the Association, 237 Montoweso 
Street, on Wednesday afternoon a t 

P.M. (E.W.F.), January 17th, 1945. 
Rogliiald S. Baldwin, Secretary 

BUSINESS 
DIRECTORY 

Wliy no t have your typewriter and 
adding machine equipment placed 
in first class condition? Our fully 
equipped service depar tment will 
do this work promptly and efllci"-
ently and furnish, without change, 
loan machines. 
R E L I A N C E T Y P E W R I T E R CO. 

C. B. GUY, Mgr. 
Telephone .7-2738 

109 Crown Street New,Haven 

Guaranteed Boilers, Radiators, Pipe 
Plumbing F i x t u r e s , Lumber, 
Storm Sash and Doors, Insu la t ­
ing Wool, Wall Board and Roofing 

THE METROPOLITAN WRECKING 
CO., 1730 Sta te St., New Haven, 
Phone 7-0294, 

F O R SALE—pa t ro l s . Kegs, Gal­
lon Glass Jugs, Glass Jars , Bur­
lap Bags, v,Crates, Baskets, etc. 
Howard Johnson, Branford Hills. 

WANTED—Woman for our bakery. 
Exiicriencc preferred bu t not 
necessary. P a r t t ime or full t ime. 
Apply Hflward Johnsonis, B ran ­
ford. 

WANTED—HOUSE TO RENT -^ 
Conservative cquple desires to 

- r e n t large or small house in 
Branford, North Branffird or 
Guilford. Call Madison 405-13. 

SEASONED HARD W O O D -
for fireplace, stove and furnace. 
Tel. Branford 580-2. 

Upon receipt of word of the 
dea th of Pvt. Robert Kells, his 
widow, Mrs. Therese Kells came 
home from Pliiiadclphia where 
she has been working. 

bute to Chief Yeoman William H. 
Pardee, Jr., who was lost In the 
hurr icane sunk destroyer Warring­
ton. 

St. Elizabeth's Women's Club 
will moot tonight In the clubroom, 

Birthday par ty guests of Linda 
Benson on New Year's Day wore 
Marylou McBrlde, Brian Nelson, 
Marsh Johnson, Loren Paradls, 
Gerald Perry, William Dlgby Adei­
bert Rogers, Betty nnd Bobby 
Wlilte, Joannine Cusic, 
Hallden, Lcona Haddock 
Meek. 

Judi th 
Janice 

SCOUTING 

Short Beach PTA meets Monday 
n ight at 8 o'clock in tho school. ' 

At the meeting of the Chapel 
Workers Tuesday a t the homo of 
Mrs. Addle Walker and. Mrs. Mary 
Kalloch of Beckett Avenue, I t was 
decided to hold a social in February 
or March. The next, nieeting will 
bo held a t the home of Mrs. Eric 
Swanson on March 13, 

Mr. and Mrs. Charles Smith, Mrs. 
Clara Fountain and Mrs. Clarence 
Titus were in Hartford. Tuesday a t ­
tending tho 60th annua l mooting of 
the Conneeticu't S ta te Grange a t 
Hotel Bond, and presided over by 
Sta te Master Harry L. Page of 
Guilford. 

Young people of the community 
are invited to meet In the Chapel 
Saturday evening a t 7 o'clock for 
an evening of games and enter ­
ta inment . 

Congregational chu rch scout 
meetings are as follows: Girl 
Scouts No. 27, Tuesdays a t 3:30; 
Boy Scouts No. 2, Wednesday even­
ings; Brownies, Thursdays, 3:15; 
p i n Scouts No. 18. Thursdays, 7:00. 

Tho theme of Robinson Crusoe 
has been chosen for tho Janua ry 
meetings of; the Shor t Beach Cub 
Packs. Monthly meetings are being 
iield i n . t h t PTA room. 

A PULPWOOD INDUSTRY 
FOR CONNECTICUT 

Mrs. Morton W. Clement Beach 
Street holds meolings a t her homo 
every Friday afternoon to work 
with Brownies on, a r t s and crafts. 

Mrs. Donald Kpbler, Clark Ave­
nue, spent the week end In New 
York City. 

Theodore Peterson is confined to 
his home by a broken left leg. 

At last n ight ' s . meetinR of Girl 
Scouts Troop 98 oonslderablo time 
was given to preparat ion for the 
Court of Awards scheduled for ear­
ly February. Group dancing was 
enjoyed. 

Members have boon asked, to a s ­
sist a t the Branford Council a n ­
nual meeting and banquet In Bran 
ford Janua ry 24. 

Committeeman Earle Kelsey 
gave tt refresher period Tuesday 
evening a t tho regular nioeting of 
Shor t Beach Boy Scouts. Arrange­
ments were completed to part ic i­
pate In the annua l meeting pro­
gram In the Community Houso. 
Scouts Nelson, Burdge, Avoriil and 
Corning completed tests. 

Mrs. Clarence Munger recently 
spent the day in Guilford with Mrs. 
David Parmeleo. 

The annual meet ing of the Shor t 
Beach Hose, Hook and Ladder Co. 
will bo heid Friday evening a t 8 
o'clock In, the flrehouse. 

The annual repor t of the Union 
and New Haven Trust Co. pays t r i -

WHEN IN NEED OF 
WALLPAPER 

OR PAINT 
visit 

UNITED WALL PAPER 
CO. 

03 Crown St., N e w H a v e n 

" W e Save You M o n e y " 

Total $ 50,000.00 
Sta te of Connecticut, County of 

New Haven ss., Branford, Conn., 
J anua ry 10, 1945. 
I, John H. Birch, Assistant Treas 

urer of the above named bank, do 
solemnly swear t h a t t he above 
s ta tement is true to the best of my 
knowledge and belief, 

JOHN H. BIRCH, 
Asst. Treasurer . 

Subscribed and sworn to before 
me this 10th day of January , 1945. 

HBRTHA B. MAURER, 
Notary Public 

LOST—P 'a ln Gold Watch on 
brown ribbon, Wednesday, J a n u ­
ary 10, on Main Street , between 
Carroll's Store and bus stop on 
Green for Pine Orchard. Reward 
call Branford-150. 

PRUSSICK'S 
SERVICE STATION 

TEXACO GAS a n d OIL 

Eavo l ine Oil in Sealed C a m 
L u b r i c a t e Oars 

A different Grease for every 
purpose 

Ml Lubrication done t)V 
experienced help. 

W e s t Main S t . Tel . 448 

Pine Orchard 
Lieut. Harry Cox has been award 

ed his third Oak Leaf Cluster to 
the Air Modal for "courage, cool­
ness and sklli" shown on bombing 
a t tacks over Europe. Lieut. Cox is a 
pilot on a- flying fortress. 

Mrs. Rlciiard Fabian has arrived 
from Los Angeles, California. 

In a recent lot tor ' tO'hls mother, 
Lieut, irroderlck Kimball writes 
t h a t he has entirely recovered from 
injuries received in Germany in 
October and expects to be back a t 
tho front with his uni t very soon. 

Mrs. J. Howard Adams Is spend­
ing the winter with her daughters 
In West Orange, N. J . 

The Branford Tile 
and Marble Co. 

GENERAL CONTRACTOR 
MASON and P L A S T E R W O R K 

E. B E E C C I A R O L I 

Phone 1115 

19 Ivy St . Branford, Conn 

DO FALSE TEETH 
Rock, Slide or Slip? 

FASTEETH. an improvetl powder to 
bo sprinkled on upper or louver plutee, 
holdB false teeth more flrmly" In place. 
Do not slide, slip or rock. No gummy, 
Kooey. paety taate or feeling. FAS-
TEETH Is alkaline (non-acid). Does not 
pour. Checks "plate odor" (denture 
breath). Qet FASTBBTH, at any drug 
store. 

STATE OF CONJ4ECTICUT 
PERSONNEL DEPARTMENT 

EXAMINATION NOTICES 
POSITIONS: PSYCHOLOGIST, No 

703, $2280-$3000 less mainten­
ance (appointment to be made 
a t .$2040 less main tenance) 
MEDICAL SOCIAL WORK SU 
PERVISOR, No. 704, $2700-$3300 
(appointment to be made a t 
$3000.) 

RESIDENCE: The Connecticut res­
idence requirement is waived for 
both positions. 

APPUCA1TON FORMS and detai l­
ed inforination may be obtained 
a t the Personnel Depar tment , 
State Capitol, Hartford, or a t lo-

. cal offices of the U. S. Employ­
ment Service for Connecticut.-

CLOSING DA'TE for filing applica­
tions for both positions Is Feb­
ruary 1, 1945. 

DATES OF EXAMINAITONE: For 
both positions, during the month 
of February, 1945. 

Glendon A. Scoboria, 
Personnel Director 

Capitol Theatre 
2 8 1 MAIN ST.. EAST HAVEN 

Thurs. , Fr i . , Hut., .Ian. 11-1'<2-13 

RAINBOW ISLAND 

RECKLESS AGE 

' WE'l^E OFF TO TH£ 
BUTCHER WITH OUR 
• USEP FATS... 

jiuii., Jlon., Tuos,, ,)aii. 14-in-lO 

TILL WE MEET AGAIN 
NATIONAL BARN 

DANCE 

Wedncstlny, .Jiiiiuary 17 

THE MIRACLE OF 
MORGANS CREEK 

Officer Rudy Marroney, who h a s 
been with the U. S. Armed Forces, 
has re turned to duty as the Pine 
Orchard Policeman. 

Mrs. Ralph Smith continues to 
improve a t New Haven Hospital 
a n d is expected to return to he r 
home the first of the week. 

Coloring Books 
Pleasant Fun 
For Children 

During my forestry rounds I am 
frequently asked, "How can wood­
land improvimenta be made to pay 
their cost and yield some cur rent 
Income?" I believe tho answer, a l ­
so one t h a t would benefit S t a t e 
economy in many other ways, lies 
chiefly m the development- of a 
pulpwood industry for Connecticut. 
For th i s purpose we can allot 300,-
000 cords a year. 

Improved methods of manufac -
turo have recently made possible 
tlie use for wood pulij from many 
more kinds of trees llian formerly, 
tho list of usable species now in­
cluding all tile hardivoods the hem­
lock and the various pines and 
spruces growing natura l ly or found 
in plantat ions about this State. Al­
ready the largo pulp mills of ad­
joining States are searching our 
woodland sources of supply ond 
are install ing purohasing agenolos 
liero. One mill a t Mochnnlovlllo, 
N.Y., 30 miles nor th of Albany on 
the Hudson, is now using 3,000 
cords, per month of hordwoods, a 
llmllod amount of this from near ­
by towns in Connecticut. This 
costs them f^om $10 to $22 per cord 
for, unpeolcd,. wood delivered. Ceil­
ing prices are $13.50 per cord FOB 
railroad cars, a t points of origin, or 
for trucking $11 a t tho roadside. 

However, the development of 
large scale and profitable pulp-
wood markets In Connecticut is 
handicapped by the lack of a suf­
ficiently low freight rate to the 
above mills, such a .rate a s corres­
ponds to tha t on shipments coming 
southward to them from Vermont, 
Now Hampshire, MaUio and Can­
ada. 

Eventually we will n.eoci one or 
more pylp mills of our own in Con­
necticut, perhaps one east and one 
\vest of tho Conneqticut River. Such 
mills would save wood haulage and 
therefore allow higher s tumpage 
prices tp the woodland owner. They' 
would furnish local .wu);ces of 
wood mater ial tor our rapidly de -
voloplng paper, insulation board, 
paper container nnd allied Indus­
tries. All along the line—tree crop 
owner, logger, trucker, water and 
power companies, miiiiufaoturor, 
worker aiid: stockholder—more of 
the wood Income would^bo retained 
within the State. Lacking other 
raw materials Connecticut needs 
it. Please note, hoWevor, tha t t he 
conversion of wood into pulp and 
of pulp Into, final' pppei'.prod.ucta 
are essentially separate oporatlo'ns, 
al though ofteii. oorrled oh at the 
same sitp or vicinity, . , ' : 

Tree harvesting and trade, p rac ­
tices mus t bo doyploppd t h a t will 
Improve and not despoil our for­
ests, as was, tpo I teu tho oaije by 
clear cut t ing In the past. Tho 
smallest trees and limbs from, wood 
land, operations, can bo used for 
fuelwood or, charcoal, Wded trees 
and branches, tha t will make sticks 
5 Inches to IQ; Inohos In diameter 
and 4 feet long will normally go to 
the pulpwood market, and a fast 
growing stand of "crop trees" will 
be left to furnish continuous sup ­
plies q[ timber for construction 
and various wood-using industries. 
Farmers and woodland estate 
pwners will haye winter work for 
(heir help, and virood crops and 
money re turns will be assured on 
a more regular' basis. 

Summing up, a properly con­
ducted pulpwood- Industry Is the 
missing link needed, to round up a 
practical; economic and continuous 
prograip for tho use of Connecti­
cut's woodlands. 

A cloaring house for information 
and specific efforts to accomplish 
these results is being centered.with 
the "Connoctiout-Pulpwood Com­
mittee, P. O. Box 1305, Watcrbury. 

By George A. Cromle, Now Hav­
en, Farm Forrester Southwestern 
Connect icut . . 
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•Rationing News 
MEATS AND FATS 

Red Slilmps <a-5 through X-5, in 
Book Four, no\v Rood for 10 points 
each. Rod tokens, wortli one point 
each, used as chniiEO. 

PROCESSED FOODS 
Blue Stamps X5 through Z5 and 

A2 through G2, in Book Four, now 
good for 10 points oacli. 

SUGAR 
Sugar S tamp No. 34, in Book four 

good for five jiounds. II is expected 
thit t a now sugar s tpmp will bo 
validated February 1. 

FUEL OIL 
Period Four and Period Five cou­

pons of 1943-44 issue and Period 
One and Period Two coupons of 
1944-45 Issue valid to August 31. All 
coupons wor th . 10 gallons a uni t . 

Milton P. Bradley, Theodore R. 
Suclier, Moriis Plan Bank of which 
Mr. Bradley is president and Her­
bert C. Holinan, treasurer. 

Mrs. Kenneth Mattern, tho for­
mer Dorcas Jacocks, with her In­
fant daughter ; Susan, loft yester­
day tp 'jojn Lt. Mat tern a t Craig 
Field, Ala. They were extended 
holiday gUesbs of Mr. and Mrs. I r ­
ving c . Jaoooka, Jr . 

Edward Hoadley is convalescing 
after a recent a t tack of pneumonia 

Mr. and Mrs. Elijah Ball plan to 
pass the winter mon ths in Florida. 

Flowers, cards and telegrams 
were received Sunday by Mr. a n d 
Mrs. Robert L. Rosenthal as con-
lirntulatlon messD:ges on their 43rd 
wedding', anniversary. ' 

Mrs. Jdck Churchward and her 
daughter , Miss Joan ChurcliWard 
are a t For t Lauderdale, Fia., for a 
month ; 

SHOES 
Airplane Stamiis Numbers 1, 2, 

and 3 in War Book Three good for 
one paii; of .shocf eacli indefinitely. 

FIVE GRAVES TO CAIRO 

r i iurs . , Fri . , Sal . , .Jiiii. 18-19-20 

MRS. PARKINGTON 
Greer Garson, W a l t e r P idgeon 

MARCH OF TIME 
Selected .Shor t s 

Children who eat aboard New 
Haven Railroad dining and grill 
cars aro given a twenty-four page 
crayon coloring book and a box of 
eight crayons, all enclosed in an 
at tract ive envelope. The book Is 
entitled "Fun On The Tra in" and 
was prepared by the New Haven 
Railroad's Avdertlsing Depar tment . 
I t contains more trian a hundred 
pictures plus a map showing the 
territory served by the New Haven 
The pictures depict scones com­
monly viewed from tra in wlndow.s, 
also various pieces, of railroad 
equipment, and are so , designed 
tha t they can be colored easily by 
children v/hlle riding on the train 

, GASOLINE 
KVi ooupons good, for 4 gallons 

each, thi-ough March 21. B5, C5, BO 
and, CO'ooupons good for five gal­
lons: ea.bh until further notice. 

Of interest here Is tiio elections 
of the following directors: Vernal 
W. Bates, Dougla.s Oi'r and Harold 
K. English, First National Bank 
and Trust Co.; Philip H. English, 
Union and Now Haven Trust Co.; 

Mrs. William Mahdn, Rogers 
Road win be hostess t iext Thursr 
day nlglit a t a meet ing of • IHoVWo-
men's Auxiliary of , the Church of 
Christ, Stohy crook. 

Mrs. Mary Paul Chapnion, Post 
Road h a s Joined her husband, En - , 
sign Chapman In New York City. 

• Anotbor Jap falluro 7jnn uo InuBli-
Ing qut loiiill Lnolt of oooiiofutloii 
oil tlio imit of tliol'lillliipliio oil' 
nittto iind labor hiiB miido tlioir ot-
forlfl ut growing oottoii tliore tt 
tonlblo falluro. But thon, oxportd 
Huy evou' tliq Nlpponooe i^liouia 
Imvo known llint. 

* * • 
Don't forgot t^at Irosh vogotablo 

and fruit milndH aro Just an Im-
Dortunl In tho diet tliooo -vvlntbr 
iloya an over. Topped -wltli -real' 
mayonnnlao, wliloli in pnado of ogga, 
oil, vinogur and BOaaoninBH/Hlioy'ro 
moro nutrllious and boiilthrul tlian 
cvor. 

Pawson Tribe, I.O.R.M., will meet 
tomorrow evening in the Acodemy. 

Gene Grenier of the Whlteway 
Fish Market received a telegram 
Tiiesday from his son, <3eno who 
has arrived on the.:\yp5t J!oast af­
ter seeing many monf:Hs of service 
in Africa a n d India . 

Distribution s tar ted during the 
Christmas season and will continue 
Indeflnltcly. The surprise envelope, 
which IS; popular with children up 
to fourteen years. Is presented a t 
dessert time. Mothers orithuslastl-
cally agree It is a great v/ay to keep 
children amused both while on the 
train and after they arrive homo. 

THAT jnon of youHwhowont his food habits. He'« learned to 
uway to tho wars is not tho liko frdlt juices and salads. But 

some person ho was when ho ho wants grcona shredded nnd 
lofl; home. Fundamenfally, of not left as n garnish. A variety 
cotirje, he is his old familiar in salad dressing also is appre-
solf, but life in the armed scrv- elated. Your man is going to 
ices changes a man. The deep -want hearty soups, plenty of 
down emotions . . . love, home, fresh vegotables and tasty dos-
family . . . are mora Important sorts. . 
to him than ever, but he looks Above all ho will -want tils 
at many other things from on colfeo good—and plenty of iti 
entirely different viewpoint. He He's become accustomed to 
is growing older and living a drinking.coffee often, at ail 
Tiew life. It's your job to keep times of tho day and night, on 
up with him. all ocoasl6fi<.Mitko certain the 

Take the question of neat- coffee he gets a t homo satisfies 
jicss, for -inslapco. The -well-' both in quantity and quality, 
trained serviceman has learned Follow these few simple rules, 
to bo ncnt the hard way. He's Be suro your cofTce maker is 
spent many wcory hours polish- spotlessly clean and measure 
\R% his equipment and tidying water nnd colTeo accurately, 
up his bunk,niskit,hls uniform. Two level tablespoons of coffco 
Naturally, ho looks with disap- to six ounces of water is recom-
proval ot; anyone who isn't 08 mended. Serve tho coffee as 
•well groomed as ho. All men soon as it's made, and pel full 
like tliclr women to be neat, but enjoyment, picasuro anuTatirau-

.0 smart appearance and an or- latlon. 

^•(0 V\ER̂  

i3.toA/ 63c!tXt^,Em^, jfj . - 0 
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Branford^s New^s 

Robot Bombing 
Defense Rules 
Are Released 

A set of Instruction to the public 
on what to do In case of a robot 
bomb attack was released his week 
by the Connecticut War Council. 

State War Administrator Henry 
B. Mosle said the Instructions had 
been prepared In accordance with 
a vote of the ' Civilian Protection 
Committee which considered the 
situation In a meetlnE Saturday. 

"The War Council," Mr. Mosle 
said,'"does not have any official 
information that would Indicate 
that robot bomblnss are more 
likely to occur at present than has 
been'the case for some time." On 
the' other hand, ho said there has 
been inquiry as to what should be 
ĉ ono in tlie case of an attack, and 
the following Instructions were Is­
sued to .answer these questions. 
.These bombs may fall without 

•vvarnlng. Air. raid signals may or 
may hot sound previous to an at­
tack. Be on the alert. - , 

If, a bo^mb. Is seen or heard ap-
pjoaching,' dive behind any avail­
able protection pr He face down 
with one arm under your forehead 
and tlie other one across the back 
of your head. 

One of the most dangerous fea­
tures of robot bombs Is flying 
glass, Upon receipt of an air raid 
warning, or in case of continued 
bombings, seek the nearest shelter, 
get Indoors away from the hazard 
of flying, glass.. 

In case of intermittent bombing 
attacks proceed cautiously but re­
main on the.-alert.to take shelter 
If. riecessary. 

lOUrb your^cUrioslty. Do not go to 
the.scene o( a bomb explosion. 
Stay wliere you are or go about 
your business. 

I Do not use the telephone unless 
you need help,! , 

.it you are near a radio keep It 
tuned to a local .station. 

Be calm, panic makes matters 
worse. 

Infantile Polio 
Campaign Opens 

Charles Bijxter, chairman of the 
annual Infantile Paralysis drive 
for funds announces that'Mrs. Ro­
ger A.-Benton of Pino Orchard who 
is a member of the qtato executive 
board of Infantile Paralysis, Inc., 
win be'treasurer here this year. 

Contributions by check should be 
made out to the National Infan­
tile Paralysis Fund, Mrs. Roger 
Benton, treasurer and sent either 
to,the treasure]; or the chairman. 

The drive opens Monday and a 
special effort will be made .here this 
year ' to increase collections In 
view of the fact that the town has 
realized more money in patient 
care, than It.has ever contributed. 

Fifty! percent of the ' amount 
raised remains In Branford and 
the remaining half .is forv^arded 
to the national organization. . . 

Contributions will, be sojlclted by 
mall and boxes will be centrally lo 
catcd. ' 

MEMORIAL SERVICES 

Among the boys honored at the 
recent memorial service held at 
Hopkins Grammar School for for-
mer students of the school who 
have died in-the service of their 
country! was-Charlcs F. Montellus, 
son of Mr. and Mrs. Maurltz Mon­
tellus of Bryan Road. 

GIVEN SIXTH DEGREE 

Among those from here who at; 
tended'the convention of the Con-
neoticut Grange in Hartford Tues­
day are the following members of 
the. Branford Orange: I. Lewis 
Dooilttle,.master;. Jytr. an^ Mrs. 
John DeBay,Miss Faith Hoogh-
klrk. Miss Doris Blrks, Miss Eleanor 
Skroza and Miss Doris skroza. Miss 
Blrks and Miss Eleanor Skroza 
took the sixth degree. ' 

The next meeting of the Half 
Hour Reading Club will be held thlg 
afternoon at the home of Mrs. Wil­
liam Hoadley of Montowesc Street. 
A lecture on "Later Italian Paint­
ings" will be In charge of Mrs, 
John Beaver and Mrs. Donald Saw-
telle.' - - .' 

Study Group 
Met Tuesday 

A group of women met Tuesday 
evening at the home of Mrs. Mi­
chael Carplnolla to continue the 
study of the Dumbarton Oaks pro­
posals. 

The Dumbarton oiks Proposals, 
conceived by four great powers, 
Great Britain, China, Russia and 
the United States, are the result of 
much thought and investigation. 
That this plan was formulated by 
a number of different nations with 
different governments, different 
philosophies, different problems 
and ambitions. In the midst of war, 
is a testimony to their common 
purpose—that of a united effort 
for the future peace of the world. 

Two years ago, before we enter­
ed the war. Secretary Hull set up a-
special section of the State De­
partment to study and evolve a 
blueprint for an "If^'ternatlonal 
peace organization. He took this 
rought draft with him to the Mos­
cow Conference. The.Russians lis­
tened and agreed to • participate, 
then incorporated the general pur­
pose In the Declaration of Moscow. 
Since then plans further developed 
to a day in August last year when 
President Roosevelt calied a meet­
ing of the representatives of Great 
Britain, China, Russia and the 
United States to Dumbarton Oaks 
in Washington, D.O. 

On October 0, this plan was pub­
lished In the papers In the form of 
Proposals. It Is not a complete doc­
ument, many details have not yet 
been decided—but It represents the 
general Ideas on wlilch the four 
nations agreed. 

These proposals have gone book 
to the various governments before 
being presented to a United • Na­
tions conference, where they will 
be discussed and necessary changes 
made. The final charter will then 
bo subject to ratification by all the 
signatory powers "In -accordance 
with their own constitutional pro-, 
cesses." 

For this reason. It Is Important 
that the public In, the United 
States fully understands the pro­
blem of international unity, the 
basic form ot the agreements, and 
our own obligations as a member. 
The State Department Is taking 
great polns to discuss the proposed 
plans with both branches of Con­
gress, with the many groups who 
have been working on peace plans, 
and with the public via radio and 
newspapers. Past failures must not 
occur again. 

Slogan Contest 
About To Close 

At the next meeting ot Associa­
ted Business to be hold at the 
Chowder Houf.o, Indian Neck, on 
February 1, an award of a $25 War 
Bond win bo made for the best 
slogan tor Branford. Entries are 
still open and may be submitted 
until the closmg date on January 
25 by any resident of Branford, in­
cluding servicemen and students. 

Entries should bo sent to , Miss 
Roberta Pellegilnl and those sub­
mitted through the mall must be 
postmarked not later than January 
2'!. All members ot the association 
will act as Judges, as well as judges 
from outside. If any • member of 
the association wins the award, he 
or she will receive an additional 
prize of a ham. 

Pvf. Kells 
From 

Dies , 
Injuries 

Pvt. Robert E. Kells, 26, ot Hill 
Street, Granite Bay, died on De­
cember 24 Irom Injuries received 
In action In Germany according to 
word received from the War De­
partment by his wife, the former 
Mlss-Tlioresa Phillips. 

Kells entered the Army In June, 
and received his training at Camp 
^^heeler, Oa., going overseas with 
the Infantry In November. Ho Is 
survived by his'wife, two children, 
Gall and Robert, and his parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. John Kells, Sherwood 
Street, Granite Bay. 

Pvt. Kells a graduate of the 
Branford High School, was em­
ployed at Winchester's before join­
ing the armed forces. 

Mrs. Walworth 
Renamed Head 
Of R̂ed Cross 

At the annuel meeting ot the 
Branford Branch ot the American 
Red Cross held Monday afternoon 
In the library the fllowlng officers 
and chairmen were named: tor the 
year 1045: Chairman, Mrs. James 
J. Walworth; Vice-chairman, Mrs. 
Robert M. Williams; 2nd Vice-chair 
man, Mrs. J. D. Heffernan; Secre­
tary, Mrs.; Raymond E. Plnkham; 
Treasurer, Charles N. Baxter. 

Ohalrm?n of committees: Gar­
ment Production, Miss Marlon L. 
Thotcher; Knltflng, Mrs. R. F. 
Bailey; Gauze, Mrs. Amos F. Barnes 
3rd; Home Service, Mrs. J. J. Mc-
Ardle; Publicity, John E. Donnelly; 
First Aid and Water Safety, Mrs. 
Harold W. Barker; Home Nursing, 
Mrs. Virgil J. McNeil; Canteen and 
Nutrition, Mrs. Winchester Ben--
nett; Disaster, Eugene B. Rodney; 
piood Donors, Mrs. George E. Evans 
Junior Red Cross, Mrs. Florence 
Royal; Captain ot Motor Corps, 
Miss Eleanor Harvey. 

Business Lists 
New Chairmen 

MEN REAPPOINTED 
BY SELECTMEN 

At a recent meeting of the Board 
of Selectmen Fredrlk F. Osterholm: 
was reappointed a "member of the 
Parker Memorial Park committee. 
The appointment became effective 
January 1st. 

John Knecht and William Hitch­
cock, Jr., have received appoint­
ments to the Hammer Field Com­
mittee also effective January 1st. 

FASHION SHOW 
IN FEBRUARY 

Some fifty local girls and women 
win model the latest styles at a 
fashion show to bo given 'by J. 
Johnson' and Sons of ^ew Haven. 

The show will be staged in the 
Community House February 23 and 
the entire proceeds will be for the 
new playground project at Ham­
mer Field.' 

FORMER RESIDENT DIES 

• Philip H. Reilly, formerly of 
Branford, died at his homo In E:y"l-
Ha, Ol>lo this week. Mr. Reilly was 
born here, moved to Ohio when a 
young man. le Is survived by his 
wife, two brothers, John F. Reilly 
of Main Street, Branford, aiid Wil­
liam Reilly of Dayton, Ohio; by two 
sisters Mrs. John Doyle and Mrs. 
William Henchey of New Haven, 
and by several nieces and nephews. 
Funeral services were held in Ely-
rla. ' -

Mr. Reilly left Branford 50 years 
ago. He and a brother, William of 
Dayton, Ohio, visited here ' two 
years ago. When a resident here lie 
worked for the old Branford Lock 
Works. 

Two nolces, Mae Hinohey Foley 
and Genevieve Doyle left Monday 
to attend the funeral. 

Belanic Elected 
Head Of Lodge 
At tile annual meeting of the 

C.F.U. Lodp;p 102, hi'ld recently, the 
followinti (jfficei's tor the ensuing 
year were elected: president, 
Matthew R. Bolanlc; vice president 
.Rolioit Ya.";i?vn(;: Secretary, Matt­
hew; Roilm-au; Financial S[;cretary, 
Slophun Koljak, and publicity, 
Mlchai.'l a . Lalch. Board ot trus-
toES, Anthony Prahovlc, Robert 
Yasovac, John steglna. 

The officers will be installed at 
the next, regular monthly meeting, 
on January 21. All members are re­
quested to attend, as matters ot 
urgent importance will come up for 
discussion. 

MRS. FRANK STONE 
ADDRESSES CLUB 

Pupils Purchase 
Bonds; Stamps 

Pupils purcliased seven cash 
Bonds and Stamps amounting to 
$77r.-'!0 on Monday. Sales were di­
vided among the various schools as 
follows: Stony Creek, $82.45; Short 
Beach, $54,70; Laurel Strijet, $151.25 
Indian Neck, $280.70; Harrison 
Avenue, $96.50; Habor Street, $92.-
20; Canoe Brook $48.90. 

The following members of the 
committee tor tiie sale ot War 
Stamps manned the booths: Jun­
ior-Senior High, Mrs. Joseph Scan-
Ion, Mrs. Flanders Smith, Mrs. Ed­
win Maddern, Mrs. Andrew Law­
rence, Mrs. Gepi-ge Pond; Harbor 
Street, Mrs. Willis Pratt, Mrs. Ed­
win Micliaelson; Harrison Avenue 
Mrs. John Quinn and Mrs. Samuel 
Beach; Indian Neck, Mrs. George 
Miller; Laurel Street, Mrs. Harold 
Tousoy and Mrs. Leo Flnneran; 
Stony Creek, Mrs. Richard Howd; 
Short Beach, Mrs. Herbert Baldwin 
C.in'jc Brook, Mrs. John Sliney. 

As.soclated Business, meeting last 
Tliursday evening announced the 
following officers and committees 
tor the year: 

President, Henry C. Georges; 1st 
vice president, Alfred Eisner; 2nd 
vice president, Arnold Hart; Secre­
tary, Miss Jane Ballard Lang; Cor­
respondence secretary, Mrs. Evalyn 
Gladdys; Ti-easurer, Norman V. 
Lamb. 

Finance Committee: Norman V. 
Lamb, Chairman; Joseph H. Dris-
coll, I. Lewis DooUttle, Lewis C. 
Hamilton. 

Publicity committee: Althoa 
Delon, chairman; Alice T. Peterson, 
R. Edwin Maddern, Evalyn Gladdys. 

Retail merchants committee: 
George H. Dunbar, chairman; Alice 
T. Wallace, Alfred Eisner, Louis C. 
Hamilton, Bernard Marcus, Lewis 
Doollttle Alice T. Peterson. 

Legal and Resolutions committee 
Cornelius T. Driscoll, chairman; 
Frederick R. Houde, Sidney S. 
Ward, Joseph T. Morawski. 

Membership committee: Mrs. H, 
Crlspell, chairman; Mabel L. Doo­
llttle, Althea Delon, Charles L, 
Close, Solly Donadlo. 

Program committee: Jane Bal­
lard Lang, ciiatrman; Alice Peter­
son, J. Ray MacLean, Roberta Pel­
legrini. 

Post War Planning Committee: 
I. Lewis Doollttle, chairm-an; Alfred 
Eisner; William W, Ham, Arnold 
W. Hart, Meyer Leshlne, cdarles 
A. Terhune, R. S'. Baldwin. 

Taxpayer's League Committee: 
Reginald S. Baldwin, chairman; 
Norman V. Lamb, Leoniai E. Rice, 
Josepli H .Driscoll, Roberta Pelle­
grini. 

~ 
MAIL ROUTE OPEN 

ON JULY FIRST 

The Study Group ot the Bran'-
ford Garden Club met Friday af­
ternoon at the home of Mrs. S. A. 
Grlswold. Mrs. Howard Marlln 
showed an exotic plant brought 
from Florida which is now In bril­
liant rod bloom for the flst time in 
eight years. 

Mrs. Frank Stone spoke on the 
subject, "Eight Aces," discussing 
eight foremost plants, shrubs, and 
bulbs. Members were reminded ot 
the lecture to be given fit the Lawn 
Club on January 15 at 3 o'clock by 
John T. Arms. 

Jaoooka Veterans Ohninnan 

Representative Irving c. Jacocks 
Jr., will head the Veterans AiTairs 
Committee-during this session of 
the General Assembly. 

Raymond C. Barnes is a member 
of the Liquor Control committee 
and Motor Vehicles Committee. 

Bills of local interest may be glv 
on to either representative to be 
presented, so far as their duties 
permit, to the General Assembly, 

Early preparation is suggested as 
a dead line will be established for 
reception of bills. 

EDITOR JOHNSON SPEAKS 

Curtlss Johnson, publisher of the 
Shore Line Times In Guilford and 
president of the Connecticut Edi­
torial Association will speak on 
"The Need tor the Now Promotion 
and Research Bureau,"/january 20 
In Hotel Kcnmore, Boston of the 
Northeastern regional meeting of 
the National Editorial Association. 

Tlio tollowlng star route in Con­
necticut tor carrying the mail of 
the United States from July 1, 1945 
to June 30, 1949, is now open for 
bids according to Postmaster Jos­
eph Driscoll, who will furnish pro­
posal forms and all necessary in­
formation upon application: New 
Haven to Saybrook, 34.5 miles and 
back, six times: a week, serving 
Branford, Guilford, East River, 
Madison, Clinton, Westbrook and 
Saybrook post offices. Bond re­
quired with bid is $5,000. 

WILL SPEAK MONDAY 

The Rev. Matthew Madden will 
be guest speaker at the Monday 
noon meeting o* the Branford Ro­
tary Club and will use as his sub­
ject "Speech and Personality." 

PIGGERY HEARING 

Red Cross Production 
And Instruction Units 
Make Splendid Reports 

Homo Service Committee Rendered Invaluable Services, Annual Re­
port Shows—Need Seen For More Blood Donors—Lack Of In­
terest In Nutrition Courses. 

Youths' Friend 
Rotary Guest 

At the meeting of the Branford 
Rotary Club Monday noon at the 
Oasis Town' House, the speaker was 
Carl L. Miliward, superintendent 
ot schools in Milton, Pa., Instructor 
in Education in Buckneil Univer­
sity, and a member of the Youth 
Committee of Rotary Internation­
al. His subject was "Every Rotar-
ian a Friend ot Youth." 

Mr. Miliward outlined the causes 
ot j u v e n i l e delinquency and 
stressed youth service as one of the 
most important activities ot Ro­
tary Clubs. He urged every Rotar-
ian to become actively interested 
in the welfare of some youth. 

There were 34 present at the 
meeting including Clarence L. 
Clark ot New Haven and Johnson's 
Point, visiting Rotarlan. 

LEGIONNAIRE COYLE 
SPEAKS TO POST 

Women's Corps 
Seats Officers 

At the recent meeting of Mason 
Rogers Women's Relief Corps, the 
following officers were installed by 
Mrs. Minnie Willard, past depart­
ment president, with Mrs. Roblna 
Zvonkovlc as conductress- Presi­
dent, Bertha Lounsbury, senior vice 
president, Elizabeth Olver; junior 
vice president, Florence Whltcomb; 
chaplain, Nellie Buell; secretary, 
Katherine Page; treasurer, Carrie 
Lounsbury; conductress, Roblna 
Zvonkovlc; guard, Anna Cassidy; 
first color bearer, Nellie Rice; sec­
ond color bearer, Elizabeth Saund­
ers; third color bearer, Susan Pal­
mer; fourth color bearer, Louise 
Brandriff. 

Gifts were presented to the in-
.staliing officer, the president, and 
those who assisted in the installa­
tion. 

Mrs. Lounsbury appointed tlie 
tollowlng committees; Relief, Car­
rie Lounsbury, and Florence Whit 
comb; executive, Nellie Rice, chair 
man, Elizabeth Olver, Elizabeth 
Saunders, Anna Cassidy; auditors, 
Abble Close and Louise Brandriff; 
ciiilS welfare, Carrie Lounsbury; 
defense, Roblna Zvonkovlc; Anieri-
canizalton, Abble Close; servicemen 
Maud Walker; Red Cross, Kather­
ine Pagij; liospital, Susan Palmer; 
national aid, Nellie Buell; depart­
ment aid, Nellie Rice. 

A covered dish luncheon was 
served preceding the meeting. 

A public hearing will be held 
Monday evening in the town hall 
to act on the application of Alex 
Struzlnskl to operate a piggery. 

HOSE COMPANY ELECTS 

At tlie Annual Meeting ot the 
M. P. Rice Hose, CO., No. 2, held at 
the flrohouse Monday night, tlie 
following officers were elected: 

Edward P. Tdbln, Jr., Captain; 
Chester Tisko,'''lst Lieut.; John 
Banko, 2nd Lieut.; Edward Dris­
coll, TreasArer\ and Steward; Jos­
eph Lasko, Secretary. 

Residents Hear Explosion 

•:M 

Scores of Branford residents 
aroused early Sunday morning by 
a series ot explosions. Fear of robot 
bombs sent some immediately to 
phones. 

The explosions originated at the 
A. F. Holden Co. war plant in West 
Haven and resulted in lire losses 
between $300,0013 and $400,000. 

?r 

At the regular monthly meeting 
ot the Corcoran Sundquist Post 
American Legion held at the Ar­
mory Tuesday nlgrt the following 
veterans of World War II were 
elected to membership, Stanley 
Bush and John Leprlce. George N. 
Dunbar Jr., veteran ot World War 
I was also elected. 

Legionnaire Pi'ank Coyle gave an 
interesting address on the work­
ings of the Veterans Employment 
Service ot U.S.E.S. 

Members ot tlie Post will call on 
Chaplain Ernest Albertine wlio is 
confined to his home with illness. 

OLD AGE ENUMERATION 

As of October 1, 1944 the Old 
Age Assistance enumeration total 
was 5618, an Increase ot IBD over 
the previous year. 

Bills for $3.00 tax are in tlie mails 
and are due and payable February 
1st. 

QUIZ PROGRAM SCHEDULED 

The regular monthly meeting of 
the Women's Republican Club will 
be held on Monday afternoon at 
the home of Mrs. Irving Harrison 
East Main Street. A quiz program 
will be conducted by Mrs. Ruel 
Llndberg and the members of her 
program committee. 

A covered dish supper will be 
served this evening at the annual 
meeting of the First Congrega­
tional Church. 

Dramatic Club 
Names Officers 

The Branford GrangiS' Dramatic 
Club met recenlty at the home ot 
Mrs. Mary Ralola of Chestnut 
Street and elected the following of­
ficers: president, Mrs. Mary Raiola 
vice president, Mrs. Eve Lowe; 
secretary-treasurer. Miss, Ruth An­
derson; assistant secretary, Mrs 
Althea Delon; director, Mrs. Mar­
lon Berger; entertainment commit­
tee, Mrs. Elizabeth D'Arcy, Mrs. 
Abbie Close, Mrs. Wlnilred Cooke. 

The next meeting will be held on 
Tuesday, January 23 at the home 
of Mrs. Elizabeth D'Arcy ot East 
Main Street. 

HEARING LAST EVENING 

The Pine Orchard Zoning Ap 
peal Board held a puljiic hear­
ing in the fire house last evening 
to consider the application of 
Charles A. Van PattSn to erect an 
accessory building on Linden Ave. 

COURT OP HONOR 

A Court of Honor and scouting 
demonstration' will be conducted 
in the Community House, January 
24 by the Branford Disrtict Coun 
cil ot Boy Scouts. 

Monday evening, Georgia Chap 
ter No. 58 will entertain the Visit­
ing Worthy Matrons and Worthy 
Patrons of surrounding chapters 
at 8 o'clock in Masonic Hall. The 
initiatory, work will be exempli 
fied by the visiting matrons and 
patrons. After the meeting there 
will be a Post Office Auction and 
refreshments will be served. 

GALLON CLUB MEMBERS 

Mrs. Harriet Johnston, Signe A. 
Bloomqulst and W. D. Plnkham 
have given blood to the Red Cross 
for the eighth time, thus becom­
ing members ot the famous Gallon 
Club. 

Lewis Hamilton of The Hamilton 
Shops is registered at Hotel Southl 
moor, Chicago while attending the 
midwinter^ American Furniture 
Marts. . 

Mrs. James J. Walworth reported 
in her report as chairman ot the 
Branford Branch ot the Red Cross 
at Its annual meeting January 8 in 
library hall.' 

The reports given ot all depart­
ments were on the vih'o]e very cred­
itable and showed no slackening 
of Interest on the part of workers. 

The assembly accepted reports 
as follows: 

Production lias been satisfactory 
in spite ot the handicap in s h o r t - , 
ages, both in gauze and yarn. 735 • 
knitted articles were made by 103 
knitters which represents a • total 
of 14,331 hours. This was an in- • 
crease of 51 articles. Included in 
the total figures are 10 afghans do­
nated by individuals. A total of 
109,062 surgical dressings were 
made, requiring 6,664 hours. These 
figures are considerably lower than 
the figure for 1943. A 23% drop in 
production and 26% in hours. 
There were approxirnately 150 
workers. 

3807 garments and other articles 
were made by nine Sewing Units. 
The largest number of workers at 
any time was 98. In the total fig­
ure is included 239 Navy Kit Bags, 
100 Navy Housewives and for the 
Army 925 Army Kit Bags and 875 
Housewives. These figures -repre­
sent a total of 8418 hours,ot work. 

Disaster Group Alerted 
Possibly the best test of the 

Disaster Committee's ability to 
function, came on March 2, 1944 
when a major fire threatened to 
destroy the business center of 
Branford. Ail the sub-committee 
ciialrmen were alerted, the Can­
teen Corps served coffee and dough 
nuts, Mrs. Constance Myers in a 
short time had her Information 
and Registration committee roafly 
to serve it necessary, the chairman 
ot Shelter was on the scene, but 
fortunately Ihe services of his 
committee were not needed. The 
Motor Corps members on duty at 
the Military Hospital and Air Base 
were in constant touch with the 
situation, but were not needed. One 
minor casualty was treated on the 
scene. 

The hurricane which visited this 
area did do. little damage that few 
of the disaster personnel wont into 
action, although all sub-chairmen 
were alerted. The Emergency hos­
pital at the Blackstone Library 
was made jready andth e Chairman 
Mr. Eugene Rodney maintained an 
all night post at the Police Head­
quarters. The following day mem­
bers of the Survey Committee, 
made a complete survey of the 
entire town to ascertain the 
amount of property damage. 

It would seem that the disaster 
committee can give an adequate 
account of itself when the situa­
tion demands It. . 

350 Service Cases Handled 
During the year ot 1944 the Home 

Service Committee handled 350 
cases involving 210 different fami­
lies. 

Tile services wliich this division 
of Red Cross renders have been re­
classified recently by National 
Headquarters into the following 
five functions: 

Communications—assisting with 
communications between service­
men and their families through 
both National and International 
Red Cross channels. 

Information—supplying informa­
tion about government regulations 
and legislation, and community re­
sources and assistance to service­
men, exservicemen and civilians. 

Benefits and Claims— helping 
servicemen and their faniilies with 
allowances and allotments and 
veterans and their families with 
claims for government benefits. 

Reporting— supplying informa­
tion about home conditions to mil­
itary and naval authorities to help 
them make decisions concerning 
servicemen in matters ot furloughs 
discharges and clemency. 
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STRICTLY LOCAL 
PREVUES. VIEWS AND REVIEWS 

BY PAUL 11. STEVENS 

A SEPARATE EAST HAVEN PROBATE COURT 

Enst ITiiven is a piirt of llie Grenter New Iliivcn Area and whil 
wo, lis a community, lake pride in our own i'ivi«, social and business 
interesis, as well we .slinuld, snpportinj,' tlK'ni at all tinios to the best 
oi' our aiiililics, tliere arc certain enterprises and activitie.s, wliieh in 
our opinion, can liost be. liiuKlled eodiieratively with llic, other niuni-
oipalilics Unit make >ip our iiirger Orentcr New lliiven Coninumit.v. 

Beeausc we shnre in the service ulTtVorded liy the Imspilnls, wel­
fare organizations and eleomnsinary institutions u( Greater New 
Haven, wc find it n£ mntuai iidviintat'e to pool our funds witli the 
New iiavcn Community CHiesl. 

Wlien the lime eonies Tor tlio instiiilaliini ol! a modern sewage 
disposal system, we will undouhtodly Tind R adviintugeous lo lie-in 
with the Greater New Haven plans. 

No one, would think (if setting of separate wiUer, Iransportntion, 
ligliting or oilier utilities lie're when,our needs can he best served as 
n part ol: a larger area. Time was when we had our independent Tele­
phone system in East Haven hut our townspeople welcomed the mer­
ger with tlie Soulliern New England. 

The eenlralization of our Postal System, wlioreliy East Uuveii 
and other communities in and iiround New Haven are brnnelies oi! 
the,New Haven Postal Dislrict is anotiier ease in point,^wliieli lias 
combined better service willi efficiency of onernlioii. Few would 
care,to return to the old methods. 

Now there is talk in some quarters of asking Legi.slativo sanc­
tion lo a proposal to separate East Haven from the New Haven Pro­
bate IDistriet. Tlic Now Haven Probate Hislriet embraces the eily of 
New Haven and tlie towns of Hamdeii, Orange, Wondhridge, Norlli 
Haven and Bast Haven, and the present Probate Court, centrally lo­
cated in- the New Haven City Hall, well-stalTed and provided witli 
vaults, hearing rooms, and chaiuber.s, is far better able lo lake eare 
of our needs, we 'venture to say, than could a small, provineiid Pro-
bale Court within the confines ol; our own town. 

Tlie trend today is toward district court syslcnis, as for instance, 
our Stale Juvenile Conrt set-up, which luis demonslraled the wisdom 
of such a plan. Tliere may he good reasons why East Haven should 
bo .separated from the New Haven l^robalo Bislriet. AVe would lik(! 
to hoar what they are before we alter our opinion. 

Ted Grandshaw Bfick In 
France - Lt Fasigl Home 

News Prom Our East Haven Servicemen lii All Parts 
. O f The World. I 

BY WILLIAM E. FAOERSTROM' 

PVT. TED GRANDSHAW '42 Is Today we received a note from 

SCHOOL PROBLEMS PROM THE LOCAL ANGLE 

Every pareni liaving eliildren in our East Haven seliools will be 

In Franco at the present time on 
his way back to rejoin Ills outfit in 
Germany. TED received wounds In 
his chest and left side from shrap­
nel from enemy fire while acting 
as a foi-ward observer with an ar­
mored infantry unit. TED lias re­
ceived tile Purple Heart and was 
also awarded the Bronze Star for 
rescuing several soldiers on D-Day 
when their landing boat struck a 
mine and sank. • 

We had a nice chat witli" LT. 
HENRY FASIG '40 yesterday. 
HENRY has had much exporience 
as a pilot ot a B-24 Bomber and in 
his fitty missions over Europe has 
distinguished himself as, an able 
aviator. Yes—he is glad to be back 
here with his family and looks for­
ward to a liappy time during his 
twenty-two days furlough. 

SGT. NORMAN LEAVSTROM '39 
received his basic training at 
Cochran Field, Ga. His next stop 
was Mississippi where he studied to 
learn more about airplanes in an 
airplane mechanical school. Next 
he went lo factories to study planes-
and see their actual work and 
when he had passed all tests ho 
went to Tennessee and has become 
a flight engineer. He Is stationed 
tliere now, probably for several 
months. NORM has just been liome 
on a furlough. He is married to 
former Miss Esther Anderson ot 
Morris Cove and. has a three 
months' old daughter. 

We had an interesting letter 

CPL. DON MELVIN '43. DON says: 
1 am nô v somewhere In the Plill-

ipplne Islands. I was In the Nether­
lands East Indies for some time 
I've boon overseas twenty mrntlis 
and I'm ready to come home any­
time they want to send mo. I know 
one thing—I'll never leave East 
Haven once I get back tliere—be 
lleve me." 

RAY O'CONNOR '43 writes to 
say that be was very happy lo re 
cclve the Servicemen's Bulletin. 
RAY tells us that he read it a cou 
pie of times and enjoyed reading 
It each time. Ho is now in Fort 
Lewis, Washington awaiting to be 
assigned. At the present time RAY 
is working in the Company OlTloo 
doing some correspondence and 
helping the Con'ipany Clerk. 

HARRY STRICKLAND '41 look 
his boot training at Newport, R,I. 
From there he went to Jacksoiiviilo 
Fia. where he stayed about eight 
months. Next HARRY went to a 
gunnery school at Lake City, Fla. 
His next stop was at a camp in 
Beaufort, S.C. At this time HARRY 
came liome on leave and after re­
porting back to Norfolk, Va., he 
left for somewhere in South Amer 
lea where he Is-now. HARRY re­
ceived training in radar and is now 
Ihstalilng radios in planes. He re­
ceived radio training in sending 
and receiving "In Jacksonville in the 
N.A.T.T. Course. His marks at New­
port were very higli in the classifi-

Harrisons Get 
Word From Son 
In Prison Camp 

Mr. and Mrs. Leland Harrison 
of Main street received a postal 
card on Monday through the In­
ternational Red Cross from their 
sou Carletoii wlio was lost In a 
mission over Germany In Septem­
ber, and is now In a Prisoner ot 
War Camp. 

He writes: "Dear Mom and Dnd: 
I am in good health and tooling 
fine. Hope you have heard about 
me botore this. You have no reason 
for worry. Believe me. Contact Rod 
Cross to send mall or Parcel Post, 
Will write when possible. Load.'S of 
Love. Carlcton." 

Fersoiialtiies 

TOWN TOPICS 

FROM OUR REPORTERS' NOTEBOOKS 

..Wolta weekl 

Old Jupiter Piuvlus busy, 
Snom and.ice and sled, Then 

more snow and ice a7id sleet. 

Wo shovelled the sidewalks at 
nights and found them filled In 
again next morning. 

Chccr-npl Supt. John ,Mnrpliij at 
the Post Office tells ns seed caia-
toguBs are beginning to arrive and 
that the zinnias, asters and morn­
ing glories, tlie tomatoes, mtabagO' 
and leek are bigger and brighter 
than ever on the colored covers. 

attended Linden Hall, Junior Col­
lege, Lltltz, Penn. A,S. Hunter at­
tended Ohio University and is now 
studying at Yale under the Navy 
V12 program. 

An Enjoyable Visit With "Grand­
ma". Little Who Began Paint­
ing; In Oils At Age Of 75. 

Nobody minds visiting "Grand­
ma';. Little In the C. L. Weaver 
home on Bradley avenue. It isn't a 
chore. It's a privilege beoauso you 
like the pleasure of her company. 
She doesn't overwhelm you wll:ii an 
"organ recital" of her difficulties 
as a patient who has boon confined 
to her bed tor two years. No sir. 
Not on your life will she trouble 
you with the "Little" troubles. But 
from her first loading • question 
about "how are others?" to her last 
farewell, you wonder how she keeps 
so patient and so cheerful. You 
really forget that she is a shut-in 
because her conversation is so dc-
lighttul 

And valentinos, we note, are on 
display in our variety stores, so 
spring cannot be far-away now, 

GroHiid-/ioo day tmo weeks Irom 
ioinorro-to. Farmers np Farm Itlver 
tvay still reckon that day as mid­
way of winter, and point to old 
rhyme, "Ground-hog Day, Half 
your wood and half your hay." 

Stormy nights picked by both Old 
Stone and Christ church people for 
their annual supper-m'oetlngs. 

from CPL. ALLEN JOHNSON '40 cation test—HARRY was one of 
from Egypt. ALLEN says: "Tlie old the eighteen - highest in a battal-

witli the New Year and will, we iiope, continue for soinotinic as wo 
Icnow tluil our readers will value them. As we liavo pointed out on 
other occasions, it is our intention to make THIi! NEWS of -as Avide 
local appeal as possible. AVe feel that information of tlie kind Snpl. 
Gillis is so well able lo present, means iiiueh more lb the fathers and 
mothers of our children here in East Haven than any niiiouiit of 
"syndicated" malorial such as is to be liad in tlic daily press. Siijit. 
Giiiis Icuows our coniinunity, lie knows the children in our seliools, 
and he knows Hie parents. He can lliercfore deal with scliool pro­
blems from the local angle, the angle from which ."11 of.lis view tlie 
educational system. . . . 

Because we believe everv parent should road this series ni arti­
cles bv Supt. Gillis, we suggest that you tell your neighbors about 
them "and that ymi,mention them at Parciil-Teacher meetings. If 
there are any' questions yon would like lo have answered or if there 
are speeific "scliool problems you would like discussed, we are sure 
that, Supt. Qiilis will be glad to hear from yon. -

MEMORIAL TO COL. LOCKHART 

Members of Harry R. Barlielt po.s't, American Legion^ are lo be 
eoninicndcd for their action at a post meeting Thur.sdayinight in set-
ling up a fund making possiiile an animal Oratorieal Contest among 
the students in the East Haven Higli school as a nieiuorial lo Colonel 
Charles E. Loekliart whpse death oeeurred reeciilly. Col. Loekliart 
lieaded the slule oominillee wliich had charge of oratorieal contests 
sponsored by Legion posts in many schools of the state and this activ­
ity had been close lo liis heart for .several year.s. As an educator in 
the New Haven schools Col. Ijochharl loved eliildren and was never 
diappier than when enconrasing lliein. As a militiiry man and war 
veteran lie instilled in their developing iiiinds an ardent .spirit of pa­
triotism and good citizenship. Tlie oratorieal contests will continue 
to do thi.s. It is such a memorial as Col. Loekliart would have wanted. 

A FRIENDLY, WELCOME VISITOR TO YOUR HOME 

If you had talicn the troulile, as we did, lo count the names 
mentioned in last week's issue of THE NEWS yoii would have dis 
covered a total of 239 of them in the iirst tliree and a Iialf pages, 
which was llie space aUotted lo East Haven in our arrangnmeiil of 
publiealioii in combination with the 15vanl'ord Keview. That is wlial 
lielps lo make a home town paper interesting. We are all interested 
in knowing what other folk are doing, espeoiully those wlio are our 
friends and neighbors. AVe -want more names in our columns, items 
about what you and your family and friends are doing. If your boy 
or girl is home ou a furlougli let us hear lihout it. if you are enler-
ta 
ab 
liave a suggest! 
we will be deliglitcd to liave you say so. Together we can make THE 
NEWS a friendl.v,'welcome visitor to your home each week.. 

r girl is home ou a lurlougli let us near aooui ii.. Jt you arc eniei-
lining gue.sts from out of town it is a courtesy to tliem lo let iis loll 
bout it. H' you" have an interesting idea for a "write-up", or if you 
ave a suggestion concerning a "Personalty" whom we can feature. 

MRS. HUSTED DIES 
AFTER LONG ILLNESS 

The death ot Mrs. Charles Has­
ted of 135 George street, occurred 
at her home Saturday evening tol­
lowlng a long illness. Mrs. Husted 
Is survived by her husband; three 
daughters, Mrs. Anne Rossi of East 
Haven, Mrs. Grace Robinson and 
Mrs. Blanche Gederman of Provi­
dence, R. I.; three sons, Frederick, 
John and Charles, the two former 
sons are In the armed forces; and 
six grandchildren. 

Mrs. Husted and her family have 

been residents of East Haven for 
the past 18 years. Fdneral services 
were held Wednesday morning 
from the W. S. Clancy & Sons fun­
eral parlors in Kirkham Avenue, 
and Requiem High Mass at 9 A.M 
in St. Vincent do Paul's Church in 
Taylor avenue. 

FUNERAL SERVICES 
FOR MRS. REDMAN 

The funeral services for the late 

memories your letter brought back 
about.; the 1038,,.llasketball. team 
sure souri'deB good'to nie-^IMMy 
GLYNN '38 and BILL THOMSON 
'38 and all the rest. I, tor one, got 
quite a bang out of watching them 
play ball. As tor their present ad­
dresses—I plan to drop each one of 
them a line ot two—and I certain­
ly hope that they answer. This af­
ternoon I bought a new polo pony 
and now my string amounts to two. 
I'm getting there but I think that 
will be tile last one Til buy." 

RICHARD POWELL '43 look his 
boot training at Newport, R.I 
From hero he was sent lo Brook­
lyn Navy Yard and then DICK 
wont to Bath, Me., where he was 
on shore patrol. DICK went to 
Bermuda—then back to the slates. 
He has seen much service overseas 
and was on furlough during Christ 
mas. DICK is now in San Francis 
CO waiting to go out again. 

BOB CONFREY '45 took his boot 
training at Newport, R.I. After this 
he went to Little Creelt, Va., for 
gunnery training. BOB was trans­
ferred to the S.S. Thomas Nelson 
and remained with his ship tor 
eight months. After a sixteen day 
leave BOB was assigned to the S.S. 
Noah Webster. At the present time 
he has been transferred to the Sea 
Bees and Is located at Camp Endl-
cott, R.I. BOB now expects to go 
to Alaska. 

BOB SAVAGEAN writes from 
England that he would like to con­
tinue his education even though he 
is in the Navy as he wishes to 
earn enough credits to receive a 
high school diploma. BOB says: "I 
am interseted in taking up a cor­
respondence course and any infor­
mation you can supply will be ap­
preciated very much. Being in the 
Navy has slopped my education 
and I really want a high school 
diploma." We ' h a v e replied to 
BOB'S letter and we will certainly 
do everything we possibly can to 

~ help him earn that high school di­
ploma 

Thomas Mt Friscoe, Jr., v)ho was 
selected for training in the Army 
program at Connecticut University, 
has been enjoying a f<urlough^v)ith 
his parents here, / 

• ! • ' 

Reorganization ot the adult fiholr / 
ot the Old Stono church Is a pro­
ject ot the new yAar and all Inter- / ' 
osted are Invited to the first choir / 
rehearsal Friday at 7:30 in the / 
churchi At tlie recent meeting of / 
the newly elected Mi'slc Committee / ' 
Stanley Shamp .was elected chair- /;> 
man and Mrs. William Hasse, sec-' ;̂ :i_ 
rotary. /Jy.5' -

, « • ' 

Chief Hugh J. Farrell of the Pq'-l'' ^ 
lice Devartmenl has issued a marjij, 
ing to motorists to discontinue the'i 
practice of allowing children wWi 
sletls to hitch rides .,behind aito-l' 
mobiles on the public highways. 

Appreciate the kind words from 
J. D. Houston as to content of 
EAST HAVEN NEWS. Also all oth­
ers who have given encouragement 
and advice. 

\, 

I Arthur Burwell, proprlotdr ol 
Art's Deluxe Cleaneis, in;.Ma|n'! 
street, next to the Town Ilttll, an-V' 
nounces, that his ostabllblimmt !«'; 
temporarily closed. Annouttcement; 
will be made shoitly ot lOBumptlonj 
ot business. , ,• ,i 

Afrs. Chester KiUght Itf i<ra»i)d;.l 
street spent a few daSi'jtht posi 
week with her sister ih fjn^ertqni^ 

Monday afternoon in the funeral 
parlors of Norman V. Lamb. Rev. 
WiUlam G. West - officiated and in­
terment was in Green Lawn Ceme­
tery. Mrs. Redman who died Friday 
in her 61st year had resided until 
recently in East Haven and leaves 
a large circle of friends. Besides 
her husband, she IS survived by 
two sons, Harold S. Fowler and 
Raymond W. Fowler, and three 
daughters, Mrs. Gladys Leddy, Mrs. 

Mrs. Emma L. Redman wife of .Vera M. Cornelius, all of New Ha 
George Redman of 699 QlunnlpiaC|Ven, and Mrs. Sylvia N. Skinner of 
avenue, Fair Haven, were held here West Haven. 

lion of 1200. ;d 
.r-'QUS'-,GMjEitai<!KEt,'i»40..tod|tilllS 
basic training' In a camp In peo-
gla. GUS has seen service in Guad­
alcanal and at the present time we 
understand tliat ho is on his way 
home. GUS will go into training at 
the Ofllcers' Candidate School 
upon his arrival here. 

SGT. HERBERT GLENEWINKEL 
'42 took his basic training at Port 
Deveiis and then was sent to Duke 
Unlvei'slly, He remained there for 
two weeks and tiion was transfer­
red to Wake Forrest College. He e-
malned hero tor throe month^ and 
then returned lo Duke Uhlvorslty 
where ho attended the Army Fi­
nance School. HERB loft Duke 
University tor Fort Harrison, Ind., 
and from this point was sent over­
seas to New Guinea and is now 
there in the Ai'my Finance Ser­
vice. 

Miss Mattiiews has just received 
a letter from SGT. BOB JUNIVER 
'43. He tells her that he has just 
received his third Dak Leaf Cluster 
for his air medal. BOB then goes 
on to say: "Oil yes—will you please 
inform Mr. Fagerstrom of my ad­
dress as that paper ho send.s out 
has been going to California and 
then to all the former posts I've 
been on. It's an interesting paper 
ad I enjoy it a lot." BOB goes on 
to say that he will write more of­
ten and that he likes to get mall 
from the old home town. 

S. SGT. CURTIS PALMER'S '42 
dad called at the school the other 
day to donate one dollar towards 
the payment of stamps tor the ser­
vicemen's Bulletin. We certainly 
thank you, Mr. Palmer, tor your In­
terest/—we appreciate It. 

ROBERT BACON SF 2-c '30 took 
his boot training at Newport, R.I., 
from Newport he travelled to 
Groat Lakes, Michigan where ho 
was in Henry Ford's Plant tor ex 
perlence. BOB left this point for 
Recolfe, Brazil. He was there tor 
eighteen months and then re 
turned to New York. His ship was 
one of the lend lease ships sent to 
Ruiisia. BOB was a member of the 
crew on this ship and travelled to 
Murmansk, Russia. He remained in 
Russia tor three months teaching 
the Russians how to man the ship 
BOB Is now stationed at the Phila­
delphia Navy Yard, whree re is 
awaiting the new stoamsiilp "Ok­
lahoma City." 

FELIX PRO'IT), 45 took his bott 
training at Sampson, N.Y. He has 
been a.^lgned to the Seabees and 
has been doing stevedore work at 
Camp Endlcptt, R.I. FELIX is now 
home on a nine day furlough. 

March ot Dimes going forward 
with generous participation by 
public. Mrs. Robert H. Qerrlsli and 
her capable committee performing I-R./-
excellent job. Gifts - to Intantlloj Rnnchettl sunner enior'OL-

Mrs. Isabella Little was born IniParalysls cause-Is money well spent „(,gdav nlgM fallowliyfe tcgulnr 

^ l l i " ' ^ " ' ' , '?hfl '"w„ ^Tn^nX vi*» The Even-lieady.aromp ,uiU mecHmeeWnVot.H^^SJa'OpXu. Degree 
1861. Her lather. Josenh Hood, was Tuesday in .ihe:^>ciHBh^h6usc' at\ot .Pocghontak'fn Red/Men's Hall. 

m-

186L Her father, Joseph Hood, was 
iv dedleu,ln,flnp art In Sloan street, 
just'-DJtrHyde-palrit+ln-Lbndinr.Her 
mother was Elizabeth Walker Hood. 
A.S d child Mrs. Little painted In 
water colors particularly loving to 
bring to life on the canvas, moun­
tain scenes In North Wales where 
her father had a summer home. 
About eight years ago residents of 
East Haven had tlie opportunity to 
SCO an exhibition of about twenty 
of her oil paintings In the Haga-
man Memorial Library. One re­
markable thing about this worl^ 
was that it was all done after Mrs. 
Little had pas.sed beyond the bib­
lical .span of three score years and 
ten. She was 75 at the time the 
work was begun. Yes that's the age 
when most of us have retired or 
have boon retired. 

Mrs. Little recalls seeing Queen 
Victoria and other members of the 
royal family when she lived in 
London. Vivid in her memory too is 
the experience of hearing tho fam­
ous Adellna Pattl sing there and ot 
hearing the American evorigellsts, 
Moody and Sankey who were popu­
lar In Britain of that time. She al­
so remembers as a child collecting 
money In school tor the relief ot 
victims In the great Chicago flro. 

When she was 20, Mrs. Little 
came to America and settjled In 
Wlliimantlc. Four years later she 
married Charles Erwln Little, a 
former teacher and a shoe mer­
chant, who shared her Ideals ot 
life. Stress was placed on their 
family lite, on the value ot books 
and of education and in taking 
part in the lite ot the community. 
Three children today bless her for 
this early training In their home, 
Mrs. H. W. Rankin of Wethors-
fleld, Mrs. C. L. Weaver ot East 
Haven, both of whom have had 
useful teaching careers, and Mal­
colm G. Little of the TVA in Paris, 
Tenn. It Is clear that Mrs. Little 
takes great pride also in a grand 
daughter, Mrs. Edward G. James of 
Cromwell and two great grandchli 
dren, Richard James of Cromwell 
and Greta Little of A.sheville, N.C. 

Not to be forgotten are the pic­
tures of four nephews on her la 
ble dressed In the uniforms of the 
U. S. Army. Mrs. Little's daily pray­
ers are for Cap. Douglas W. Ran­
kin, a maintenance engineer with 
the Air Force In Puerto Rico; Capt, 
James W. Rankin ot the IflOth In­
fantry in the South Pacific; First 
Lieut. Malcolm 0. Little Jr., with 
the engineering corps in Italy and 
First Lieut. Albert P. Little, a co­
pilot on a B-29 who expects to see 
overseas service soon. 

Since she has been ill, Mrs, Little 
is no longer able to do her re-

Bordcn and Mrs, Earl.Clark.': y^,^^^ nlgUM Harr^ R.->Bartlett 
A feature at the annual mooting Pos^roonw in'Thon^pson avenue. 

of the Stono church Friday night 
(story elsewliore) was the presen­
tation of a program on the Re­
turning Service Man Records made 
by N.B.C. of the Congregational 
Committeo on War Victims and 
War Services. The records were 
played by Harris Anstey and In­
cluded "Tho Opportunity and Re­
sponsibility ot the Church with 
Returning Veterans," "Home Isn't 
Home Any More" and "Seven Years 
In Two." 

Progressive pinochle headlinor 
tonight in Christ Cliuroh Hall. 
L[irge attendance ekpeced. Frede­
rick C. Dahl lieads committeo. 

Mr. Werner Benglcr is convales-
ing at his home in Saltonstall 
Parkway following an operation. 

Mr. and Mrs. C. Leslie Burgess ot 
Bartlett road announce the en­
gagement of their daughter, Lillian 
to A.S. Jack R. Hunter, USNR, son 
of Mr. and Mrs. George Hunter of 
Wiikinsburg, Penn. Mlss Burgess 

markable paintings. But her artis 
tic touch lives In the beautiful 
hand work which she does. Deeply 
religious by nature, patient and 
optimistic, "Grandma" Little Is a 
true Inspiration to ail who know 
her. "I brought my religious faith 
from across the sea"; she says, 
"and it has stayed by me through 
many difflcuitios in lite." She is a 
devoted member of the Old Stono 
church whoso fortunes she follows 
eagerly. And so our tribute to 
"Grandma Little" a personality 
who is a personality I 

Ladies are selling tickets for a nice 
cooker now on display in window of 
Holcombe Drug Co, 

Wc'have been following with 
keen interest the growth and de­
velopment of "Flash", the Dalma­
tian mascot at Fire Headquarters, 
and were pleased to team this 
week that she has achieved a 
weight of 34 pounds. "Flash" is 
getting to be quite a dog. 

ADDITIONAL TOWN TOPICS 
ON PAGE 2 

REMEMBER WHEN? 

JAN. 12 to JAN. 19, 1020 
The Union Missionary Society 

met with Mrs. E. E. Cowles and 
Mrs. H. H. Bradley had charge of 
the program. 

A baked lamb supper was served 
by the new Parish Air Society of 
Christ Episcopal church. 

Little Donald Bacon was HI with 
the Measles. '̂ 

Harold Clark was visiting his 
grandparents at the congregation­
al par.sonage In High street. 

Mrs. H. J. Farrell was serving as 
substitute teacher in Union school 
in the absence ot Miss Blue. -

SNFANTELE PARALYSIS 
1945 KEEP 

AMERICA 
STRONG 

JOIN THE MARCH OF DIMES 
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